Status: This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

Budget (Scotland) Act 2003

2003 asp 6

PART 3

MISCELLANEOUS AND SUPPLEMENTARY
Budget revisions

Amendment of this Act

(1) The Scottish Ministers may by order made by statutory instrument amend—
(a) the amounts specified in sections 3 and 5(1),
(b) schedules 1 to 5.

(2) No order may be made under subsection (1) unless a draft of it has been laid before,
and approved by resolution of, the Scottish Parliament.

Amendment of Budget (Scotland) Act 2001

The Budget (Scotland) Act 2001 (asp 4) is amended as follows—
(a) insection 3(a), for “£17,677,909,000” there is substituted “£17,705,112,000”;
(b) in schedule 1, in the fourth entry—
(i) in column 1, after “Scotland” there is inserted “for the Student Loans
Scheme and related costs”;
(i) in column 2, for “£2,149,014,000” there is substituted
“£2,398,612,000; and
(iii) in column 4, for “£56,340,000” there is substituted “£76,340,000”.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2001/4

