
Antisocial Behaviour etc. (Scotland) Act 2004 asp 8
SCHEDULE 2 – Penalties for certain environmental offences
Document Generated: 2024-05-11

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

SCHEDULE 2
PENALTIES FOR CERTAIN ENVIRONMENTAL OFFENCES

PART 1

ACTS

The Environmental Protection Act 1990 (c. 43)
4 (1) The 1990 Act shall be amended as follows.

(2) In section 23(2) (offences under Part 1), in paragraph (a), for “£20,000” substitute
“£40,000”.

(3) In section 33 (prohibition on disposal of waste), in—
(a) subsection (8), in paragraph (a); and
(b) subsection (9), in paragraph (a),

for “£20,000” substitute “£40,000”.

(4) In section 80(6) (contravention of an abatement notice), for “£20,000” substitute
“£40,000”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/43

