Antisocial Behaviour etc. (Scotland) Act 2004 asp 8 1
SCHEDULE 2 — Penalties for certain environmental offences
Document Generated: 2024-04-28

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

SCHEDULE 2
PENALTIES FOR CERTAIN ENVIRONMENTAL OFFENCES

PART 2
SUBORDINATE LEGISLATION

The Pollution Prevention and Control (Scotland) Regulations 2000 (S.S.1. 2000/323)

7 In paragraph (2)(a) of regulation 30 of the Pollution Prevention and Control
(Scotland) Regulations 2000 (offences), for “£20,000” substitute “£40,000”.

The Land(fill (Scotland) Regulations 2003 (S.S.1. 2003/235)

8 In paragraph (2)(a) of regulation 19 of the Landfill (Scotland) Regulations 2003
(offences), for “£20,000” substitute “£40,000”.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2000/323
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2003/235

