Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

1998 No. 139
REGISTERED HOMES

The Residential Care Homes (Amendment)
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1998

Made - - - - 3rd April 1998
Coming into operation Ist May 1998

The Department of Health and Social Services, in exercise of the powers conferred on it by Articles
6(3), 6(8) and 36(2) of the Registered Homes (Northern Ireland) Order 1992(1) and of all other
powers enabling it in that behalf, hereby makes the following regulations:

Citation, commencement and interpretation

1.—(1) These regulations may be cited as the Residential Care Homes (Amendment) Regulations
(Northern Ireland) 1998 and shall come into operation on 1st May 1998.

(2) In these regulations, “the principal regulations” means the Residential Care Homes
Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1993(2).

Amendment of Schedule 1 to the principal regulations
2. In Schedule 1 (Registration fees) to the principal regulations—
(a) in paragraph 1(a) and paragraph 2 for “£230” there shall be substituted “£261”’; and
(b) in paragraph 1(b) for “£840” there shall be substituted “£952”.

Amendment of Schedule 3 to the principal regulations
3. In Schedule 3 (Annual fees) to the principal regulations—
(a) in paragraph 1 for “£41” there shall be substituted “£46”; and
(b) in paragraph 2 for “£30” there shall be substituted “£34”.

(1) S.1.1992/3204 (N.I. 20)
(2) S.R.1993 No. 91


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1992/3204
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1993/91

Document Generated: 2022-09-01
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Health and Social Services on

L.S.
D. A. Baker
3rd April 1998. Assistant Secretary



Document Generated: 2022-09-01
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the regulations.)

These Regulations amend the Residential Care Homes Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1993 which
make provision for the registration of residential care homes under the Registered Homes (Northern
Ireland) Order 1992.

These regulations increase the prescribed fees payable in respect of applications for registration, for
continuation of registration and for related procedures.



