
STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2002 No. 133

SOCIAL SECURITY

Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
(Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2002

Made . . . . . 3rd April 2002

Coming into operation in accordance with regulation 1(1)

Approved by resolution of the Assembly 22nd April 2002

The Department for Employment and Learning(a), in exercise of the powers conferred
by Articles 3(3), 4(3), 11(1) and (4) of the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’ Compensation)
(Northern Ireland) Order 1979(b) and now vested in it(c) and of every other power enabling
it in that behalf, hereby makes the following Regulations:

Citation, commencement and interpretation
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’

Compensation) (Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 2002
and shall come into operation on the day after they are approved by resolution of the
Assembly.

(2) In these Regulations—
(a) “the Order” means the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’ Compensation) (Northern

Ireland) Order 1979;
(b) “the principal Regulations” means the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’

Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1988(d).

Amendment of the principal Regulations
2.—(1) The principal Regulations shall be amended in accordance with paragraphs (2)

to (4) in relation to any case in which a person first satisfies the conditions of entitlement
to a payment under the Order on the day after they are approved by resolution of the
Assembly.

(2) For the Schedule to the principal Regulations there shall be substituted the Schedule
set out in the Schedule to these Regulations.

(3) In regulations 5(2) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma) and
7 (minimum amount payable to dependant), for “£1,992” in each place where it occurs
there shall be substituted “£2,068”.

(4) In regulation 6(1) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by
tuberculosis), for “£4,121” (in each place where it occurs) there shall be substituted
“£4,278”.

Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department for Employment and Learning on 3rd
April 2002.

(L.S.) A. D. Shannon
A senior officer of the Department for

Employment and Learning

(a) Formerly known as the Department of Higher and Further Education, Training and Employment; renamed the
Department for Employment and Learning by the Department for Employment and Learning Act (Northern Ireland)
2001 c. 15

(b) S.I. 1979/925 (N.I. 9); relevant amending legislation is S.I. 1985/1209 (N.I. 16) Article 22, S.I. 1986/1888 (N.I. 18)
Schedule 3, paragraph 17 and 1992 c. 9 Schedule 2, paragraph 22

(c) The Departments (Transfer and Assignment of Functions) Order (Northern Ireland) 1999 (S.R. 1999 No. 481) transferred
functions under the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’ Compensation) (Northern Ireland) Order 1979 to the Department
of Higher and Further Education, Training and Employment, now renamed the Department for Employment and
Learning

(d) S.R. 1988 No. 242 as amended by S.R. 1989 No. 240, S.R. 1991 No. 120, S.R. 1992 No. 213, S.R. 1993 No. 325, S.R.
1995 No. 338, S.R. 1996 No. 485, S.R. 1997 No. 409, S.R. 1998 No. 358 and S.R. 2000 No. 134



SCHEDULE Regulation 2(2)

“SCHEDULE Regulations 3, 4 and 6

TABLE 1

(1) Table 1 is for the determination of payments to disabled persons under regulation 3 (or
regulation 6), and for the determination of payments to dependants of deceased sufferers under
regulation 4(1).

(2) The relevant period is the period specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled
person to whom regulation 6 applies (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by
tuberculosis), the first period specified in paragraph 6(1)(b).

(3) The age to be taken for the purpose of determining the amount payable to a disabled
person is his age on the date specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled person to
whom regulation 6 applies (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis),
regulation 6(1). In determining the amount payable to a dependant of a disabled person under
regulation 4(1), the age to be taken for the purpose of calculating the sum to be deducted from
the amount which would have been payable to the disabled person had he still been alive is the
age of the deceased at his last birthday preceding his death.

2



PA
Y

M
E

N
T

S
T

O
D

IS
A

B
L

E
D

PE
R

S
O

N
S

T
O

W
H

O
M

IS
PA

Y
A

B
L

E
D

IS
A

B
L

E
M

E
N

T
B

E
N

E
F

IT
U

N
D

E
R

SE
C

T
IO

N
10

8
O

F
T

H
E

SO
C

IA
L

SE
C

U
R

IT
Y

C
O

N
T

R
IB

U
T

IO
N

S
A

N
D

B
E

N
E

F
IT

S
(N

O
R

T
H

E
R

N
IR

E
L

A
N

D
) 

A
C

T
19

92
O

R
U

N
D

E
R

A
N

Y
C

O
R

R
E

S
P

O
N

D
IN

G
P

R
O

V
IS

IO
N

O
F

T
H

E
F

O
R

M
E

R
IN

D
U

S
T

R
IA

L
IN

JU
R

IE
S

A
C

T
S
,O

R
W

O
U

L
D

B
E

PA
Y

A
B

L
E

B
U

T
F

O
R

T
H

E
D

IS
A

B
L

E
M

E
N

T
A

M
O

U
N

T
IN

G
T

O
L

E
S

S
T

H
A

N
T

H
E

A
P

P
R

O
P

R
IA

T
E

P
E

R
C

E
N

T
A

G
E

P
er

ce
nt

ag
e 

as
se

ss
m

en
t 

fo
r 

th
e 

re
le

va
nt

 p
er

io
d

A
ge

 o
f

10
%

11
%

-2
0%

21
%

-3
0%

31
%

-4
0%

41
%

-5
0%

51
%

-6
0%

61
%

-7
0%

71
%

-8
0%

81
%

-9
0%

91
%

-1
00

%
di

sa
bl

ed
or

 l
es

s
pe

rs
on

£
£

£
£

£
£

£
£

£
£

37
 a

nd
un

de
r

23
,9

43
42

,7
57

50
,1

67
51

,5
92

53
,0

17
54

,1
57

55
,2

98
56

,4
37

57
,5

78
58

,7
18

38
23

,2
58

41
,0

45
48

,6
55

50
,3

97
51

,8
75

53
,0

17
54

,1
57

55
,2

98
56

,4
37

57
,5

78
39

22
,5

73
39

,3
34

47
,1

45
49

,1
97

50
,7

37
51

,8
75

53
,0

17
54

,1
57

55
,2

98
56

,4
37

40
21

,8
91

37
,6

23
45

,6
35

47
,9

99
49

,5
95

50
,7

37
51

,8
75

53
,0

17
54

,1
57

55
,2

98
41

21
,2

06
35

,9
15

44
,1

24
46

,8
01

48
,4

57
49

,5
95

50
,7

37
51

,8
75

53
,0

17
54

,1
57

42
20

,5
19

34
,2

05
42

,6
13

45
,6

08
47

,3
16

48
,4

57
49

,5
95

50
,7

37
51

,8
75

53
,0

17
43

19
,4

97
32

,2
09

41
,1

02
44

,6
94

46
,5

20
47

,8
87

49
,0

26
50

,1
67

51
,3

07
52

,4
48

44
18

,4
70

30
,2

13
39

,5
90

43
,7

82
45

,7
20

47
,3

16
48

,4
57

49
,5

95
50

,7
37

51
,8

75
45

17
,4

46
28

,2
18

38
,0

81
42

,8
69

44
,9

24
46

,7
45

47
,8

87
49

,0
26

50
,1

67
51

,3
07

46
16

,4
18

26
,2

24
36

,5
71

41
,9

58
44

,1
24

46
,1

76
47

,3
16

48
,4

57
49

,5
95

50
,7

37
47

15
,3

94
24

,2
28

35
,0

59
41

,0
45

43
,3

26
45

,6
08

46
,7

45
47

,8
87

49
,0

26
50

,1
67

48
14

,5
08

23
,4

29
33

,8
64

39
,2

21
41

,9
58

44
,0

07
45

,1
51

46
,2

90
47

,4
28

48
,5

71
49

13
,6

25
22

,6
33

32
,6

66
37

,3
97

40
,5

92
42

,4
13

43
,5

53
44

,6
94

45
,8

36
46

,9
76

50
12

,7
41

21
,8

34
31

,4
91

35
,5

73
39

,2
21

40
,8

16
41

,9
58

43
,0

98
44

,2
36

45
,3

77
51

11
,8

59
21

,0
36

30
,2

69
33

,7
48

37
,8

53
39

,2
21

40
,3

73
41

,4
99

42
,6

42
43

,7
82

52
10

,9
74

20
,2

38
29

,0
74

31
,9

24
36

,4
84

37
,6

23
38

,7
67

39
,9

05
41

,0
45

42
,1

84
53

10
,1

46
18

,8
14

27
,2

49
30

,3
28

35
,1

16
36

,4
84

37
,6

23
38

,7
67

39
,9

05
41

,0
45

54
9,

32
0

17
,3

89
25

,4
24

28
,7

34
33

,7
48

35
,3

46
36

,4
84

37
,6

23
38

,7
67

39
,9

05
55

8,
49

4
15

,9
62

23
,6

03
27

,1
35

32
,3

79
34

,2
05

35
,3

46
36

,4
84

37
,6

23
38

,7
67

56
7,

66
7

14
,5

36
21

,7
77

25
,5

40
31

,0
13

33
,0

64
34

,2
05

35
,3

46
36

,4
84

37
,6

23
57

6,
84

1
13

,1
11

19
,9

53
23

,9
43

29
,6

48
31

,9
25

33
,0

64
34

,2
05

35
,3

46
36

,4
84

58
6,

30
0

11
,9

16
17

,8
17

21
,4

90
26

,6
78

28
,7

89
30

,0
14

31
,2

13
32

,3
79

33
,5

21
59

5,
75

7
10

,7
16

15
,6

76
19

,0
41

23
,7

13
25

,6
53

26
,9

64
28

,2
18

29
,4

16
30

,5
54

60
5,

21
8

9,
51

9
13

,5
39

16
,5

88
20

,7
53

22
,5

18
23

,9
13

25
,2

27
26

,4
53

27
,5

93
61

4,
67

4
8,

32
3

11
,4

02
14

,1
37

17
,7

87
19

,3
83

20
,8

63
22

,2
33

23
,4

88
24

,6
27

62
4,

13
3

7,
12

6
9,

26
4

11
,6

86
14

,8
24

16
,2

48
17

,8
17

19
,2

40
20

,5
19

21
,6

62
63

3,
84

7
6,

44
1

8,
32

3
10

,4
49

13
,1

85
14

,5
92

16
,0

77
17

,4
46

18
,6

97
19

,8
38

3



64
3,

56
8

5,
75

7
7,

38
1

9,
20

6
11

,5
44

12
,9

41
14

,3
39

15
,6

49
16

,8
73

18
,0

12
65

3,
27

9
5,

07
3

6,
44

1
7,

97
0

9,
90

6
11

,2
87

12
,5

98
13

,8
54

15
,0

51
16

,1
91

66
2,

99
4

4,
39

2
5,

50
1

6,
72

5
8,

26
8

9,
63

4
10

,8
61

12
,0

56
13

,2
27

14
,3

66
67

2,
70

9
3,

70
5

4,
55

9
5,

48
7

6,
62

8
7,

98
3

9,
12

1
10

,2
62

11
,4

02
12

,5
42

68
2,

63
5

3,
58

9
4,

40
3

5,
25

9
6,

40
1

7,
66

7
8,

76
5

9,
94

8
11

,0
44

12
,1

71
69

2,
56

5
3,

47
7

4,
24

9
5,

03
2

6,
17

3
7,

35
5

8,
41

1
9,

63
4

10
,6

91
11

,7
99

70
2,

49
4

3,
36

4
4,

08
9

4,
80

3
5,

94
4

7,
03

9
8,

05
3

9,
32

0
10

,3
32

11
,4

31
71

2,
42

4
3,

24
8

3,
93

4
4,

57
3

5,
71

4
6,

72
5

7,
69

7
9,

00
9

9,
97

7
11

,0
62

72
2,

35
2

3,
13

7
3,

77
7

4,
34

8
5,

48
7

6,
41

5
7,

33
9

8,
69

4
9,

61
8

10
,6

91
73

2,
29

4
3,

08
1

3,
72

0
4,

26
2

5,
40

1
6,

27
1

7,
19

7
8,

46
7

9,
33

5
10

,3
76

74
2,

23
8

3,
02

1
3,

66
3

4,
17

6
5,

31
8

6,
12

7
7,

05
6

8,
23

9
9,

05
1

10
,0

55
75

2,
18

2
2,

96
6

3,
60

7
4,

08
9

5,
22

9
5,

98
6

6,
91

2
8,

00
9

8,
76

5
9,

74
7

76
2,

12
4

2,
90

5
3,

54
7

4,
00

6
5,

14
4

5,
84

5
6,

77
1

7,
78

3
8,

47
8

9,
43

6
77

 a
nd

2,
06

8
2,

84
9

3,
49

2
3,

91
8

5,
05

9
5,

70
1

6,
62

8
7,

55
7

8,
19

5
9,

12
1

ov
er

4

P
er

ce
nt

ag
e 

as
se

ss
m

en
t 

fo
r 

th
e 

re
le

va
nt

 p
er

io
d

A
ge

 o
f

10
%

11
%

-2
0%

21
%

-3
0%

31
%

-4
0%

41
%

-5
0%

51
%

-6
0%

61
%

-7
0%

71
%

-8
0%

81
%

-9
0%

91
%

-1
00

%
di

sa
bl

ed
or

 l
es

s
pe

rs
on



TABLE 2

(1) Table 2 is for the determination of additional payments under regulation 4(2) to dependants
of deceased sufferers who died as a result of the disease and for the determination of payments to
dependants under regulation 4(6).

(2) The relevant period is the period specified in regulation 3(2) or, in the case of a disabled
person to whom regulation 6 applies (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by
tuberculosis), the first period specified in paragraph 6(1)(b).

PART A

PAYMENTS TO DEPENDANTS TO WHOM DEATH BENEFIT UNDER SECTION 108 OF THE SOCIAL
SECURITY CONTRIBUTIONS AND BENEFITS (NORTHERN IRELAND) ACT 1992 IS PAYABLE, OR TO
DEPENDANTS OF PERSONS TO WHOM DISABLEMENT BENEFIT UNDER THAT SECTION OR UNDER

ANY CORRESPONDING PROVISION OF THE FORMER INDUSTRIAL INJURIES ACTS WAS PAYABLE, OR
TO DEPENDANTS OF A PERSON TO WHOM DISABLEMENT BENEFIT WOULD HAVE BEEN PAYABLE

IMMEDIATELY BEFORE HE DIED BUT FOR THE OCCURRENCE OF ONE OF THE CIRCUMSTANCES
LISTED IN REGULATION 5(1)(a)(iii) OR BUT FOR HIS DISABLEMENT AMOUNTING TO LESS THAN THE
APPROPRIATE PERCENTAGE, IN CIRCUMSTANCES WHERE THE DISABLED PERSON DIED AS A RESULT

OF A DISEASE OTHER THAN DIFFUSE MESOTHELIOMA.

Age of disabled Percentage assessment for the relevant period
person at his
last birthday 10% or less 11%-20% 21%-30% 31%-49% 50% and over
preceding death

£ £ £ £ £

37 and under 11,259 21,951 25,082 25,940 26,652
38 10,917 20,980 24,229 25,082 25,995
39 10,577 20,010 23,374 24,228 25,340
40 10,231 19,041 22,518 23,374 24,684
41 9,890 18,073 21,662 22,518 24,029
42 9,551 17,106 20,807 21,662 23,374
43 8,934 15,849 20,038 20,893 22,748
44 8,323 14,592 19,266 20,124 22,113
45 7,711 13,339 18,499 19,355 21,490
46 7,097 12,083 17,663 18,583 20,863
47 6,484 10,829 16,962 17,817 20,238
48 6,015 10,488 16,392 17,217 19,468
49 5,543 10,146 15,819 16,619 18,697
50 5,073 9,804 15,251 16,018 17,928
51 4,604 9,462 14,680 15,421 17,160
52 4,133 9,121 14,111 14,824 16,392
53 3,918 8,323 13,028 13,995 15,761
54 3,705 7,524 11,943 13,169 15,136
55 3,492 6,725 10,861 12,343 14,508
56 3,279 5,928 9,777 11,518 13,879
57 3,063 5,132 8,694 10,691 13,253
58 2,864 4,559 7,455 9,237 11,518
59 2,662 3,990 6,215 7,783 9,777
60 2,466 3,421 4,973 6,328 8,039
61 2,268 2,849 3,735 4,875 6,300

5



Age of disabled Percentage assessment for the relevant period
person at his
last birthday 10% or less 11%-20% 21%-30% 31%-49% 50% and over
preceding death

£ £ £ £ £

62 2,068 2,282 2,494 3,421 4,559
63 2,068 2,238 2,410 3,148 4,063
64 2,068 2,194 2,322 2,879 3,568
65 2,068 2,154 2,238 2,607 3,063
66 2,068 2,111 2,154 2,338 2,565
67 and over 2,068 2,068 2,068 2,068 2,068

PART B

PAYMENTS TO DEPENDANTS OF PERSONS WHO DIED AS A RESULT OF DIFFUSE MESOTHELIOMA

Age of disabled person at his last Payment
birthday preceding death

£
37 and under 26,652
38 25,995
39 25,340
40 24,684
41 24,029
42 23,374
43 22,748
44 22,113
45 21,490
46 20,863
47 20,238
48 19,468
49 18,697
50 17,928
51 17,160
52 16,392
53 15,761
54 15,136
55 14,508
56 13,879
57 13,253
58 11,518
59 9,777
60 8,039
61 6,300
62 4,559
63 4,063
64 3,568
65 3,063
66 2,565
67 and over 2,068

”

6



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations.)

Under the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’ Compensation) (Northern Ireland) Order
1979 (“the Order”) lump sum payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a
disease to which the Order applies, or to dependants of persons who were so disabled
immediately before they died.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis, etc., (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) Regulations (Northern Ireland) 1988, as amended, so as to increase
the amount payable under the Order. The increase in each case is 3.8 percent, rounded up
or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

The diseases to which the Order applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse
mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung (where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse
pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening.

7

Printed in the UK by The

Stationery Office Limited

under the authority and

superintendence of Carol

Tullo, Controller of

Her Majesty’s Stationery

Office being the Government 

Printer for Northern Ireland and

the Officer appointed to print the

Acts of the Northern Ireland Assembly

Dd. N20522. C2. 5/02. Gp. 130. 14567.

£2·00

Published by The Stationery Office Limited

ISBN 0-337-94272-2

9 780337 942723

ISBN 0-337-94272-2


