Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2005 No. 82

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2005

PART V
STATE PENSION CREDIT

State pension credit

24.—(1) The sums as specified in the State Pension Credit Regulations shall be the sums set
out in the following provisions of this Article and Schedule 16 to this Order; and for this purpose a
reference in this Article to a numbered regulation or Schedule is a reference to the regulation of, or
Schedule to, the State Pension Credit Regulations bearing that number.

(2) Inregulation 6 (amount of the guarantee credit) —
(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£160-95” there shall be substituted “£167-05”;
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£105-45” there shall be substituted “£109-45”;
(c) in paragraph (5)(a) for “£44-15” there shall be substituted “£45-50”;
(d) in paragraph (5)(b) for “£88-30” there shall be substituted “£91-00’; and
(e) in paragraph (8) for “£25-55” there shall be substituted “£25-80.
(3) Inregulation 7 (savings credit) —
(a) inparagraph (1)(a), (b) and (c) “60 per cent.”, “60 per cent.” and “40 per cent.” respectively
remain the same; and

(b) in paragraph (2) for “£79-60” and “£127-25” there shall be substituted “£82-05” and
“£131-20” respectively.

(4) In paragraph 14 of Schedule 2 (housing costs: persons residing with the claimant) —
(a) in sub-paragraph (1) the sums of £47-75 and £7-40 remain the same;
(b) in sub-paragraph (2)(a)(1) for “£97-00” there shall be substituted “£101-007;

(c) in sub-paragraph (2)(b) for “£97-00” and “£144-00” there shall be substituted “£101-00”
and “£150-00” respectively and the sum of £17-00 remains the same;

(d) in sub-paragraph (2)(c) for “£144-00” and “£186-00” there shall be substituted “£150-00”
and “£194-00” respectively and the sum of £23-35 remains the same;

(e) in sub-paragraph (2)(d) for “£186-00” and “£247-00” there shall be substituted “£194-00”
and “£258-00” respectively and the sum of £38-20 remains the same; and

(f) in sub-paragraph (2)(e) for “£247-00” and “£308-00” there shall be substituted “£258-00”
and “£322-00” respectively and the sum of £43-50 remains the same.

(5) In Schedule 3 (special groups) —

(1) Sub-paragraph (2) was amended by regulation 2(9)(b) of S.R. 2003 No. 421


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/421

Document Generated: 2024-04-26
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) in paragraph 1 (polygamous marriages) —
(1) in sub-paragraph (5), which substitutes regulation 6(1), for “£160-95” and “£55-50”
there shall be substituted “£167-05 and “£57-60” respectively, and

(i1) in sub-paragraph (7), which substitutes regulation 7(2), for “£127-25” there shall be
substituted “£131-20”; and

(b) in paragraph 2(2)(a)(2) (further provisions in the case of patients) “20 per cent.” remains
the same.

(6) The sums specified in any provision of the State Pension Credit Regulations set out in column
(1) of Schedule 16 to this Order are the sums set out in column (2) of that Schedule.

(2) Paragraph 2(2)(a) was amended by regulation 7(3)(b)(i) of S.R. 2003 No. 261
2


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/2003/261

