
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2009 No. 201

The Insolvency (Fees) (Amendment)
Order (Northern Ireland) 2009

Fees payable in connection with bankruptcies, individual voluntary arrangements and
winding up

5. In the Table of fees in paragraph 2 of Schedule 2 to the principal Order—
(a) in relation to the fee designated IVA1 in the third column for the amount of “£35” there

is substituted “£15”;
(b) in respect of the fee designated as fee B1 in the second column, for the description of the

fee and the circumstances in which it is charged, there is substituted—

“Bankruptcy – official receiver’s administration fee

For the performance by the official receiver of his general duties as official receiver on the
making of a bankruptcy order, including his duty to investigate and report upon the affairs
of bankrupts, there shall be payable a fee of—”;

(c) in relation to the fee designated B2 in the second column, in the description of the fee, for
“£100,000” there is substituted “£80,000”;

(d) in respect of the fee designated as fee W1 in the second column, for the description of the
fee and the circumstances in which it is charged, there is substituted—

“Winding up by the court – official receiver’s administration fee

For the performance by the official receiver of his general duties as official receiver on
the making of a winding-up order, including his duty to investigate and report upon the
affairs of bodies in liquidation, there shall be payable a fee of—”;

(e) in relation to the fee designated W1 in the third column for the amount of “£1,495” there
is substituted “£1,615”;

(f) in relation to the fee designated W2 in the second column, in the description of the fee,
for “£100,000” there is substituted “£80,000”.


