
 

S T A T U T O R Y  R U L E S  O F  N O R T H E R N  I R E L A N D  

2013 No. 18 

COUNTY COURTS 

The County Courts (Financial Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 
2013 

Made - - - - 31st January 2013 

Coming into operation - 25th February 2013 

The Department of Justice, in exercise of the powers conferred by Article 22(1) of the County 
Courts (Northern Ireland) Order 1980(a), after consultation with the Lord Chief Justice, makes the 
following Order. 

Citation and Commencement 

1. This Order may be cited as the County Courts (Financial Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 
2013 and shall come into operation on 25th February 2013. 

Increase of financial limits of civil jurisdiction of county courts 

2. The County Courts (Northern Ireland) Order 1980 shall be amended as follows:— 
(a) In Article 10(1) (general civil jurisdiction) for “£15,000” substitute “£30,000”; and 
(b) In Article 30(1) (general civil jurisdiction exercisable by District Judges) for “£5,000” 

substitute “£10,000”. 

Revocations and saving 

3. The entry relating to Article 10(1) of the County Courts (Northern Ireland) Order 1980 in the 
Schedule to the County Courts (Financial Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 1993(b) is revoked. 

4. Article 3(a) of the County Courts (Financial Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) Order 2001(c) 
is revoked. 

5. The amendments made by Articles 2, 3 and 4 of this Order shall not apply to any proceedings 
commenced before 25th February 2013. 
 
 
 
 
 

                                                                                                                                            
(a) S.I. 1980/397 (N.I. 3) 
(b) S.R. 1993 No.282 
(c) S.R. 2001 No.67 



 2 

 
Sealed with the Official Seal of the Department of Justice on 31st January 2013 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 David Ford 
 Minister of Justice 
 
 
 



 3 

 
EXPLANATORY NOTE 

(This note is not part of the Order) 

This Order increases the general civil jurisdiction of county courts in Northern Ireland from 
£15,000 to £30,000 and the jurisdiction of district judges in the county courts from £5,000 to 
£10,000. 
____________________________________________________________________________________________________________ 
 

 Crown copyright 2013 

Printed in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo, Controller of Her 
Majesty’s Stationery Office being the Government Printer for Northern Ireland and the Officer appointed to print Acts of the Northern 
Ireland Assembly. 



 
 
£4.00 

 
N5708 02/2013 435708T 19585 

9 780337 990205

ISBN 978-0-337-99020-5

S T A T U T O R Y  R U L E S  O F  N O R T H E R N  I R E L A N D  

2013 No. 18 

COUNTY COURTS 

The County Courts (Financial Limits) Order (Northern Ireland) 
2013 


