
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security
Benefits Up-rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2024, Section 28. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY RULES OF NORTHERN IRELAND

2024 No. 73

The Social Security Benefits Up-
rating Order (Northern Ireland) 2024

PART 4
JOBSEEKER’S ALLOWANCE

Amounts for the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations 2016

28. In regulation 49 of the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations 2016 (weekly amounts of
jobseeker’s allowance)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a) for “£67.20” substitute “£71.70”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(b) for “£84.80” substitute “£90.50”.

Commencement Information
I1 Art. 28 comes into force in accordance with art. 1(1)(j)(2)



Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security Benefits Up-rating
Order (Northern Ireland) 2024, Section 28.


