Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

SCOTTISH STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 120

The Budget (Scotland) Acts 2007
and 2008 Amendment Order 2009

Amendment of schedule 1 to the 2008 Act

6.—(1) Schedule 1 to the 2008 Act (the Scottish Administration) is amended in accordance with
paragraphs (2) to (4).

(2) In column 1 (purpose)—
(a) in the second purpose, after “Scottish Water Business Stream Holdings” insert “Ltd”;
(b) in the fourth purpose—
(i) after “Social Work Inspection Agency” insert “and Disclosure Scotland”;
(i1) after “Student Loan Scheme” omit “; Disclosure Scotland”; and

(ii1) for “and for International Students” substitute *“; International Students and English
for speakers of other languages”; and

(c) in the sixth purpose, delete “and Water Industry Commission for Scotland”.

(3) In column 2 (amount of resources other than accruing resources)—
(a) in relation to the first purpose, for “£252,827,000” substitute “£251,174,000”;
(b) in relation to the second purpose, for “£3,305,709,000” substitute “£3,271,653,000;
(c) in relation to the third purpose, for “£9,639,773,000” substitute “£11,533,286,000”;
(d) in relation to the fourth purpose, for “£2,786,215,000 substitute “£2,823,938,000”;
(e) in relation to the fifth purpose, for “£1,700,753,000” substitute “£1,714,103,000”;
(f) in relation to the sixth purpose, for “£526,093,000” substitute “£478,686,000”;
(g) in relation to the seventh purpose, for “£267,773,000” substitute “£268,873,000”;
(h) in relation to the eighth purpose, for “£109,730,000” substitute “£110,130,0007;
(i) in relation to the ninth purpose, for “£9,724,612,000” substitute “£9,760,274,000”;
() in relation to the tenth purpose, for “£12,395,000 substitute “£15,792,000”;
(k) in relation to the eleventh purpose, for “£9,750,000” substitute “£12,725,000”; and
(1) in relation to the thirteenth purpose, for “£3,600,000” substitute “£3,090,000”.

(4) In column 4 (amount of accruing resources)—
(a) in relation to the second purpose, for “£55,789,000” substitute “£60,000,000”;
(b) in relation to the fifth purpose, for “£2,700,000” substitute “£200,000’; and
(c) in relation to the sixth purpose, for “£256,000” substitute “£10,250,000”.



