
Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Town and Country

Amenities Act 1974 (repealed), Cross Heading: Trees and gardens. (See end of Document for details)

Town and Country Amenities
Act 1974 (repealed)

1974 CHAPTER 32

Trees and gardens

8 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . F1

Textual Amendments
F1 Ss. 1(1), 4(1), 7(1), 8, 10 repealed by Planning (Consequential Provisions) Act 1990 (c. 11, SIF 123:1,

2), s. 3, Sch. 1 Pt. I

9 Protection of trees in conservation areas in Scotland.

After section 59 of the M1Town and Country Planning (Scotland) Act 1972 there shall
be inserted the following section:—

“59A  Trees in conservation areas.

(1) Subject to the provisions of this section, any person who, in relation to a tree to
which this section applies, does any act which might by virtue of section 58(1)
(a) above be prohibited by a tree preservation order shall be guilty of an offence.

(2) Subject to the provisions of this section, this section applies to any tree in a
conservation area but in respect of which no tree preservation order is for the
time being in force.

(3) lt shall be a defence for a person charged with an offence under subsection (1)
above to prove—

(a) that he served notice of his intention to do the act in question, with
sufficient particulars to identify the tree, on the planning authority in
whose district the tree is or was situated ; and

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/4/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/7/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11/section/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11/schedule/1/part/I


2 Town and Country Amenities Act 1974 (repealed) (c. 32)
Document Generated: 2024-05-12

Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Town and Country

Amenities Act 1974 (repealed), Cross Heading: Trees and gardens. (See end of Document for details)

(b) that he did the act in question—
(i) with the consent of the said planning authority, or

(ii) after the expiry of the period of six weeks from the date of the
notice but before the expiry of the period of two years from
that date.

(4) The Secretary of State may by regulations direct that this section shall not apply
in such cases as may be specified in the regulations.

(5) Without prejudice to the generality of subsection (4) above, the regulations may
be framed so as to exempt from the application of this section cases defined by
reference to all or any of the following matters, namely—

(a) acts of such descriptions or done in such circumstances or subject to
such conditions as may be specified in the regulations;

(b) trees in such conservation areas as may be so specified;
(c) trees of a size or species so specified ; or
(d) trees belonging to persons or bodies of a description so specified;

and the regulations may, in relation to any matter by reference to which
an exemption is conferred by them, make different provision for different
circumstances.

(6) Regulations under subsection (4) above may in particular, but without prejudice
to the generality of that subsection, exempt from the application of this section
cases exempted from the application of section 58 above by subsection (6) of
that section.

(7) It shall be the duty of every planning authority to compile and keep available
for public inspection free of charge at all reasonable hours and at a convenient
place a list, containing such particulars as the Secretary of State may determine
of notices under this section affecting trees in their district.

(8) If any tree to which this section applies is removed, uprooted or destroyed
in contravention of this section or is removed, uprooted or destroyed or dies
at a time when its uprooting or felling is authorised only by virtue of the
provisions of such regulations under subsection (4) above as are mentioned in
subsection (6) above, it shall be the duty of the owner of the land, unless on
his application the planning authority dispense with this requirement, to plant
another tree of an appropriate size and species at the same place as soon as he
reasonably can.

(9) The duty imposed by subsection (8) above on the owner of any land shall
attach to the person who is from time to time the owner of the land and may be
enforced as provided by section 99 of this Act and not otherwise.”

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C1 The text of ss. 2(1), 3(2), 4(2)(3), 7(2), 9, 11(1)–(6), 12, 13(2), Sch. is in the form in which it was

originally enacted: it was not reproduced in Statutes in Force and does not reflect any amendments or
repeals which may have been made prior to 1.2.1991.

Marginal Citations
M1 1972 c. 52.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/52


Town and Country Amenities Act 1974 (repealed) (c. 32)
Document Generated: 2024-05-12

3

Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Town and Country

Amenities Act 1974 (repealed), Cross Heading: Trees and gardens. (See end of Document for details)

10 . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . F2

Textual Amendments
F2 Ss. 1(1), 4(1), 7(1), 8, 10 repealed by Planning (Consequential Provisions) Act 1990 (c. 11, SIF 123:1,

2), s. 3, Sch. 1 Pt. I

11 Offences relating to trees in Scotland.

(1) In subsection (1) of section 58 of the M2Town and Country Planning (Scotland) Act
1972 (tree preservation orders), in paragraph (a), after the word “lopping” there shall
be inserted the words “uprooting, wilful damage”.

(2) Accordingly—
(a) in subsection (6) of that section, before the word “felling”, in each place where

it occurs, there shall be inserted the word “uprooting,” ; and
(b) in section 60(1) of the said Act, after the word “removed”, in both places

where it occurs, there shall be inserted the word “uprooted”, and before the
word “felling”, in both places where it occurs, there shall be inserted the words
“uprooting or”.

(3) For section 98(1) of the said Act there shall be substituted the following subsection:—

“(1) If any person, in contravention of a tree preservation order, cuts down, uproots
or wilfully destroys a tree, or wilfully damages, tops or lops a tree in such a
manner as to be likely to destroy it, he shall be guilty of an offence and shall
be liable—

(a) on summary conviction to a fine not exceeding £400 or twice the sum
which appears to the court to be the value of the tree, whichever is
the greater; or

(b) on conviction on indictment, to a fine, and, in determining the amount
of any fine to be imposed on a person convicted on indictment, the
court shall in particular have regard to any financial benefit which
has accrued or appears likely to accrue to him in consequence of the
offence.”

(4) In subsection (2) of that section, for “£50” substitute “£200”.

(5) In subsection (3) of that section, for “£2” substitute “£5”.

(6) After that subsection add—

“(4) This section shall apply to an offence under section 59A above as it applies
to a contravention of a tree preservation order.”

(7) . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . F3

Textual Amendments
F3 Ss. 1(2), 2(2), 11(7) repealed by Statute Law (Repeals) Act 1981 (c. 19), Sch. 1 Pt. XII

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/4/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/7/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/10
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11/section/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/11/schedule/1/part/I
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/1/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/2/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1974/32/section/11/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1981/19
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1981/19/schedule/1/part/XII


4 Town and Country Amenities Act 1974 (repealed) (c. 32)
Document Generated: 2024-05-12

Status: Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Town and Country

Amenities Act 1974 (repealed), Cross Heading: Trees and gardens. (See end of Document for details)

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C2 The text of ss. 2(1), 3(2), 4(2)(3), 7(2), 9, 11(1)–(6), 12, 13(2), Sch. is in the form in which it was

originally enacted: it was not reproduced in Statutes in Force and does not reflect any amendments or
repeals which may have been made prior to 1.2.1991.

Marginal Citations
M2 1972 c. 52.

12 Grants for historic gardens, etc.

At the end of section 4(1) of the M3Historic Buildings and Ancient Monuments Act
1953 (grants for preservation of historic buildings, their contents and adjoining land)
there shall be added “or in the upkeep of a garden or other land which appears to the
Secretary of State to be of outstanding historic interest but which is not contiguous
or adjacent to a building which appears to him to be of outstanding historic or
architectural interest”.

Modifications etc. (not altering text)
C3 The text of ss. 2(1), 3(2), 4(2)(3), 7(2), 9, 11(1)–(6), 12, 13(2), Sch. is in the form in which it was

originally enacted: it was not reproduced in Statutes in Force and does not reflect any amendments or
repeals which may have been made prior to 1.2.1991.

Marginal Citations
M3 1953 c. 49.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/52
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1953/49


Town and Country Amenities Act 1974 (repealed) (c. 32)
Document Generated: 2024-05-12

5

Status: 
Point in time view as at 01/02/1991.

Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Town and Country Amenities Act 1974
(repealed), Cross Heading: Trees and gardens.


