
Transport Act 1981 (c. 56)
SCHEDULE 6 – Amendments of the Harbours Act 1964
Document Generated: 2023-07-03

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 6

AMENDMENTS OF THE HARBOURS ACT 1964

Penalties for offences
13 (1) In section 10(3) (obstruction of, or failure to assist, person appointed to inspect books,

records and documents) for " £20" there is substituted " £200 ".

(2) In section 31(8) (failure by authority to comply with direction) for " £100 " there is
substituted " £500 ".

(3) In section 41(3) (failure to comply with notice to furnish information or forecasts)
for the words from " £50 " to the end there is substituted " £500 ".

(4) The amendments made by this paragraph do not apply in relation to offences
committed before this paragraph comes into force.


