
Mental Health Act 1983 (c. 20)
SCHEDULE 5 – Transitional and Saving Provisions
Document Generated: 2024-01-18

1

Changes to legislation: Mental Health Act 1983, Paragraph 9 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on or
before 18 January 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date. Changes that have been made
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 5

TRANSITIONAL AND SAVING PROVISIONS

9 (1) F1. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

(2) Section 20(2) of this Act shall have effect in relation to any authority renewed before
1st October 1983 with the substitution for the words “six months” of the words “
one year ”.

(2) Section 20(2) of this Act shall have effect in relation to any authority renewed before
1st October 1983 with the substitution for the words “six months” of the words “
one year ” and for the words “one year” in both places they occur of the words “
two years ”.

(3) F2. . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .

Textual Amendments
F1 Sch. 5 para. 9(1) repealed (22.7.2004) by Statute Law (Repeals) Act 2004 (c. 14), s. 1(1), {Sch. 1 Pt.

17 Group 8}
F2 Sch. 5 para. 9(3) repealed (22.7.2004) by Statute Law (Repeals) Act 2004 (c. 14), s. 1(1), {Sch. 1 Pt.

17 Group 8}

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1983/20/schedule/5/paragraph/9/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2004/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2004/14/section/1/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1983/20/schedule/5/paragraph/9/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2004/14
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2004/14/section/1/1


2 Mental Health Act 1983 (c. 20)
Document Generated: 2024-01-18

Changes to legislation: 
Mental Health Act 1983, Paragraph 9 is up to date with all changes known to be in force on
or before 18 January 2024. There are changes that may be brought into force at a future date.
Changes that have been made appear in the content and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
– Act applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 9(replacing1968 c 20 s. 23) (Act applied

(prosp.) by 1968 c. 20, s. 23(4) (as substituted (prosp.) by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8, 36(2),
Sch. 2, para. 9 which said amending provision was repealed (31.3.2005) by
Domestic Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c. 28), ss. 58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I.
2005/579, art. 3(h)(i)(ix)))

– Act applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 4(replacing1957 c 53 s. 63) (Act applied
(prosp.) by 1957 c. 53, s. 63C(6) (as substituted (prosp.) by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8,
36(2), Sch. 2, para. 4 which said amending provision was repealed (31.3.2005) by
Domestic Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c. 28), ss. 58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I.
2005/579, art. 3(h)(i)(ix)))

– Act applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 1(replacing1955 c 19 s. 116) (Act applied
(prosp.) by 1955 c. 19, s. 116C(6) (as substituted (prosp.) by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8, 36(2),
Sch. 2 para. 1 which said amending provision was repealed (31.3.2005) by Domestic
Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c. 28), ss. 58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I. 2005/579,
art. 3(h)(i)(ix))

– Act applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 1(replacing1955 c 18 s 116) (Act applied
(prosp.) by 1955 c. 18, s. 116C(6) (as substituted (prosp.) by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8, 36(2),
Sch. 2 para. 1 which said amending provision was repealed (31.3.2005) by Domestic
Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c. 28), ss. 58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I. 2005/579,
art. 3(h)(i)(ix)))

– Act power to applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 4(replacing1957 c 53 s. 63) (Act:
Power to apply conferred (prosp.) by 1957 c. 53, s. 63B(4)(c) (as substituted (prosp.)
by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8, 36(2), Sch. 2, para. 4 which said amending provision was
repealed (31.3.2005) by Domestic Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c. 28), ss.
58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I. 2005/579, art. 3(h)(i)(ix)))

– Act power to applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 1(replacing1955 c 19 s. 116) (Act:
Power to apply conferred (prosp.) by 1955 c. 19, s. 116B(4)(c) (as substituted
(prosp.) by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8, 36(2), Sch. 2, para. 1 which said amending provision
was repealed (31.3.2005) by Domestic Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c.
28), ss. 58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I. 2005/579, art. 3(h)(i)(ix)))

– Act power to applied by 1996 c. 46 Sch. 2 para. 1(replacing1955 c 18 s 116) (Act:
Power to apply conferred (prosp.) by 1955 c. 18, s. 116B(4)(c) (as substituted
(prosp.) by 1996 c. 46, ss. 8, 36(2), Sch. 2 para. 1 which said amending provision
was repealed (31.3.2005) by Domestic Violence, Crime and Victims Act 2004 (c.
28), ss. 58(2), 60, Sch. 11; S.I. 2005/579, art. 3(h)(i)(ix)))

Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– s. 74(8) inserted by 2015 c. 2 Sch. 3 para. 3(3)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/section/23
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/section/63
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/section/116
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/section/63
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/section/116
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/46/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2015/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2015/2/schedule/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2015/2/schedule/3/paragraph/3/3

