Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Finance Act 1999
1999 CHAPTER 16

An Act to grant certain duties, to alter other duties, and to amend the law relating to
the National Debt and the Public Revenue, and to make further provision in connection
with Finance. [27th July 1999]

Most Gracious Sovereign, We, Your Majesty’s most dutiful and loyal subjects, the Commons of
the United Kingdom in Parliament assembled, towards raising the necessary supplies to defray
Your Majesty’s public expenses, and making an addition to the public revenue, have freely
and voluntarily resolved to give and grant unto Your Majesty the several duties hereinafter
mentioned; and do therefore most humbly beseech Your Majesty that it may be enacted, and be
it enacted by the Queen’s most Excellent Majesty, by and with the advice and consent of the
Lords Spiritual and Temporal, and Commons, in this present Parliament assembled, and by the
authority of the same, as follows:—

PART I

EXCISE DUTIES
Alcoholic liquor duties

1 Rate of duty on sparkling cider.

(1) In section 62(1A)(a) of the ™ Alcoholic Liquor Duties Act 1979 (rate of duty per
hectolitre on sparkling cider of a strength exceeding 5.5 per cent.), for “£45.05” there
shall be substituted “ £161.20 .

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at 6 o’clock in the evening of
9th March 1999.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part I — Excise duties
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Marginal Citations
M1 1979 c4.

Hydrocarbon oil duties

Rates of duty and rebate on hydrocarbon oil.

(1) In section 6(1A) of the ™Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 (rates of duty on
hydrocarbon oil)—

(a) in paragraph (a) (light oil), for “£0.4926 there shall be substituted “ £0.5288

(b) in paragraph (b) (ultra low sulphur diesel), for “£0.4299” there shall be
substituted ““ £0.4721 ’; and

(¢) in paragraph (c) (heavy oil which is not ultra low sulphur diesel), for
“£0.4499” there shall be substituted “ £0.5021 .

(2) In section 8(3) of that Act (road fuel gas), for “£0.2113” there shall be substituted *
£0.1500 .

(3) In section 11(1) of that Act (rebate on heavy oil)—
(a) in paragraph (a) (fuel oil), for “£0.0218” there shall be substituted “ £0.0265
. and
(b) in each of paragraphs (b) and (ba) (gas oil which is not ultra low sulphur
diesel and ultra low sulphur diesel), for “£0.0282” there shall be substituted
“£0.0303 ™.

(4) In section 13A(1A) of that Act (rebate on unleaded petrol)—

(a) in paragraph (a) (higher octane unleaded petrol), for “£0.0050” there shall be
substituted “ £0.0055 ’; and

(b) in paragraph (b) (other unleaded petrol), for “£0.0527” there shall be
substituted “ £0.0567 ”.

(5) In section 14(1) of that Act (rebate on light oil for use as furnace fuel), for “£0.0218”
there shall be substituted *“ £0.0265 .

(6) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at 6 o’clock in the evening of
9th March 1999.

Marginal Citations
M2 1979¢5

Increased rebate on higher octane unleaded petrol.

(1) In section 13A(1A)(a) of the Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 (rebate on higher
octane unleaded petrol), for “£0.0055” there shall be substituted “ £0.0367 ™.

(2) This section comes into force on 1st October 1999.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/5

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 3
Part I — Excise duties
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

4 Drawback of duty on exportation.

(1) In section 15(1) of the “Hydrocarbon Oil Duties Act 1979 (drawback of duty
on exportation, shipment as stores or warehousing of hydrocarbon oil and related
articles), the word “exportation,” shall be omitted.

(2) This section has effect in relation to any exportation on or after the day on which this
Act is passed.

Marginal Citations
M3 1979c.5.

Tobacco products duty

5 Rates of tobacco products duty.

(1) For the Table of rates of duty in Schedule 1 to the *Tobacco Products Duty Act 1979
there shall be substituted—

1. Cigarettes An amount equal to 22 per cent. of the
retail price plus £82.59 per thousand
cigarettes.

2. Cigars £122.06 per kilogram.

3. Hand-rolling tobacco £87.74 per kilogram.

4. Other smoking tobacco and chewing  £53.66 per kilogram.
tobacco

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force at 6 o’clock in the evening of
9th March 1999.

Marginal Citations
M4 1979c.7

Betting and gaming duties

6 Rate of pool betting duty.

(1) In section 7(1) of the ™Betting and Gaming Duties Act 1981 (rate of pool betting
duty), for “26.50 per cent.” there shall be substituted “ 17.50 per cent. ”

(2) This section has effect in relation to bets the stake money on which is or has been paid
on or after 28th March 1999.

Marginal Citations
MS 1981 c.63


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/7
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1981/63

4 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part I — Excise duties
Document Generated: 2024-05-10
Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)
7 Rates of gaming duty.
(1) For the Table in section 11(2) of the *Finance Act 1997 (rates of gaming duty) there
shall be substituted—
“ Table
Part of gross gaming yield Rate
The first £462,500 2% per cent.
The next £1,027,500 12% per cent.
The next £1,027,500 20 per cent.
The next £1,798,500 30 per cent.
The remainder 40 per cent.”

(2) This section has effect in relation to accounting periods beginning on or after 1st April
1999.

Marginal Citations

M6

8

Mar
M7

1997 c.16

Vehicle excise duty

The general rate of vehicle excise duty.

(1) In sub-paragraph (2) of paragraph 1 of Schedule 1 to the ™ Vehicle Excise and
Registration Act 1994 (the general rate), for “£150” there shall be substituted “ £155 .

(2) For the word “The” at the beginning of that sub-paragraph there shall be substituted “
Except in the case of a vehicle having an engine with a cylinder capacity not exceeding
1,100 cubic centimetres, the .

(3) After that sub-paragraph there shall be inserted the following sub-paragraph—

“(2A) In the case of a vehicle having an engine with a cylinder capacity not
exceeding 1,100 cubic centimetres, the general rate is £100.”

(4) In sections 13(3)(b), 35A(5)(b) and 36(3)(b) of that Act, and in section 13(4)(b) of
that Act as substituted under paragraph 8 of Schedule 4 to that Act, (which refer to the
rate of duty applicable under paragraph 1 of Schedule 1), for the words “paragraph 1
of Schedule 17, in each place where they occur, there shall be substituted *“ paragraph
1(2) of Schedule 1 .

(5) Subsection (1) above has effect in relation to any licence issued after 9th March 1999;
and subsections (2) to (4) above have effect in relation to any licence taken out for a
period beginning on or after 1st June 1999.

ginal Citations
1944 ¢.22


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1997/16
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1944/22

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 5
Part I — Excise duties
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

9 Rates of duty for goods vehicles.

Schedule 1 to this Act (which makes provision for new rates of vehicle excise duty
for goods vehicles etc.) shall have effect.

Goods shipped etc. as stores

10 Goods for sale on board ships or aircraft.

(1) For subsection (4) of section 1 of the ¥Customs and Excise Management Act 1979
(goods for sale on board ships or aircraft to be treated as stores) there shall be
substituted the following subsections—

“(4) Goods for use in a ship or aircraft as merchandise for sale to persons carried in
the ship or aircraft shall be treated for the purposes of the customs and excise
Acts as stores if, and only if—

(a) the goods are to be sold by retail either—
(1) in the course of a relevant journey, or
(i1) for consumption on board;
and
(b) the goods are not treated as exported by virtue of regulations under

section 12 of the ™Customs and Excise Duties (General Reliefs) Act
1979 (goods for use in naval ships or establishments).

(4A) For the purposes of subsection (4) above a relevant journey is any journey
beginning in the United Kingdom and having an immediate destination
outside the member States.

(4B) In relation to goods treated as stores by virtue of subsection (4) above, any
reference in the customs and excise Acts to the consumption of stores shall be
construed as referring to the sale of the goods as mentioned in paragraph (a)
of that subsection.”

(2) This section shall be deemed to have come into force on 1st July 1999 but shall not
have effect in relation to any shipment of goods before that date.

Marginal Citations
M8 1979c.2.
M9 1979c.3.

11 Drawback of duty on shipment.

(1) In section 2 of the ™Finance (No. 2) Act 1992 (power to provide for drawback of
excise duty), in subsection (1), after “provision” there shall be inserted “ (a) ”, and
after “Kingdom” there shall be inserted “; and

(b) conferring an entitlement to drawback of duty, in prescribed cases, on
the shipment as stores, or warehousing in an excise warehouse for use
as stores, of goods chargeable with duty”.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1979/3

6 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) In subsection (5) of that section, for ““ “goods” has the same meaning” there shall be

LN T RN T LRI

substituted “excise warehouse”, “goods”, “shipment”, “stores” and “warehousing”
have the same meanings ”.

(3) Section 132 of the Customs and Excise Management Act 1979 (extension of drawback
to shipment, and warehousing for use, as stores) shall cease to have effect.

(4) Subsection (3) above shall come into force on such day as the Commissioners of
Customs and Excise may by order made by statutory instrument appoint.

Commencement Information
I S.11 partly in force; s.11(1)(2)(4) in force at Royal Assent, see s.11(4)

Marginal Citations
M10 1992 c.48.

PART II

VALUE ADDED TAX

12 Works of art, antiques, etc.

(1) In subsection (4) of section 21 of the ™'Value Added Tax Act 1994 (which treats
as reduced for VAT purposes the value of goods falling within subsection (5) of that
section and imported from outside the EU)—

(a) at the beginning there shall be inserted ““ Subject to subsection (6D) below,
”: and
(b) for “14.29 per cent.” there shall be substituted “ 28.58 per cent. ”

(2) For subsections (5) and (6) of that section there shall be substituted the following
subsections—

“(5) The goods that fall within this subsection are—
(a) any work of art;
(b) any antique, not falling within paragraph (a) above or (c) below, that
is more than one hundred years old;

(c) any collection or collector’s piece that is of zoological,
botanical, mineralogical, anatomical, historical, archaeological,
palaeontological, ethnographic, numismatic or philatelic interest.

(6) In this section “work of art” means, subject to subsections (6A) and (6B)
below—
(a) any mounted or unmounted painting, drawing, collage, decorative
plaque or similar picture that was executed by hand;
(b) any original engraving, lithograph or other print which—
(i) was produced from one or more plates executed by hand
by an individual who executed them without using any
mechanical or photomechanical process; and


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/48

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 7
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(ii) either is the only one produced from the plate or plates or is
comprised in a limited edition;

(c) any original sculpture or statuary, in any material;
(d) any sculpture cast which—

(i) was produced by or under the supervision of the individual
who made the mould or became entitled to it by succession
on the death of that individual; and

(ii) either is the only cast produced from the mould or is
comprised in a limited edition;

(e) any tapestry or other hanging which—
(i) was made by hand from an original design; and
(ii) either is the only one made from the design or is comprised
in a limited edition;
(f) any ceramic executed by an individual and signed by him;
(g) any enamel on copper which—
(i) was executed by hand;

(i1) is signed either by the person who executed it or by someone
on behalf of the studio where it was executed;

(iii) either is the only one made from the design in question or is
comprised in a limited edition; and

(iv) is not comprised in an article of jewellery or an article of a
kind produced by goldsmiths or silversmiths;

(h) any mounted or unmounted photograph which—
(i) was printed by or under the supervision of the photographer;
(ii) is signed by him; and
(iii) either is the only print made from the exposure in question or
is comprised in a limited edition;

(6A) The following do not fall within subsection (5) above by virtue of
subsection (6)(a) above, that is to say—
(a) any technical drawing, map or plan;
(b) any picture comprised in a manufactured article that has been hand-
decorated; or
(c) anything in the nature of scenery, including a backcloth.

(6B) An item comprised in a limited edition shall be taken to be so comprised for
the purposes of subsection (6)(d) to (h) above only if—
(a) in the case of sculpture casts—
(1) the edition is limited so that the number produced from the
same mould does not exceed eight; or
(ii) the edition comprises a limited edition of nine or more casts
made before 1st January 1989 which the Commissioners have
directed should be treated, in the exceptional circumstances
of the case, as a limited edition for the purposes of
subsection (6)(d) above;
(b) inthe case of tapestries and hangings, the edition is limited so that the
number produced from the same design does not exceed eight;
(c) in the case of enamels on copper—



8 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(1) the edition is limited so that the number produced from the
same design does not exceed eight; and

(i1) each of the enamels in the edition is numbered and is signed
as mentioned in subsection (6)(g)(ii) above;

(d) in the case of photographs—

(1) the edition is limited so that the number produced from the
same exposure does not exceed thirty; and

(i1) each of the prints in the edition is numbered and is signed as
mentioned in subsection (6)(h)(ii) above.

(6C) For the purposes of this section a collector’s piece is of philatelic interest if—

(a) it is a postage or revenue stamp, a postmark, a first-day cover or an
item of pre-stamped stationery; and

(b) itis franked or (if unfranked) it is not legal tender and is not intended
for use as such.

(6D) Subsection (4) above does not apply in the case of any goods imported from
outside the member States if—

(a) the whole of the VAT chargeable on their importation falls to be
relieved by virtue of an order under section 37(1); or

(b) they were exported from the United Kingdom during the period of
twelve months ending with the date of their importation.”

(3) This section has effect in relation to goods imported at any time on or after the day
on which this Act is passed.

Marginal Citations
M11 1994 c.23.

13 Gold.

(1) Notwithstanding the words preceding paragraph (a) in section 26(3) of the ¥'*Value
Added Tax Act 1994 (input tax allowable against output tax), regulations which—

(a) are made under section 26(3), and
(b) have effect in respect of exempt supplies which relate to gold,

may provide that input tax is allowable, as being attributable to the supplies, only in
relation to specified matters.

2) An order under section 31(2) of that Act (exempt supplies and acquisitions) which
pt supp q
provides for certain supplies which relate to gold to be exempt supplies may—

(a) provide that a supply which would be an exempt supply by virtue of the order
shall, if the supplier so chooses, be a taxable supply;

(b) make provision by reference to notices to be published by the Commissioners.

(3) An order under section 37(1) of that Act (relief on importation of goods) which gives
relief from VAT on certain importations of gold may make provision by reference to
notices to be published by the Commissioners.

(4) Provision made by virtue of subsection (2) or (3) above may be expressed—
(a) to apply only in specified circumstances;


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/23

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 9
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(b) to apply subject to compliance with specified conditions (which may include
conditions relating to general or specific approval of the Commissioners).

(5) Regulations may—
(a) require specified persons to keep specified records in relation to specified
transactions concerning gold;

(b) require specified persons to give specified information to the Commissioners
about specified transactions concerning gold;

(c) provide for paragraph 10(2) of Schedule 11 to that Act (entry and inspection
of premises) to apply in relation to specified transactions concerning gold as
it applies in relation to the supply of goods under taxable supplies.

(6) The provisions of that Act (including, in particular, section 97 and paragraph 6(2) to
(6) of Schedule 11) shall apply in relation to regulations under subsection (5) above as
they apply in relation to regulations under paragraph 6(1) of Schedule 11 to that Act.

(7) In this section “the Commissioners” means the Commissioners of Customs and
Excise.

Marginal Citations
M12 1994 c.23.

14 Preparations etc. of meat, yeast or egg.

Schedule 8 to the ™"*Value Added Tax Act 1994 (zero-rating) shall have effect, and be
deemed always to have had effect, as if in Group 1 (food), in Note (6) (which provides
that certain items which override the exceptions listed in that Group relate only to
item 4 of the excepted items (non-alcoholic beverages)) for “Items 4 to 6 there were
substituted “ Items 4 to 7 .

Marginal Citations
M13 1994 c.23.

15 Assignment of debts.

(1) In section 36 of the Value Added Tax Act 1994 (bad debts), for subsection (3) there
shall be substituted—

“(3) In subsection (2) above “the outstanding amount” means—
(a) if at the time of the claim no part of the consideration written off in
the claimant’s accounts as a bad debt has been received, an amount
equal to the amount of the consideration so written off;

(b) if at that time any part of the consideration so written off has been
received, an amount by which that part is exceeded by the amount of
the consideration written off;

and in this subsection “received” means received either by the claimant or by
a person to whom has been assigned a right to receive the whole or any part
of the consideration written off.”


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/23
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/23

10 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) In subsection (5)(e) of that section, for the words from “where” to the end of
the paragraph there shall be substituted “ where any part (or further part) of the
consideration written off in the claimant’s accounts as a bad debt is subsequently
received either by the claimant or, except in such circumstances as may be prescribed,
by a person to whom has been assigned a right to receive the whole or any part of
that consideration; .

(3) At the end of paragraph 7 of Schedule 11 to that Act (furnishing of information etc.)
there shall be added—

“(9) For the purposes of this paragraph a person to whom has been assigned a
right to receive the whole or any part of the consideration for a supply of
goods or services shall be treated as a person concerned in the supply.”

[*'(4) Until such day as the Commissioners may specify in regulations made under section 36

of that Act, Part XIX of the "*Value Added Tax Regulations 1995 (bad debt relief),
except regulation 171, shall be read as if a reference to a payment being received by
the claimant were a reference to a payment being received either by the claimant or
by a person to whom a right to receive it has been assigned.]

(5) Subsections (1) and (4) above have effect for the purposes of the making of any refund
or repayment after 9th March 1999, but do not have effect in relation to anything
received on or before that day.

Textual Amendments
F1  S. 15(4) ceased to have effect (1.12.1999) by S.I. 1999/3029, reg. 5

Marginal Citations
M14 S.11995/2518.

16 Groups of companies.

Schedule 2 to this Act (which makes changes to provisions about the treatment of
bodies corporate as members of a group) shall have effect.

17 Penalties for incorrect certificates.

(1) For subsections (1) and (2) of section 62 of the Value Added Tax Act 1994 (incorrect
certificates as to zero-rating etc.) there shall be substituted the following subsections—

“(1) Subject to subsections (3) and (4) below, where—
(a) aperson to whom one or more supplies are, or are to be, made—
(1) gives to the supplier a certificate that the supply or supplies
fall, or will fall, wholly or partly within paragraph 1 of
Schedule Al, Group 5 or 6 of Schedule 8 or Group 1 of
Schedule 9, or
(ii) gives to the supplier a certificate for the purposes of
section 18B(2)(d) or 18C(1)(c),
and
(b) the certificate is incorrect,


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/3029
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/3029/regulation/5

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 11
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

the person giving the certificate shall be liable to a penalty.

(1A) Subject to subsections (3) and (4) below, where—

(a) a person who makes, or is to make, an acquisition of goods from
another member State prepares a certificate for the purposes of
section 18B(1)(d), and

(b) the certificate is incorrect,
the person preparing the certificate shall be liable to a penalty.

(2) The amount of the penalty shall be equal to—

(a) in a case where the penalty is imposed by virtue of subsection (1)
above, the difference between—

(i) the amount of the VAT which would have been chargeable on
the supply or supplies if the certificate had been correct; and

(i1) the amount of VAT actually chargeable;

(b) in a case where it is imposed by virtue of subsection (1A) above, the
amount of VAT actually chargeable on the acquisition.”

(2) Subsection (1) above has effect in relation to certificates given or, as the case may be,
prepared on or after the day on which this Act is passed.

18 EC sales statements: time limits for assessments to penalties.

(1) For section 77(2) of the "*Value Added Tax Act 1994 (time limits for assessments
under section 76) there shall be substituted the following subsections—

“(2) Subject to subsection (5) below, an assessment under section 76 of an amount
due by way of any penalty, interest or surcharge referred to in subsection (3)
of that section may be made at any time before the expiry of the period of 2
years beginning with the time when the amount of VAT due for the prescribed
accounting period concerned has been finally determined.

(2A) Subject to subsection (5) below, an assessment under section 76 of a penalty
under section 65 or 66 may be made at any time before the expiry of the period
of 2 years beginning with the time when facts sufficient in the opinion of the
Commissioners to indicate, as the case may be—

(a) that the statement in question contained a material inaccuracy, or
(b) that there had been a default within the meaning of section 66(1),
came to the Commissioners’ knowledge.”

(2) Subsection (1) above has effect in relation to any amount by way of penalty, interest
or surcharge which becomes due on or after the day on which this Act is passed.

Marginal Citations
M15 1994 c.23.

19 Period before repayment supplement payable.

(1) Section 79 of the ™®Value Added Tax Act 1994 (repayment supplement) shall be
amended as follows.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/23

12 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part Il — Value added tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) In subsection (2)(b), for “the period of 30 days beginning on the date of the receipt
by the Commissioners of that return or claim” there shall be substituted “ the relevant
period ”.

(3) After subsection (2) there shall be inserted—

“(2A) The relevant period in relation to a return or claim is the period of 30 days
beginning with the later of—

(a) the day after the last day of the prescribed accounting period to which
the return or claim relates, and

(b) the date of the receipt by the Commissioners of the return or claim.”

(4) In subsections (3) and (7), for “subsection (2)(b)” there shall be substituted “
subsection (2A) ”’; and regulations under subsection (3) shall be construed accordingly.

(5) This section has effect in relation to returns and claims received by the Commissioners
on or after 9th March 1999.

Marginal Citations
M16 1994 c.23.

20 Meaning of “business”.

(1) Section 94(3) of the Value Added Tax Act 1994 (meaning of “business”: public
organisations) shall cease to have effect.

(2) This section shall come into force in accordance with such provision as the
Commissioners of Customs and Excise may make by order made by statutory
instrument.

Subordinate Legislation Made
P1  S.20(2) power fully exercised (12.10.1999): 1.12.1999 appointed by S.I. 1999/2769, art. 2

Textual Amendments
F2  S. 21 repealed (1.4.2001) by 2000 c. 20, ss. 21(4), 29(2), Sch. 2; S.I. 2000/3349, art. 3 (subject to
transitional provisions in arts. 4, 5)


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/23
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/2769
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1999/2769/article/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/20
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/20/section/21/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/20/section/29/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/20/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/3349
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/3349/article/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/3349/article/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/3349/article/5

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 13
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

PART III

INCOME TAX, CORPORATION TAX AND CAPITAL GAINS TAX
Income tax rates and charge etc.

22 Starting rate.

(1) The following shall be substituted for section 1(2)(aa) of the Taxes Act 1988 (the
charge to income tax: lower rate)—
“(aa) in respect of so much of an individual’s total income as does not
exceed £1,500, at such rate as Parliament may determine to be the
starting rate for that year;”.

(2) The following shall be substituted for section 1(2A) of that Act (lower rate limit)}—

“(2A) The amount up to which an individual’s income is by virtue of subsection (2)
above chargeable for any year at the starting rate shall be known as the starting
rate limit.”

(3) In section 1(3) of that Act (basic rate limit), for “lower rate” there shall be substituted
“ starting rate .

(4) In section 1(4) of that Act (indexation), for the words from ““and, if the result is not a
multiple of £100 to the end there shall be substituted “and—

(a) if the result in the case of the amount specified in subsection (2)(aa)
above is not a multiple of £10, rounding it up to the nearest amount
which is such a multiple, and

(b) if the result in the case of the amount specified in subsection (2)(b)
above is not a multiple of £100, rounding it up to the nearest amount
which is such a multiple.”

(5) Section 1(4) of that Act (indexation), so far as it relates to section 1(2)(aa), shall not
apply for the year 1999-00.

(6) In section 1(6A) of that Act (repayment), for “lower rate” there shall be substituted
“ starting rate ”’.

(7) In section 1A of that Act (application of lower rate to income from savings and
distributions)—

(a) the following shall be inserted before subsection (2)—

“(1B) In relation to any year of assessment for which income tax is charged
the lower rate is 20 per cent. or such other rate as Parliament may
determine.”, and

(b) the following shall be inserted after subsection (6)—

“(6A) Where income tax at the basic rate has been borne on income
chargeable at the lower rate any necessary repayment of tax shall be
made on the making of a claim.”

(8) In the following provisions of that Act, for “lower rate” there shall be substituted “
starting rate ”

(a) section 547(5)(c) (life policies, etc.: method of charging gain to tax);



14 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(b) section 550(3) (life policies, etc.: relief where gain charged at a higher rate).

(9) In the following provisions of that Act, for “at the lower rate by virtue of section 1(2)
(aa)” there shall be substituted “ at the starting rate ”

(a) section 549(2) (life policies, etc.: deficiencies allowable as deductions);
(b) section 699(2) (relief from higher rate for inheritance tax on accrued income);
(c) section 819(2) (old references to standard rate tax).

(10) In section 832(1) of that Act (interpretation of the Tax Acts)—
(a) the following shall be substituted for the definition of “lower rate”—

““lower rate”, in relation to the charging of income tax for any year of
assessment, means the rate of income tax specified in or determined
in pursuance of section 1A(1B);”, and

(b) the following shall be inserted after the definition of “Schedule A business”™—

13313

starting rate”, in relation to the charging of income tax for any year
of assessment, means the rate of income tax determined in pursuance
of section 1(2)(aa), and any reference to the starting rate limit shall
be construed in accordance with section 1(2A);”.

(11) In the following provisions of the ™" Taxes Management Act 1970, for “or the lower
rate” there shall be substituted “, the lower rate or the starting rate ”

(a) section 7(6) (notice of liability to income tax and capital gains tax);

(b) section 91(3)(c) (effect of reliefs on tax charged on income subject to
deduction).

(12) Subsections (1) to (3) and (6) to (11) above apply for the year 1999-00 and subsequent
years of assessment; and subsection (4) above applies for the year 2000-01 and
subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations
M17 1970 c.9.

23 Charge and rates for 1999-00.

Income tax shall be charged for the year 1999-00, and for that year—
(a) the starting rate shall be 10 per cent.;
(b) the basic rate shall be 23 per cent.; and
(c) the higher rate shall be 40 per cent.

24 Personal allowances for 1999-00 for those aged 65 or more.

(1) For the year 1999-00 the amounts specified in subsections (2) and (3) of section 257
of the Taxes Act 1988 (personal allowances for those aged at least 65 but less than 75
and for those aged 75 or more) shall be taken to be £5,720 and £5,980, respectively.

(2) Accordingly, section 257C(1) of the Taxes Act 1988 (indexation), so far as it relates
to the amounts so specified, shall not apply for the year 1999-00.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1970/9

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 15
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

25

26

Operative date of indexation for PAYE.

(1) The Taxes Act 1988 shall be amended in accordance with subsections (2) and (3)
below.

(2) In section 1 (charge to income tax), after subsection (4) there shall be inserted—

“(5A) Subsection (4) above shall not require any change to be made in the amounts
deductible or repayable under section 203 during the period beginning with
6th April and ending with 17th May in the year of assessment.”

(3) In section 257C (indexation of allowances), after subsection (1) there shall be
inserted—

“(2A) Subsection (1) above shall not require any change to be made in the amounts
deductible or repayable under section 203 during the period beginning with
6th April and ending with 17th May in the year of assessment.”

(4) This section has effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.
Rates of capital gains tax

Rates of capital gains tax.

(1) Section 4 of the "*Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992 (rates of capital gains tax)
shall be amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (1) (link between rate of capital gains tax and rate of income tax), for
“basic rate” there shall be substituted *“ lower rate ”.

(3) In subsection (1AA) (rate for trusts etc.), for “applicable to trusts under section 686(1)
of the Taxes Act” there shall be substituted “ the rate applicable to trusts under
section 686 of the Taxes Act ™.

(4) Subsections (1A), (1B), (3A) and (3B) (charge at income tax lower rate in certain
cases) shall cease to have effect.

(5) In subsection (4) (definition of “unused part of an individual’s basic rate band”), the
words “(disregarding subsection (3B)(a) above)” shall cease to have effect.

(6) This section applies for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations

27

M18 1992 c.12.

Corporation tax charge and rates

Charge and main rate for financial year 2000.

Corporation tax shall be charged for the financial year 2000 at the rate of 30 per cent.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/12

16 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

28 Corporation tax starting rate.

(1) After section 13 of the Taxes Act 1988 there shall be inserted the following section—

“13AA Corporation tax starting rate.

(1) Where in any accounting period the profits of a qualifying company do not
exceed the first relevant amount, the company may, instead of making a claim
under section 13(1), claim that the corporation tax charged on its basic profits
for that period shall be calculated as if the rate of corporation tax were such
rate (to be known as the “corporation tax starting rate”), lower than the small
companies’ rate, as Parliament may from time to time determine.

(2) Where in any accounting period the profits of a qualifying company exceed
the first relevant amount but do not exceed the second relevant amount, the
company may, instead of making a claim under section 13(1), claim that the
corporation tax charged on its basic profits for that period shall be—

(a) calculated as if the rate of corporation tax were the small companies’
rate; and

(b) then reduced by the sum specified in subsection (3) below.

(3) That sum is the sum equal to such fraction as Parliament may from time to
time determine of the following amount—

. : L
i -
(B2 — F) = P
where—
R2 is the second relevant amount;
P is the amount of the profits; and
I is the amount of the basic profits.

(4) The first and second relevant amounts mentioned above shall be determined
as follows—
(a) where the company has no associated company in the accounting
period, those amounts are £10,000 and £50,000 respectively;
(b) where the company has one or more associated companies in the
accounting period—
(i) the first relevant amount is £10,000 divided by one plus the
number of those associated companies, and
(i) the second relevant amount is £50,000 divided by one plus
the number of those associated companies.

(5) Subsections (4) and (5) of section 13 shall apply for the purposes of
subsection (4) above as they apply for the purposes of subsection (3) of that
section.

(6) For an accounting period of less than 12 months the relevant amounts
determined in accordance with subsection (4) above shall be proportionately
reduced.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 17
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(7) The profits and the basic profits of a company for an accounting period shall
be determined for the purposes of this section as they are for the purposes of
section 13.

(8) In this section “qualifying company”, in relation to an accounting period,
means a company which—

(a) s resident in the United Kingdom,;

(b) isnotaclose investment-holding company (as defined in section 13A)
at the end of that period; and

(c) isnotan investment trust which for that period has any eligible rental
income (within the meaning of section 508A).”

(2) In section 13A(1) of the Taxes Act 1988 (close investment-holding companies), after
“section 13(1)” there shall be inserted “ or 13AA(8) ™.

(3) In section 468(1A) of that Act (taxation of authorised unit trusts), at the end there shall
be inserted “ and sections 13 and 13AA shall not apply ™.

(4) In paragraph 1(a) of Schedule 12 to the ™"Finance Act 1989 (provision of information
for the purposes of close companies provisions), for “13A” there shall be substituted
“13to 13A ™.

(5) In paragraph 8(1) of Schedule 18 to the ™Finance Act 1998 (tax calculation in
company tax return), after “section 13(2)” there shall be inserted ““ or 13AA(2) .

(6) Subsections (1) to (5) above have effect, subject to subsection (7) below, in relation
to corporation tax for the financial year 2000 or any subsequent financial year.

(7) In the case of an accounting period beginning before 1st April 2000 and ending on
or after that date—

(a) section 13AA of the Taxes Act 1988 shall apply as if the different parts of
that accounting period falling in the different financial years were separate
accounting periods;

(b) where a claim is made under section 13AA in relation to the part of that period
beginning with 1st April 2000, section 13 of that Act shall also so apply; and

(c) for the purposes of treating different parts of an accounting period as separate
accounting periods in accordance with paragraphs (a) and (b) above, the
profits and basic profits of the company for that period shall be attributed
to the different parts of it according to the financial year in which, for the
purposes of section 8 of that Act, they are taken to arise.

Marginal Citations

29

M19 1989 c.26.
M20 1998 c.36.
Rate and fraction for corporation tax starting rate.

For the financial year 2000—
(a) the corporation tax starting rate shall be 10 per cent.; and

(b) the fraction mentioned in section 13AA(3) of the Taxes Act 1988 shall be one
fortieth.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1989/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/36

18 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Income tax reductions

30 Children’s tax credit.

(1) The following section shall be inserted after section 257 of the Taxes Act 1988—

“257AA Children’s tax credit.

(1) If a qualifying child (or more than one) is resident with the claimant during
the whole or part of the year of assessment, the claimant shall be entitled to
an income tax reduction, to be known as a children’s tax credit.

(2) The reduction shall be calculated by reference to £4,160.

(3) Where any part of the claimant’s income for the year of assessment falls within
section 1(2)(b), his children’s tax credit for the year shall be calculated as if
the amount specified in subsection (2) above were reduced by £2 for every
£3 of that part of his income.

(4) In this section “qualifying child” means, in relation to a person—
(a) achild of his who has not attained the age of 16, or

(b) achild who has not attained the age of 16 and who is maintained by,
and at the expense of, the person for any part of the year of assessment;

and “child” includes illegitimate child and stepchild.

(5) Schedule 13B (which modifies this section where a child lives with more than
one adult during a year of assessment) shall have effect.”

(2) The Schedule set out in Schedule 3 to this Act shall be inserted after Schedule 13A
to the Taxes Act 1988.

(3) In section 257C(1) and (3) of the Taxes Act 1988 (indexation), for the words “sections
257 and 257A” there shall be substituted “ sections 257, 257AA(2) and 257A .

(4) The ™'Taxes Management Act 1970 shall be amended as follows—

(a) in section 36(3A) (fraudulent or negligent conduct), there shall be inserted
at the end “ or under Schedule 13B to that Act (elections as to transfer of
children’s tax credit) ”,

(b) in section 37A (effect of assessment where allowances transferred)—

(1) after “spouse” there shall be inserted “ or partner ”, and

(ii) after “Act” there shall be inserted * or paragraph 4 of Schedule 13B
to that Act ”,

(c) in section 43A(2A) (further assessments), there shall be inserted at the end “
or under Schedule 13B to that Act (elections as to transfer of children’s tax
credit) 7, and

(d) in section 58(3)(b) (proceedings in Northern Ireland), after “repealed by that
Act)” there shall be inserted “, paragraph 6 of Schedule 13B to that Act ™.

(5) Subsections (1), (2) and (4) above have effect for the year 2001-02 and subsequent
years of assessment.

(6) Subsection (3) above has effect for the purposes of the application of section 257AA
of the Taxes Act 1988 for the year 2002-03 and subsequent years of assessment.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 19
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Marginal Citations
M21 1970 c.9.

31 Restriction of MCA to those reaching 65 before 2000-01.

(1) Section 257A of the Taxes Act 1988 (income tax reduction for married couples) shall
be amended as follows.

(2) Subsection (1) (reduction where neither spouse is aged 65 or over) shall cease to have
effect.

(3) In subsection (2) (reduction where either spouse is aged 65 or over)—

(a) for “is at any time within that year of the age of 65 or upwards” there shall be
substituted “ was born before 6th April 1935 ”*;

(b) the words from “(instead of” to the end shall be omitted.

(4) In subsection (3) (reduction where either spouse is aged 75 or over)—
(a) after “either of them” there shall be inserted “ (a) ”;
(b) after “75 or upwards,” there shall be inserted “and
(b) was born before 6th April 1935,”;
(¢c) the words “(1) or” shall be omitted.

5) In subsection (4) (rule where person dies in year of assessment)—
p y
(a) for “subsections (2) and (3)” there shall be substituted “ subsection (3) ”;
(b) for “a specified age” there shall be substituted “ the age of 75 ™.

(6) In subsection (5) (tapering of reduction where claimant’s total income exceeds
specified amount), the words from “(but not” to the end shall be omitted.

(7) After that subsection there shall be inserted the following subsection—

“(5A) The amounts specified in subsections (2) and (3) above shall not by virtue of
subsection (5) above be treated as reduced below £1,970.”

(8) In subsection (6) (rule where claimant marries in year of assessment, etc.), for
“subsections (1) to (3)” there shall be substituted *“ subsections (2) and (3) ™.

(9) After subsection (6) there shall be inserted the following subsections—

“(7) A man who is entitled for any year of assessment to an income tax reduction
under this section, or to make a claim for such a reduction, shall not be entitled
for that year to any income tax reduction under section 257AA.

(8) Where—
(a) awoman is married to and living with a man for the whole or any part
of a year of assessment, and
(b) that man is entitled for that year to an income tax reduction under this
section, or to make a claim for such a reduction,
no child shall be regarded for any of the purposes of section 257AA or

Schedule 13B as resident with that woman at any time in that year when she
is married to and living with that man.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1970/9

20 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(9) A person may, by notice to an officer of the Board, elect to give up his
entitlement for any year of assessment to an income tax reduction under
this section; and where he does so and the election is not subsequently
revoked, that person shall be taken for the purposes of this section to have no
entitlement for that year to a reduction under this section, or to make a claim
for such a reduction.”

(10) Subsections (2) to (5) and (8) above have effect for the year 2000-01 and subsequent
years of assessment.

(11) Subject to section 32(5) below, subsections (6) and (7) above have effect for the year
1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.

(12) Subsection (9) above has effect for the year 2001-02 and subsequent years of
assessment.

32 Further provision about married couple’s allowance.

(1) In section 257BA of the Taxes Act 1988 (elections as to transfer of relief under
section 257A)—

(a) in subsections (1)(a), (2)(a), (3)(a) and (6), for “section 257A(1)” there shall
be substituted “ section 257A(5A) ”;

(b) in subsection (2), the words from “(to nil” to the end shall be omitted;

(c) in subsection (9), for “deduction” there shall be substituted “ income tax
reduction ”’.

(2) Sections 257D to 257F of that Act (transitional relief in connection with married
couple’s allowance) shall cease to have effect.

(3) Subsection (1)(a) and (c) above has effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years
of assessment.

(4) Subsections (1)(b) and (2) above have effect for the year 2000-01 and subsequent
years of assessment.

(5) Section 257C of the Taxes Act 1988 (indexation) shall apply in relation to
subsection (5A) of section 257A of that Act, but only for the year 2000-01 and
subsequent years of assessment.

33 Abolition of existing relief in respect of children.

(1) Sections 259 to 261A of the Taxes Act 1988 (additional relief in respect of children)
shall cease to have effect.

(2) This section has effect for the year 2000-01 and subsequent years of assessment.

34 Abolition of widow’s bereavement allowance.

(1) Section 262 of the Taxes Act 1988 (income tax reduction for widow in year of
bereavement and following year) shall cease to have effect.

(2) Subsection (1) above has effect in relation to deaths occurring on or after 6th April
2000.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 21
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

35

36

(3) Where a woman is entitled to an income tax reduction for the year 2000-01 by virtue of
paragraph (b) of section 262(1) of the Taxes Act 1988, the reference in that paragraph
to the amount specified in section 257A(1) for that year shall be read as a reference to
the amount specified in section 257A(5A) for that year.

Order of income tax reductions etc.

(1) In section 256(3) of the Taxes Act 1988 (order of income tax reductions etc.)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “section 259 or 261A” there shall be substituted “
section 257AA ”;

(b) paragraph (b) shall cease to have effect;
(c) the words after paragraph (c) shall be omitted.

(2) Subsection (1)(a) and (b) above has effect for the year 2001-02 and subsequent years
of assessment.

(3) Subsection (1)(c) above has effect for the year 2000-01 and subsequent years of
assessment.

(4) For the year 2000-01, section 256(3) of the Taxes Act 1988 shall have effect with the
omission of paragraph (a) and, in paragraph (b), of the words “except section 259 or
261A”.

Maintenance payments.

(1) In subsection (1) of section 347B of the Taxes Act 1988 (income tax reduction in
respect of qualifying maintenance payments), at the beginning there shall be inserted
“ Subject to subsection (1A) below .

(2) After that subsection there shall be inserted the following subsection—

“(1A) A periodical payment is not a qualifying maintenance payment unless either
of the parties to the marriage mentioned in subsection (1)(b) above was born
before 6th April 1935.”

(3) In subsection (2) of that section, for “subsections (3) and (4)” there shall be substituted
“ subsection (3) .

(4) In subsection (3) of that section, for “section 257A(1)” there shall be substituted *
section 257A(5A) .

(5) In subsection (5A) of that section, for “subsections (2) to (5)” there shall be substituted
“ subsections (2) and (3) ™.

(6) In subsection (8) of that section, for “subsections (1)(a) and (5)(a)” there shall be
substituted “ subsection (1)(a) ”.

(7) Sections 347A and 347B of the Taxes Act 1988 shall have effect, notwithstanding
anything in subsection (3) of section 36 of the **Finance Act 1988 (which provides
for the application of those sections), in relation to a payment made in pursuance of
an existing obligation (within the meaning of that subsection) as they have effect in
relation to a payment made otherwise than in pursuance of such an obligation.

(8) This section has effect in relation to any payment falling due on or after 6th April 2000.



22 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Marginal Citations
M22 1988 c.39.

Relief for interest payments

37 Limit on relief for interest.

For the year 1999-00 the qualifying maximum defined in section 367(5) of the Taxes
Act 1988 (limit on relief for interest on certain loans) shall be £30,000.

38 Withdrawal of relief for interest on loans to buy land etc.

(1) A payment of interest falling within subsection (3) or (4) below shall not be eligible
for relief under section 353 of the Taxes Act 1988 by virtue of section 354 of that Act
(interest on loans to buy land etc.).

(2) Section 369(1) of that Act (mortgage interest payable under deduction of tax) shall
not apply to any payment of interest falling within subsection (3) or (4) below which
(apart from section 353(2) of that Act and subsection (1) above) would be eligible for
relief under section 353 of that Act by virtue of section 354 of that Act.

(3) A payment of interest falls within this subsection if it is—
(a) apayment made on or after 6th April 2000 (whenever falling due); or

(b) a payment made before that date, but not before 9th March 1999, of any
interest that was not due until on or after 6th April 2000.

(4) A payment of interest falls within this subsection if it is—
(a) made before 6th April 2000 but not before 9th March 1999; and

(b) made under or in accordance with any scheme made for a tax-avoidance
purpose on or after 9th March 1999 (whether or not before the making of the
payment).

(5) For the purposes of subsection (4) above, a scheme is made for a tax-avoidance
purpose if its main purpose, or one of its main purposes, is to secure that a payment
of one or more of the following descriptions is a relievable payment, that is to say—

(a) a payment discharging an obligation to make a payment which (but for the
scheme) might have been expected to be a non-relievable payment;

(b) apayment made in pursuance of any obligation which has effect, directly or
indirectly, in place of an obligation under which a payment which might have
been expected to be a non-relievable payment would have become due;

(¢) apayment made in pursuance of an obligation which (apart from the purpose
of securing that it is a relievable payment) might have been expected to take
the form of an obligation—

(i) to make a non-relievable payment, or
(i1) to make two or more payments at least one of which would have been
a non-relievable payment.

(6) In subsection (5) above—

“non-relievable payment” means a payment falling within subsection (3)
above; and


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1988/39

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 23
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

39

40

“relievable payment” means a payment which—
(a) is eligible for relief under section 353 of the Taxes Act 1988, or
(b) is a payment to which section 369(1) of that Act applies.

(7) The references in this section to a scheme are references to any scheme, arrangements
or understanding of any kind whatever, whether or not legally enforceable.

(8) Schedule 4 to this Act (which contains amendments consequential on the preceding
provisions of this section) shall have effect.

Withdrawal of relief for interest on new annuity loans.

(1) In section 365 of the Taxes Act 1988 (relief for interest on loans to buy life annuities),
in subsection (1), before paragraph (a) insert—
“(aa) that the loan was made before 9th March 1999;”.

(2) After subsection (1) of that section insert—

“(1AA) Where—

(a) aloan made on or after 9th March 1999 was made in pursuance of an
offer made by the lender before that date, and

(b) the offer was either in writing or evidenced by a note or memorandum
made by the lender before that date,

the loan shall be deemed for the purposes of subsection (1)(aa) above to have
been made before that date.”

(3) This section has effect for the year 1998-99 and subsequent years of assessment.

Annuity loans: residence requirements and re-mortgages.

(1) Section 365 of the Taxes Act 1988 (relief for interest on loans to buy life annuities)
is amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (1)(d) (residence requirement for land on which loan is secured), for
“uses the land on which it was secured as his only or main residence at the time the
interest is paid” substitute “ used the land on which it was secured as his only or main
residence immediately before 9th March 1999 .

(3) After subsection (1AA) (inserted by section 39 of this Act) insert—

“(1AB) Subject to subsection (1AC) below, the conditions in paragraphs (aa) and (a)
of subsection (1) above shall be treated as satisfied in relation to a loan (“the
new loan”) if—

(a) the new loan was made on or after the day on which the Finance Act
1999 was passed;

(b) the new loan was made as part of a scheme (“the scheme”) under
which the whole or any part of the proceeds of the loan was used to
defray money applied in paying off another loan (“the old loan”); and

(c) the conditions in subsection (1) above were, or were treated by virtue
of this subsection as, satisfied with respect to the old loan.

(1AC) If only part of the proceeds of the new loan was used to defray money applied
in paying off the old loan, subsection (1AB) above applies only if, under the
scheme, not less than nine-tenths of the remaining part of the proceeds of the



24 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

new loan was applied to the purchase by the person to whom it was made of
an annuity ending with his life or with the life of the survivor of two or more
persons who include him.

(1AD) In subsection (1AC) above “the remaining part” means the part of the proceeds
of the new loan that was not used to defray money applied in paying off the
old loan.”

(4) For subsection (1A) substitute—

“(1A) The condition in subsection (1)(d) above shall be treated as satisfied in relation
to a loan if—

(a) the person to whom the loan was made, or any of the annuitants,
ceased to use the land as his only or main residence at a time falling
within the period of twelve months ending with 8th March 1999, and

(b) the intention at that time of the person to whom the loan was made, or
each of the annuitants owning an estate or interest in the land, was to
take steps, before the end of the period of twelve months after the day
on which the land ceased to be so used, with a view to the disposal
of his estate or interest.”

(5) This section has effect in relation to any payment of interest (whenever falling due)
made on or after the day on which this Act is passed.

41 Repayments attracting repayment supplement.

(1) Section 824 of the Taxes Act 1988 (repayment supplements for individuals) shall have
effect, and be deemed always to have had effect, with the following amendments.

(2) Before subsection (3) insert—

“(2B) Subsection (1) above shall apply to a payment made by the Board under
section 375(8) (payment of amount which borrower would have been able to
deduct from interest payment under section 369(1)) as if the payment were a
repayment falling within that subsection.”

(3) In subsection (3), before paragraph (a) insert—
“(aa) if the repayment is a payment made by the Board under
section 375(8), the relevant time is—
(i) if the interest payment was made in the year 1996-97 or
a subsequent year of assessment, the 31st January next
following that year;
(i) if the interest payment was made in an earlier year of
assessment, the Sth April next following that year;”.

(4) This section shall be deemed to have had effect in relation to provisions corresponding
to section 824 of the Taxes Act 1988 directly or indirectly re-enacted in that section
as it has effect in relation to that section, subject to subsections (5) and (6) below.

(5) For the purposes of subsection (4) above the references in the amendments of
section 824 of the Taxes Act 1988 made by this section to provisions of that Act
shall be taken to include references to any corresponding provision contained in the
enactments directly or indirectly re-enacted in those provisions.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 25
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

42

43

(6) Subsection (4) above applies only if the payments corresponding to payments under
section 375(8) of the Taxes Act 1988 were made in the year 1984-85 or a subsequent
year of assessment.

Employee benefits etc.

Conditional acquisition of shares.

(1) Section 140A of the Taxes Act 1988 (conditional acquisition of shares) is amended
as follows.

(2) Omit subsection (2).

(3) In subsection (3), for “In any other case” substitute “ If the terms on which the
employee acquires the employee’s interest are such that his interest in the shares in
question will cease to be only conditional within five years after his acquisition of the
interest ”.

(4) In subsection (4), for “, in a case falling within subsection (2) or (3) above” substitute
“ (whether or not subsection (3) above applies) .

(5) This section applies in relation to shares acquired on or after the day on which this
Act is passed.

Meaning of conditional interests in shares.

(1) Section 140C of the Taxes Act 1988 (which describes the cases in which an interest
in shares is, or is not, to be treated as only conditional) is amended as follows.

(2) After subsection (1) insert—

“(1A) A person shall not for the purposes of sections 140A and 140B be taken, in
relation to any shares in a company or any security, to have an interest which
is only conditional by reason only that one or more of subsections (2) to (4)
below applies in relation to him.”

(3) In subsections (2), (3) and (4) for the words from the beginning to “by reason only
that” substitute ““ This subsection applies in relation to a person if ™.

(4) In subsection (3)—
(a) after “offer the shares for sale” insert “ or transfer them ”; and

(b) for the words from “if he ceases” to the end substitute “ if he ceases to be an
officer or employee of the company or of one or more group companies or
of any group company. ”

(5) After that subsection insert—

“(3A) This subsection applies in relation to a person if he may be required to offer
the shares for sale or transfer them, if, as a result of misconduct, he ceases to
be an officer or employee of the company or of one or more group companies
or of any group company.”

(6) After subsection (5) add—

“(6) For the purposes of this section—



26 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(a) acompany is a “group company” in relation to another company if
they are members of the same group, and

(b) companies are taken to be members of the same group if, and only if,
one is a 51 per cent. subsidiary of the other or both are 51 per cent.
subsidiaries of a third company.”

(7) The amendments made by this section shall be deemed always to have had effect.

44 Exemption for mobile telephones.

(1) The following section shall be inserted after section 155 of the Taxes Act 1988
(exception of certain benefits in kind from the general charge to tax)—

“155AA Mobile telephones.

(1) Section 154 does not apply where the benefit consists in a mobile telephone
being made available (without any transfer of the property in it) to the
employee or to a member of his family or household.

(2) In this section “mobile telephone” means wireless telegraphy apparatus
designed or adapted for the purpose of transmitting and receiving spoken
messages so as to provide a telephone which—

(a) is connected to a public telecommunication system (within the
meaning of the " Telecommunications Act 1984); and

(b) is not physically connected to a land-line;
but does not include any cordless telephone or any telepoint telephone.

(3) The mobile telephones to which the exemption provided by this section
applies include any mobile telephone provided in connection with a car,
van or heavier commercial vehicle, notwithstanding that the vehicle is made
available as mentioned in section 157, section 159AA or, as the case may be,
section 159AC.

(4) In this section “cordless telephone” means wireless telegraphy apparatus
which (whether or not provided in connection with a car, van or heavier
commercial vehicle)—

(a) is designed or adapted for the purpose of transmitting and receiving
spoken messages so as to provide a wireless extension to a telephone,
and

(b) 1is used only as such an extension to a telephone that is physically
connected to a land-line.

(5) In this section “telepoint telephone” means wireless telegraphy apparatus
which (whether or not provided in connection with a car, van or heavier
commercial vehicle) is used for the purpose of a short-range radio
communications service utilising frequencies between 864 and 868 megahertz
(inclusive).

(6) In this section “heavier commercial vehicle” has the same meaning as in
section 159AC.”

(2) Section 159A of that Act (charge on mobile telephones) shall cease to have effect.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 27
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(3) In section 154 of that Act (general charging provision for benefits in kind), in
subsection (2)—
(a) in paragraph (b), “159A,” shall be omitted; and
(b) after “sections 155” there shall be inserted “, 155AA .

(4) In section 168A of that Act (price of a car as regards a year), in subsection (11), for
“section 159A(8)(a)” there shall be substituted “ section 155AA(2) ™.

(5) In section 200AA of that Act (incidental benefits for holders of certain offices etc.),
subsection (3) shall cease to have effect.

(6) This section has effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations
M23 1984 c.12.

45 Limited exemption for computer equipment.

(1) After section 156 of the Taxes Act 1988 there shall be inserted the following section—

“156A Limited exemption for computer equipment.

(1) This section applies to a benefit consisting in the provision of computer
equipment if, in the case of a person (“the employee”) who is in employment
to which this Chapter applies—

(a) that equipment is provided by being made available to the employee
or to a member of his family or household;

(b) it is so made available without any transfer of property in the
equipment to the employee or to a member of his family or household;
and

(c) it is so made available in a case in which the arrangements for
providing employees of the employer with the benefit of computer
equipment comply with subsection (2) below.

(2) The arrangements for providing the employees of the employer with the
benefit of computer equipment comply with this subsection unless—

(a) the only arrangements for making computer equipment available
to such employees, or to members of their families or households,
are arrangements that are confined to cases where the employee in
question is a director of a company; or

(b) the arrangements (taking them all together) for making computer
equipment available to employees of the employer, or to members
of their families or households, are such that it is made available on
terms that are more favourable in some or all of the cases where the
employee in question is a director of a company than in one or more
cases where he is not.

(3) Section 154 applies for any year of assessment to—


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/12

28 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(a) the benefits to which this section applies that are provided in that year
and consist in the making available to the employee of any equipment,
and

(b) the benefits to which this section applies that are provided in that
year and consist in the making available to members of his family or
household of any equipment,

to the extent only that the amount which (disregarding this section) would
be taken to be the aggregate cash equivalent of the benefits falling within
paragraphs (a) and (b) above exceeds £500.

(4) For the purposes of this section “computer equipment” includes printers,
scanners, modems, discs and other peripheral devices designed to be used by
being connected to or inserted in a computer.

(5) In this section references to making computer equipment available—

(a) include references to the provision, together with any computer
equipment made available, of a right to use computer software; but

(b) do not include references to the provision of a benefit consisting in
access to, or the use of, any public telecommunication system (within
the meaning of the ™**Telecommunications Act 1984).”

(2) In section 154(2) of that Act, for “and 155A” there shall be substituted “, 155A and
156A .

(3) This section applies for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations
M24 1984 c.12.

46 PRP and agricultural pay.

(1) An application made at any time on or after 28th July 1998 for the registration of
a profit-related pay scheme shall not be required to contain, or to have contained,
any such undertaking as is mentioned in section 175(1)(c) of the Taxes Act 1988
(undertaking to satisfy minimum wage legislation without taking account of profit-
related pay).

(2) In section 178(1) of the Taxes Act 1988, paragraph (d) (cancellation on grounds of
non-compliance with a section 175(1)(c) undertaking) shall be omitted.

(3) Subsection (2) above has effect in relation only to failures to comply taking place on
or after 28th July 1998; but it shall be deemed so to have had effect at all times on
or after that date.

[*47  Cars available for private use.

(1) Schedule 6 to the Taxes Act 1988 (cars available for private use: cash equivalent of
car) shall be amended as follows.

(2) In paragraph 2(1) (reduction for business travel: 18,000 miles and above)—
(a) for “in the year concerned” substitute “ in a year ”, and


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1984/12

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 29
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(b) for “the amount ascertained under paragraph 1 above, reduced by two thirds”
substitute “ 15 per cent. of the price of the car as regards the year .

(3) In paragraph 2(2) (reduction for business travel: 2,500 to 18,000 miles)—
(a) for “in the year concerned” substitute “ in a year ”, and

(b) for “the amount ascertained under paragraph 1 above, reduced by one third”
substitute “ 25 per cent. of the price of the car as regards the year .

(4) For paragraph 4(a) (two or more cars) substitute—

“(a) paragraph 2(1) above shall have effect as if for “15 per cent.” there
were substituted “25 per cent.””

(5) In paragraph 5 (reduction for age of car), for “one third” substitute *“ one quarter ”.

(6) This section has effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment. ]

Textual Amendments
F3  S. 47 repealed (28.7.2000 with effect as mentioned in Sch. 40 Pt. II(3) Note of the amending Act) by
2000 c. 17, s. 156, Sch. 40 Pt. I1(3)

48 Provision and support of bus services.

(1) In Chapter IV of Part V of the Taxes Act 1988 (provisions relating to the Schedule E
charge: exemptions and deductions), after section 197A insert—

“197AA Works bus services.

(1) There is no charge to tax under section 154 (taxable benefits: general charging
provision) in respect of the provision for employees of a works bus service.

(2) A “works bus service” means a service provided by means of a bus for
conveying employees of one or more employers on qualifying journeys.

(3) For the purposes of this section—

“bus” means a road passenger vehicle with a seating capacity of
12 or more; and
“qualifying journey”, in relation to an employee, means a
journey—
(a) between his home and workplace, or
(b) between one workplace and another,

in connection with the performance of the duties of the
employment.

(4) The exemption conferred by this section is subject to the following
conditions—
(a) the service must be available generally to employees of the employer
(or each employer) concerned;
(b) the main use of the service must be for qualifying journeys by those
employees.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/17
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/17/section/156
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/17/schedule/40/part/II/3

30 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(5) The exemption is also subject to substantial compliance with the condition
that the service must be used only by the employees for whom it is provided
or their children.

For this purpose “children” includes stepchildren and illegitimate
children but does not include children aged 18 or over.

(6) If under this section there is no charge to tax under section 154 (or would be
no charge if the employee were in employment to which Chapter II of Part V
applies), there is no charge to tax under section 141 (non-cash vouchers) in
respect of a voucher evidencing the employee’s entitlement to use the service.

(7) In this section—

“employment” includes an office and related expressions have a
corresponding meaning; and

“workplace” means a place at which the employee’s attendance is
necessary in the performance of the duties of the employment.

(8) For the purposes of this section the seating capacity of a vehicle is determined
in the same way as for the purposes of Part III of Schedule 1 to the “**Vehicle
Excise and Registration Act 1994 (vehicle excise duty on buses), whether or
not the vehicle is a bus within the meaning of that Part.

197AB Support for public transport road services.

(1) There is no charge to tax under section 154 (taxable benefits: general charging
provision) in respect of financial or other support for a public transport road
service used by employees of one or more employers for qualifying journeys.

(2) For this purpose—
“public transport road service” means a public passenger transport
service provided by means of a road vehicle; and
“qualifying journey”, in relation to an employee, means a
journey—
(a) between his home and workplace, or
(b) between one workplace and another,

in connection with the performance of the duties of the
employment.

(3) The exemption conferred by this section is subject to the following
conditions—

(a) the terms on which the service is available to the employees referred
to in subsection (1) above must not be more favourable than those
available to other passengers;

(b) the service must be available generally to employees of the employer
(or each employer) concerned.

(4) In this section—
“employment” includes an office and related expressions have a
corresponding meaning; and
“workplace” means a place at which the employee’s attendance is
necessary in the performance of the duties of the employment.”



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 31
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) This section has effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations
M25 1994 c.22.

49 Provision of motor cycle or cycle parking facilities.

(1) The provisions listed below (which provide for exemption from tax in relation to the
provision of car parking spaces) apply in relation to—

(a) motor cycle parking spaces, and
(b) facilities for parking cycles,
as they apply in relation to car parking spaces.

(2) The provisions referred to above are—
section 141(6A) of the Taxes Act 1988 (use of non-cash voucher to obtain use
of parking space);
section 142(3A) of that Act (use of credit-token to obtain use of parking space);
section 155(1A) of that Act (taxable benefits: general charge excluded in relation
to provision of parking space); and
section 197A of that Act (charge on emoluments excluded in relation to
expenditure in connection with provision of parking space).

(3) In subsection (1) above—
“motor cycle” has the meaning given by section 185(1) of the ¥*Road
Traffic Act 1988, and

“cycle” has the meaning given by section 192(1) of that Act.

(4) The provisions of this section have effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years
of assessment.

Modifications etc. (not altering text)

C1  S.49(1) applied (6.4.2001 with effect as mentioned in reg. 1(2) of S.I1. 2001/597) by S.R. 1979/186,
reg. 19, Sch. 1ZC Pt. V para. 3 (as inserted 6.4.2001 with effect as mentioned in reg. 1(2) of S.I.
2001/597) by S.I. 2001/597, reg. 11, Sch. 2
S. 49(1) applied (6.4.2001 with effect as mentioned in reg. 1(1) of the amending S.I.) by S.I.
2001/1004, regs. 1, 26, Sch. 3 Pt. V para. 3

Marginal Citations
M26 1988 c.52.

50 Cycles and cyclist’s safety equipment.

(1) In Chapter IV of Part V of the Taxes Act 1988 (provisions relating to the Schedule
E charge: exemptions and deductions), after section 197AB (inserted by section 48
above) insert—


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1994/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1999/16/section/49/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/597
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1979/186
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1979/186/regulation/19
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisr/1979/186/schedule/1ZC/part/V/paragraph/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/597
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/597
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/597
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/597/regulation/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/597/schedule/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1999/16/section/49/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1004
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1004
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1004/regulation/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1004/regulation/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/1004/schedule/3/part/V/paragraph/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1988/52

32 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

“197AC Provision of cycle or cyclist’s safety equipment.

(1) There is no charge to tax under section 154 (taxable benefits: general charging
provision) in respect of the provision for an employee of—

(a) acycle, or
(b) cyclist’s safety equipment,
without any transfer of the property in the cycle or equipment.

(2) In this section “cycle” has the meaning given by section 192(1) of the Road
Traffic Act 1988, and “cyclist” has a corresponding meaning.

(3) The exemption conferred by subsection (1) above is subject to the condition
that the benefit or facility in question must be available generally to employees
of the employer concerned.

(4) The exemption is also subject to the condition that the employee must use the
cycle or safety equipment mainly for qualifying journeys.
For this purpose “qualifying journey”, in relation to an employee,
means a journey—
(a) between his home and workplace, or
(b) between one workplace and another,

in connection with the performance of the duties of the
employment.

(5) If under this section there is no charge to tax under section 154 (or would be
no charge if the employee were in employment to which Chapter II of Part V
applies), there is no charge to tax under section 141 (non-cash vouchers) in
respect of a voucher evidencing the employee’s entitlement to use the cycle
or safety equipment in question.

(6) In this section—
“employment” includes an office and related expressions shall be
construed accordingly; and

“workplace” means a place at which the employee’s attendance is
necessary in the performance of the duties of the employment.”

(3) The provisions of this section have effect for the year 1999-00 and subsequent years
of assessment.

Textual Amendments
F4  S.50(2) repealed (22.3.2001 with effect as mentioned in s. 579(1) of the amending Act) by 2001 c. 2,
s. 580, Sch. 4


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1999/16/section/50/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2001/2/section/579/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2001/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2001/2/section/580
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2001/2/schedule/4

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 33
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Members of parliaments and assemblies

51 EU travel expenses.

(1) In section 200 of the Taxes Act 1988 (expenses of Members of Parliament), in
subsection (2), for the words from “the cost of” to “Strasbourg” substitute “ EU travel
expenses ” and after that subsection insert—

“(3) For the purposes of subsection (2) above “EU travel expenses” are the cost
of, and any additional expenses incurred in, travelling between the United
Kingdom and—

(a) any European Union institution in Brussels, Luxembourg or
Strasbourg, or

(b) the national parliament of another member State.”.

(2) This section has effect in relation to sums paid on or after 1st April 1999.

52 Scottish Parliament and devolved assemblies.

(1) Schedule 5 to this Act, which makes amendments the effect of which is—

(a) to treat members of the Scottish Parliament, the National Assembly for Wales
and the Northern Ireland Assembly in the same way, for tax purposes, as
members of Parliament, and

(b) to treat certain office holders under the “*’Scotland Act 1998, the
M3Government of Wales Act 1998 and the M**Northern Ireland Act 1998 in
the same way, for tax purposes, as holders of ministerial and other offices,

shall have effect.

(2) The amendments made by that Schedule have effect for the year 1999-00 and
subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations
M27 1998 c.46.
M28 1998 c.38.
M29 1998 c.47.

Sub-contractors in the construction industry

53 Exemption certificates.

(1) Sections 562 to 565 of the Taxes Act 1988 (exemption certificates for the scheme
for sub-contractors in the construction industry) shall have effect in relation to any
application to which this section applies, and shall be deemed always to have had
effect in relation to such an application—

(a) with the substitution of the subsection set out in subsection (2) below for the
subsection (2B) inserted in section 562 by paragraph 4(3) of Schedule 27 to
the ™'Finance Act 1995 (which defined the payments to be taken into account
in assessing turnover for the purposes of exemption); and

(b) as if paragraphs 3 to 5 of Schedule 8 to the 'Finance Act 1998 (which
extended the description of payments for certain cases) had not been enacted.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/38
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/47

34 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) That subsection is as follows—

“(2B) In subsection (2A) above “relevant payments” means payments under
contracts relating to, or to the work of individuals participating in the carrying
out of, any operations which—

(a) are of a description specified in subsection (2) of section 567; but
(b) are not of a description specified in subsection (3) of that section,

other than so much of the payments as represents the direct cost to the person
receiving the payments of materials used or to be used in carrying out the
operations in question.”

(3) This section applies to any application for the issue or renewal of a certificate under
section 561 of the Taxes Act 1988 which is or has been made with respect to any
period beginning on or after 1st August 1999.

Marginal Citations
M30 1995 c.4.
M31 1998 c.36.

Reverse premiums

54 Tax treatment of reverse premiums.
(1) Schedule 6 to this Act (tax treatment of receipts by way of reverse premium) has effect.

(2) The provisions of that Schedule apply in relation to a reverse premium (within the
meaning of that Schedule) received on or after 9th March 1999, unless it is a payment
or other benefit to which the recipient was entitled immediately before that date.

(3) In determining whether a payment or benefit was one to which the recipient was
entitled immediately before 9th March 1999, no account shall be taken of any
arrangements made on or after that date.

Charities

55 Gifts in kind to charities etc.

(1) The following section shall be inserted after section 83 of the Taxes Act 1988—

“83A Gifts in kind to charities etc.

(1) This section applies where a person carrying on a trade, profession or vocation
gives an article falling within subsection (2) below to—

(a) a charity within the meaning of section 506, or
(b) abody listed in section 507(1).

(2) An article falls within this subsection if—

(a) itis an article manufactured, or of a class or description sold, by the
donor in the course of his trade; or


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/36

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 35
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(b) itis an article used by the donor in the course of his trade, profession
or vocation which for the purposes of Part II of the 1990 Act
constitutes machinery or plant used by him wholly or partly in the
course of that trade, profession or vocation.

(3) Subject to subsection (4) below, where this section applies in the case of the
gift of an article—
(a) no amount shall be required, in consequence of the donor’s disposal
of that article from trading stock, to be brought into account for the
purposes of the Tax Acts as a trading receipt of the donor; and

(b) section 24(6) of the 1990 Act shall not require the donor to bring into
account any disposal value in respect of the article for the purposes
of that section.

(4) In any case where—

(a) relief is given under subsection (3) above in respect of the gift of an
article, and

(b) any benefit received in any chargeable period by the donor or any
person connected with him is in any way attributable to the making
of that gift,

the donor shall in respect of that chargeable period be charged to tax under
Case I or Case II of Schedule D or, if he is not chargeable to tax under either
of those Cases for that period, under Case VI of Schedule D on an amount
equal to the value of that benefit.

(5) Section 839 applies for the purposes of this section.”

(2) Section 47 of the ™?Finance Act 1998 (gifts in kind for relief in poor countries) shall
cease to have effect.

(3) Subsections (1) and (2) above have effect in relation to gifts made on or after the day
on which this Act is passed.

Marginal Citations
M32 1998 c.36.

56 Gifts of money to relieve refugee poverty.

(1) Section 48 of the Finance Act 1998 (gifts of money made for relief in poor countries)
shall be amended in accordance with subsections (2) to (4) below.

(2) In subsection (1)—

(a) in paragraph (a), for “the first designation date” there shall be substituted “
31st July 1998 7;

(b) in paragraph (b), for “one or both” there shall be substituted “ one or more .

(3) In subsection (2)—

(a) in paragraphs (a) and (b) for “designated countries or territories” there shall
be substituted “ countries or territories designated for the purposes of this
paragraph, ”’; and

(b) at the end of paragraph (b) there shall be inserted “, and


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/36

36 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(c) the relief of poverty in the case of persons from any country
or territory designated for the purposes of this paragraph who
are refugees or who have suffered displacement as a result of
organised intimidation or oppression or of war or other armed
conflict.”

(4) In subsection (9), for “this section” there shall be substituted “ paragraph (a), (b) or
(c) of subsection (2) above ™.

(5) Any order made before the passing of this Act under subsection (9) of that section
(designation of countries or territories in respect of which section 48 has effect) shall
have effect as if made for the purposes only of subsection (2)(a) and (b) of that section.

(6) Any notification given for the purposes of that section, in relation to a charity, before
the passing of this Act shall be treated as a notification given for the purposes of that
section as amended by this section.

(7) This section has effect in relation to gifts made on or after 6th April 1999.

(8) An order made under subsection (9) of that section for the purposes of subsection (2)
(¢) (as inserted by subsection (3)(b) above) may have effect retrospectively in relation
to such times falling on or after that date as may be specified in the order.

57 Aggregation of money gifts for relief in poor countries.

(1) Section 48 of the ™’ Finance Act 1998 (gifts of money made for relief in poor
countries) shall have effect, and be deemed always to have had effect, with the
following amendments.

(2) In subsection (4) (aggregated small gifts to be treated as a single payment made at the
time of the last of them), after “that section” there shall be inserted * (but subject to
subsection (4A) below) .

(3) After that subsection there shall be inserted the following subsection—

“(4A) Subsection (10) of section 25 of the "**Finance Act 1990 (receipts of gifts by
a charity to be treated as payments of grossed-up amounts after deduction of
basic rate income tax) shall have effect where—

(a) any aggregated gifts are treated under this section as a single
qualifying donation made to a charity, and

(b) the aggregated gifts include gifts made in different years of
assessment,

as if that single qualifying donation had been received by the charity in the
year of assessment in which the first of the aggregated gifts was made and as if
that were the relevant year of assessment for the purposes of that subsection.”

Marginal Citations
M33 1998 c.36.
M34 1990 c.29.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/36
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1990/29

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 37
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Education and training

58 Employees seconded to educational establishments.

(1) Section 86 of the Taxes Act 1988 (employees seconded to charities and educational
establishments) shall be amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (3) (relief for expenditure attributable to the employment before 1st April
1997 of employees seconded to educational establishments), the words “and before
Ist April 1997” shall be omitted.

(3) In that subsection, for paragraphs (a) to (c) there shall be substituted—
“(a) in England and Wales, any body falling within subsection (4) below;
(b) in Scotland, any body falling within subsection (5) below;

(c) in Northern Ireland, any body falling within subsection (6) below;
and”.

(4) After subsection (3) there shall be inserted—

“(4) A body falls within this subsection if it is—
(a) alocal education authority;

(b) an educational institution maintained or otherwise supported by
such an authority (including a grant-maintained school or a grant-
maintained special school within the meaning of the “*Education Act
1996);

(¢) anindependent school, within the meaning of the Education Act 1996,
whose registration under section 465 of that Act is final; or

(d) an institution within the further education sector, or the higher
education sector, within the meaning of the “*Further and Higher
Education Act 1992.

(5) A body falls within this subsection if it is—
(a) an education authority;

(b) aneducational establishment managed by such an authority within the
meaning of the "*Education (Scotland) Act 1980 (“the 1980 Act”);

(c) apublic or grant-aided school within the meaning of the 1980 Act;

(d) aself-governing school within the meaning of the "*Self-Governing
Schools etc. (Scotland) Act 1989;

(e) an independent school within the meaning of the 1980 Act;

(f) a central institution within the meaning of the 1980 Act;

(g2) an institution within the higher education sector within the meaning
of section 56(2) of the *Further and Higher Education (Scotland)
Act 1992; or

(h) acollege of further education within the meaning of section 36(1) of
that Act.

(6) A body falls within this subsection if it is—
(a) an education or library board within the meaning of the Y*’Education
and Libraries (Northern Ireland) Order 1986;
(b) a college of education or a controlled, maintained, grant-maintained
integrated, controlled integrated, voluntary or independent school
within the meaning of that Order; or



38 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(c) an institution of further education within the meaning of the
M4Eurther Education (Northern Ireland) Order 1997.”

(5) The amendment made by subsection (2) above shall be deemed always to have had
effect.

(6) The amendments made by subsections (3) and (4) above have effect for the year
1999-00 and subsequent years of assessment.

Marginal Citations

M35 1996 c.56.

M36 1992 c.13.

M37 1980 c.44.

M38 1989 c.39.

M39 1992 c.37.

M40 S.1. 1986/594 (N.I. 3.
M41 S.1.1997/1772 (N.L. 15.

59 Phasing out of vocational training relief.

(1) For subsection (2) of section 32 of the Y*Finance Act 1991 (vocational training relief)
there shall be substituted—

“(2) The individual shall be entitled to relief under this subsection in respect of the
payment for the year of assessment in which it is made; but relief under this
subsection shall be given only on a claim made for the purpose, except where
subsections (3) to (5) below apply.

(2A) Where an individual is entitled to relief under subsection (2) above in respect
of any payment made in a year of assessment, the amount of his liability for
that year to income tax on his total income shall be the amount to which he
would be liable apart from this section less whichever is the smaller of—

(a) the amount which is equal to such percentage of the amount of the
payment as is the basic rate for the year; and
(b) the amount which reduces his liability to nil.

(2B) In determining for the purposes of subsection (2A) above the amount of
income tax to which a person would be liable apart from this section, no
account shall be taken of—

(a) any income tax reduction under Chapter I of Part VII of the Taxes Act
1988 or under section 347B of that Act;

(b) any income tax reduction under section 353(1A) of the Taxes Act
1988;

(c) any relief by way of a reduction of liability to tax which is given
in accordance with any arrangements having effect by virtue of
section 788 of the Taxes Act 1988 or by way of a credit under
section 790(1) of that Act;

(d) any tax at the basic rate on so much of that person’s income as is
income the income tax on which he is entitled to charge against any
other person or to deduct, retain or satisfy out of any payment.”


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/56
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/13
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/44
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1989/39
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/37
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/594
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/1772

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 39
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(2) That section and section 33 of that Act (provisions supplementary to section 32) shall
cease to have effect.

(3) In this section—

(a) subsection (1) has effect in relation to payments made on or after 6th April
1999; and

(b) subsection (2) shall have effect in relation to payments made on or after such
date after 6th April 2000 as the Treasury may by order appoint.

Subordinate Legislation Made
P2 S.59(3)(b) power fully exercised: 1.9.2000 appointed by S.I. 2000/2004, art. 2

Marginal Citations
M42 1991 c.31

60 Student loans: certain interest to be disregarded.

The following section shall be inserted after section 331 of the Taxes Act 1988—

“331A Student loans: certain interest to be disregarded.

(1) 1f—
(a) a loan is made to a person under any of the relevant student loan
provisions,
(b) an amount is recovered from him in respect of the loan,
(c) an amount is repaid to him in respect of the amount recovered, and
(d) interest is paid to him in respect of the amount repaid,
the interest shall be disregarded for all purposes of income tax.

(2) For the purposes of subsection (1) above the relevant student loan provisions
are—

(a) section 22 of the ™ Teaching and Higher Education Act 1998;
(b) section 73(f) of the ™*Education (Scotland) Act 1980;

(c) Article 3 of the " Education (Student Support) (Northern Ireland)
Order 1998.”

Marginal Citations
M43 1998 ¢.30
M44 1980 c.44
M45 S.1. 1998/1760 (N.I. 14).


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/2004
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2000/2004/article/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1991/31
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/30
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1980/44
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1998/1760

40 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Various other reliefs etc.

61 Class 1B National Insurance contributions.

(1) In section 617 of the Taxes Act 1988 (social security benefits and contributions), in
subsection (4), for “or Class 1A contribution” there shall be substituted “, a Class 1A
contribution or a Class 1B contribution ™.

(2) Subsection (1) above has effect in relation to contributions paid on or after 6th April
1999.

62 Expenditure on film production and acquisition.

In subsection (2)(a) of section 48 of ™*the Finance (No. 2) Act 1997 (which provides
for favourable tax treatment for certain expenditure on film production and acquisition
incurred on or after 2nd July 1997 and before 2nd July 2000), for “2nd July 2000”
there shall be substituted *“ 2nd July 2002 .

Marginal Citations
M46 1997 c.58.

63 Treatment of transfer fees under existing contracts.

(1) Subject to subsection (2) below, where—

(a) acontractis or has been entered into by a football or other sports club to secure
the services of a player; and

(b) the contract is or was entered into before the beginning of the first accounting
period of the club in relation to which a relevant financial reporting standard
has effect (whether by virtue of the adoption of the standard by the club or
otherwise),

nothing in the standard shall be taken to affect the manner in which any fee required
to be paid by the club under the contract may be taken into account in computing the
club’s profits to be charged under Case I of Schedule D.

(2) Subsection (1) above shall not apply if the club so elects by a notice given to an officer
of the Board within the period of two years beginning immediately after the accounting
period described in subsection (1)(b) above.

(3) The relevant financial reporting standards are—
(a) Financial Reporting Standard 10 issued by the Accounting Standards Board
on 4th December 1997; and

(b) Financial Reporting Standard for Smaller Entities issued by that Board on
10th December 1998.

(4) All such adjustments shall be made (whether by way of assessment, amendment of
an assessment, repayment of tax or otherwise) as may be necessary to give effect to
the provisions of this section.

(5) Subsection (4) above has effect notwithstanding any time limits relating to the making
or amendment of an assessment for any accounting period.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1997/58

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 41
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

Settlements

64 Income of unmarried child of settlor.

(1) In section 660B(1) of the Taxes Act 1988 (circumstances in which income arising
under settlement treated as that of settlor), before “is paid to or for the benefit of an
unmarried minor child of the settlor” insert “ (a) ”” and after those words insert—

(13

, Or
(b) would otherwise be treated (apart from this section) as income of an
unmarried minor child of the settlor,”.

(2) In subsection (3) of that section (meaning of available retained or accumulated
income), for paragraphs (a) and (b) substitute—
“(a) treated as income of the settlor, or
(b) paid (whether as income or capital) to or for the benefit of, or
otherwise treated as the income of, a beneficiary other than an
unmarried minor child of the settlor, or

(bb) treated as the income of an unmarried minor child of the settlor, and
subject to tax, in any of the years 1995-96, 1996-97 or 1997-98, or”.

(3) After that subsection insert—

“(3A) For the purposes of subsection (3)(bb) above—

(a) the amount of a child’s income that is subject to tax in a year of
assessment is the amount (“the taxable amount”) by which the child’s
total income for income tax purposes exceeds the aggregate amount
of allowances that may be set against it; and

(b) income arising under the settlement that is treated as income of the
child is subject to tax to the extent that it does not exceed the taxable
amount.

In this subsection “allowance” includes any deduction allowed against total
income.”.

(4) For subsection (5) of that section substitute—

“(5) If in any year of assessment the aggregate amount of a child’s relevant
settlement income does not exceed £100, subsection (1) does not apply in
relation to that income.

A child’s ’relevant settlement income’ means income paid to or for the
benefit of, or otherwise treated as income of, that child which apart from this
subsection would be treated as income of the settlor under subsection (1).”.

(5) The amendment in subsection (1) above has effect in relation to—

(a) income arising under a settlement made or entered into on or after 9th March
1999, and

(b) income arising under a settlement made or entered into before that date so far
as it arises directly or indirectly from funds provided on or after that date;

and the amendment in subsection (4) above has effect accordingly.

Any apportionment required for the purposes of paragraph (b) shall be made on a just
and reasonable basis.



42 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(6) The amendments in subsections (2) and (3) above have effect in relation to any
payment within subsection (2) of section 660B of the Taxes Act 1988 made on or after
9th March 1999.

In relation to such a payment those amendments apply whenever the facts mentioned
in subsection (3) of that section occurred.

(7) In section 660E of the Taxes Act 1988 (application of provisions to settlements by two
or more settlors), in subsection (3) (which refers to section 660B) for the words from
“in relation to” to “child of the settlor” substitute “ in relation to a child of the settlor ”.

Securities and investments

65 Relevant discounted securities.

(1) In paragraph 3 of Schedule 13 to the ™Finance Act 1996 (meaning of “relevant
discounted security”), for sub-paragraph (1) there shall be substituted the following
sub-paragraphs—

“(1) Subject to the following provisions of this paragraph and paragraph 14(1)
below, in this Schedule “relevant discounted security” means any security
which (whenever issued) is such that, taking the security as at the time of
its issue, the amount payable on redemption—

(a) on maturity, or

(b) inthe case of a security of which there may be a redemption before
maturity, on at least one of the occasions on which it may be
redeemed,

is or would be an amount involving a deep gain, or might be an amount
which would involve a deep gain.

(1A) The occasions that are to be taken into account for the purpose of
determining whether a security is a relevant discounted security by virtue of
sub-paragraph (1)(b) above shall not include any of the following occasions
on which it may be redeemed, that is to say—

(a) any occasion not falling within sub-paragraph (1C) below on
which there may be a redemption otherwise than at the option of
the person who holds the security;

(b) in a case where a redemption may occur as a result of the exercise
of an option that is exercisable—
(1) only on the occurrence of an event adversely affecting the
holder, or
(i1) only on the occurrence of a default by any person,
any occasion on which that option is unlikely (judged as at the time
of the security’s issue) to be exercisable;

but nothing in this sub-paragraph shall require an occasion on which a security
may be redeemed to be disregarded by reason only that it is or may be an
occasion that coincides with an occasion mentioned in this sub-paragraph.

(1B) In sub-paragraph (1A) above “event adversely affecting the holder”, in
relation to a security, means an event which (judged as at the time of the
security’s issue) is such that, if it occurred and there were no provision for



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 43
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

redemption, the interests of the person holding the security at the time of
the event would be likely to be adversely affected.

(1C) An occasion on which there may be a redemption of a security falls within
this sub-paragraph if—
(a) the security is a security issued to a person connected with the
issuer; or
(b) the obtaining of a tax advantage by any person is the main benefit,
or one of the main benefits, that might have been expected to accrue
from the provision in accordance with which it may be redeemed
on that occasion.

(1D) In sub-paragraph (1C) above “tax advantage” has the meaning given by
section 709(1) of the Taxes Act 1988.

(1E) Subject to sub-paragraph (1F) below, where a security which is not a
relevant discounted security but which would have been such a security if
it had been issued to a person connected with the issuer—

(a) is acquired by a person who is so connected, or
(b) is held by a person who becomes so connected,

this Schedule shall have effect, in relation to times falling at or after the
time of the acquisition or, as the case may be, the time when that person
became so connected, as if the security were a relevant discounted security.

(1F) Where a security which—
(a) is arelevant discounted security, but

(b) would not be such a security but for sub-paragraph (1C)(a) or (1E)
above,

is acquired by a person who is not connected with the issuer, this Schedule
shall have effect, in relation to that person, as if the security ceased to be a
relevant discounted security at the time of the acquisition.”

(2) After sub-paragraph (2) of that paragraph there shall be inserted the following
sub-paragraphs—

“(2A) Nothing in sub-paragraph (2)(c) above shall prevent a security that would have
been a relevant discounted security if it had been issued to a person connected
with the issuer from being treated as a relevant discounted security by virtue
of sub-paragraph (1E) above.

(2B) Nothing in sub-paragraph (2)(f) above shall prevent a security from being
treated as a relevant discounted security by virtue of sub-paragraph (1C)(a)
or (1E) above.”

(3) Sub-paragraph (5) of that paragraph shall cease to have effect.

(4) After sub-paragraph (6) of that paragraph there shall be inserted the following
sub-paragraphs—

“(7) Section 839 of the Taxes Act 1988 (connected persons) applies for the
purposes of this paragraph.

(8) In determining for the purposes of sub-paragraph (1C), (1E), (1F) or (2A)
above whether a person is or becomes connected with the issuer, no account
shall be taken of—



44 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(a) the security mentioned in that sub-paragraph; or
(b) any security issued under the same prospectus as that security.”

(5) In paragraph 10 of that Schedule (issue of securities in separate tranches), after sub-
paragraph (3) there shall be inserted the following sub-paragraph—

“(4) For the purpose of determining whether a security held by a person who is
not connected with the issuer is a relevant discounted security by virtue of
this paragraph, a security which—

(a) is arelevant discounted security, but

(b) would not be such a security but for paragraph 3(1C)(a) or (1E)
above,

shall be assumed not to be a security falling within sub-paragraph (1)(b)
above.”

(6) In paragraph 13 of that Schedule (excluded indexed securities), after sub-paragraph (8)
there shall be inserted the following sub-paragraph—

“(9) In this paragraph references to redemption, in relation to a security, do not
include references to redemption of the security on any such occasion as, by
reason of sub-paragraph (1A) of paragraph 3 above, is not to be taken into
account for the purpose of determining whether the security is a relevant
discounted security by virtue of sub-paragraph (1)(b) of that paragraph.”

(7) In section 92 of that Act, after subsection (6) there shall be inserted the following
subsections—

“(7) Where an asset representing a creditor relationship of a company—
(a) ceases at any time to be an asset to which this section applies, but

(b) does not cease at that time to represent a creditor relationship of that
company,

the company shall be deemed for the purposes of the M*Taxation of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992 and this Chapter to have disposed of the asset
immediately before that time for the relevant consideration, and to have re-
acquired it immediately after that time for the relevant consideration.

(8) Any deemed disposal and re-acquisition under subsection (7) above shall be
treated for the purposes of that Act of 1992 as a transaction in the case of
which—

(a) sections 127 to 130 of that Act would apply, apart from the provisions
of section 116 of that Act, by virtue of any provision of Chapter Il of
Part IV of that Act;

(b) the asset in question represents both the original shares and the new
holding for the purposes of those sections;

(c) the market value of the asset at the time of the transaction is an amount
equal to the relevant consideration.

(9) Subject to subsection (10) below, in subsections (7) and (8) above “the
relevant consideration”, in relation to an asset, means the amount that would
have been taken, in accordance with the relevant accounting method, to be the
value of the asset at the time of its deemed disposal if that method had been
applied to the asset for tax purposes at all times until then.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 45
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(10) Subsection (5) above shall not apply in the case of a deemed disposal and
re-acquisition under subsection (7) above; but the amount of the relevant
consideration in such a case shall be treated for the purposes of the Taxation
of Chargeable Gains Act 1992 as reduced by so much (if any) of the amount
mentioned in subsection (9) above as is referable to interest which—

(a) 1is not paid or payable to the company before the time of the deemed
disposal; but

(b) isinterest falling to be brought into account under subsections (2) and
(3) above as having accrued before that time.

(11) In subsection (9) above “the relevant accounting method”, in relation to an
asset representing a creditor relationship of a company, means the accounting
method which, for the accounting period of that company in which the deemed
re-acquisition takes place, is used as respects that asset and the part of that
accounting period beginning with the deemed re-acquisition.”

(8) Subject to subsections (9) to (12) below, subsections (1) to (7) above have effect in
relation to—

(a) any transfer of a security on or after 15th February 1999; or

(b) any occasion on or after that date on which a person holding a security
becomes entitled to any payment on its redemption.

(9) For the purposes of section 92 of that Act, subsections (1) to (7) above—

(a) have effect in relation to any accounting period of a company ending on or
after 15th February 1999; but

(b) do not affect any amount falling to be brought into account in respect of any
disposal (in whole or in part) of an asset representing a creditor relationship
if the disposal was one completed before that day.

(10) For the purposes of paragraphs 17 and 18 of Schedule 9 to that Act, subsections (1)
to (7) above—
(a) have effect in relation to any accounting period of a company ending on or
after 15th February 1999; but

(b) do not affect any amount falling to be brought into account in respect of a
security representing a debtor relationship of a company if, on that day, the
company was no longer subject to any liability under the relationship.

(11) For the purposes of sections 117(2AA) and 251(8) of the *Taxation of Chargeable
Gains Act 1992, subsections (1) to (7) above have effect in relation to any disposal (in
whole or in part) of an asset on or after 15th February 1999.

(12) For the purposes of subsection (1)(c) of section 254 of that Act (which,
notwithstanding its repeal by the ™'Finance Act 1998, continues to have effect in
relation to loans made before 17th March 1998), subsections (1) to (7) above have
effect in relation to any claim made on or after 15th February 1999.

Marginal Citations
M47 1996 c.8.
M48 1992 c.12.
M49 1992 c.12.
M5S0 1998 c.36.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1998/36

46 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

66 Qualifying corporate bonds: provision consequential on s. 65.

(1) This section applies where—
(a) before 15th February 1999 there occurred a transaction (“the relevant
transaction”) to which sections 127 to 130 of the Taxation of Chargeable Gains
Act 1992 applied; and
(b) the new holding (within the meaning given by section 126 of that Act)
consisted of or included something (“the new asset’) that—
(1) did not fall to be treated as a qualifying corporate bond in relation to
the relevant transaction, but
(i1) by virtue of section 65 above, does fall to be so treated in relation to
a disposal on or after 15th February 1999.

(2) Section 116 of the Taxation of Chargeable Gains Act 1992 (reorganisations
etc. involving qualifying corporate bonds) shall have effect in relation to any disposal
of the whole or part of the new asset on or after 15th February 1999 as if—

(a) there had been a transaction (“the subsequent transaction”) by which the
person holding the new asset had disposed of it and immediately re-acquired
it;

(b) the subsequent transaction had occurred at the time mentioned in
subsection (3) below;

(c) the asset re-acquired had been a qualifying corporate bond; and

(d) the subsequent transaction had been a transaction to which section 127 of that
Act would have applied but for section 116(5) of that Act.

(3) That time is—
(a) where the relevant transaction took place before Sth April 1996, that date;

(b) where the relevant transaction took place on or after that date, immediately
after the relevant transaction.

67 Deep discount and deep gain securities.

(1) In paragraph 19 of Schedule 15 to the “'Finance Act 1996 (loan relationships:
savings and transitional provisions), after sub-paragraph (3) there shall be inserted the
following sub-paragraph—

“(3A) Any income that is treated as arising at the time mentioned in subsection (5)
of that section, as it applies by virtue of sub-paragraph (3) above, shall be
brought into account as a non-trading credit given for the purposes of this
Chapter for the accounting period in which that time falls.”

(2) In paragraph 20 of that Schedule, after sub-paragraph (2) there shall be inserted the
following sub-paragraph—

“(2A) Any income that is treated as arising on the day mentioned in subsection (5)
of that section, as it applies by virtue of sub-paragraph (2) above, shall be
brought into account as a non-trading credit given for the purposes of this
Chapter for the accounting period in which that day falls.”

(3) In paragraph 19(7) of that Schedule, for paragraph (b) there shall be substituted the
following paragraph—

“(b) the company did not make any disposal of that security on that date,”.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 47
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(4) In subsection (5)(c) of sections 64 and 65 of the “"Finance Act 1993 (which have
effect, notwithstanding their repeal by the Finance Act 1996, in relation to deep
discount and deep gain securities held on and after 31st March 1996), for “it is
transferred by the creditor company” there shall be substituted “ the creditor company
makes a disposal of the security ”.

(5) After subsection (5) of section 65 of that Act there shall be inserted the following
subsection—

“(5A) There is a disposal of a security for the purposes of subsection (5)(c) above
if there would be such a disposal for the purposes of the ™*Taxation of
Chargeable Gains Act 1992.”

(6) Subsections (1) and (2) above apply in relation to income treated as arising on or after
15th February 1999.

(7) Subsection (3) above applies in any case where the day mentioned in paragraph 19(9)
of Schedule 15 to the Finance Act 1996 falls on or after 15th February 1999.

(8) Subsections (4) and (5) above apply for determining whether a time on or after 15th
February 1999—

(a) is atime falling within section 64(5)(c) of the Finance Act 1993; or
(b) is on a day falling within section 65(5)(c) of that Act.

Marginal Citations

M51 1996 c.8.
M52 1993 c.34.
MS53 1992 c.12.
68 Court common investment funds.

(1) After section 469 of the Taxes Act 1988 there shall be inserted the following section—

“469A Court common investment funds.

(1) The Tax Acts shall have effect in relation to any common investment fund
established under section 42 of the ™*Administration of Justice Act 1982
(common investment funds for money paid into court) as if—

(a) the fund were an authorised unit trust;

(b) the person who is for the time being the investment manager of the
fund were the trustee of that authorised unit trust; and

(c) the persons whose interests entitle them, as against the Accountant
General, to share in the fund’s investments were the unit holders in
that authorised unit trust.

(2) In this section “the Accountant General” means (subject to subsection (3)
below) the Accountant General of the Supreme Court of Judicature in England
and Wales or the Accountant General of the Supreme Court of Judicature of
Northern Ireland.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1996/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1993/34
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/12

48 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(3) Where in the case of any common investment fund a person other than the
Accountant General is authorised by the Lord Chancellor to hold shares in the
fund, the reference in subsection (1)(c) above to the Accountant General shall
include a reference to that other person.”

(2) Section 328 of the Taxes Act 1988 (agreements with the Board about the taxation
regime for common investment funds) shall cease to have effect.

(3) Subsections (1) and (2) above have effect in relation to—

(a) any income arising to a common investment fund on or after 6th April 1999;
and

(b) any distribution made by such a fund for a distribution period beginning on
or after that date.

(4) For the purposes of the Tax Acts where any common investment fund was in existence
on 5th April 1999—

(a) the distribution period of that fund which was current on that date for the
purposes of section 469 of the Taxes Act 1988 shall be taken to have ended
with that date; and

(b) the fund’s first accounting period for the purposes of corporation tax, and
its first distribution period for the purposes of the enactments relating to
authorised unit trusts, shall each be taken to have begun with 6th April 1999.

(5) In this section “common investment fund” means any common investment fund
established under section 42 of the Administration of Justice Act 1982.

Marginal Citations
M54 1982 c.53.

Venture capital trusts

69 Company restructuring and convertible securities.
(1) The Taxes Act 1988 shall be amended as follows.

(2) In Schedule 28B (requirements to be satisfied by qualifying investments of VCTs),
after paragraph 10B there shall be inserted the following paragraphs—

Acquisitions for restructuring purposes

“10C (1) This paragraph applies where—

(a) arrangements are made for a company (“the new company”) to
acquire all the shares (“old shares”) in another company (“the old
company”’);

(b) the acquisition provided for by the arrangements falls within sub-
paragraph (2) below; and

(c) the Board have, before any exchange of shares takes place under
the arrangements, given an approval notification.

(2) An acquisition of shares falls within this sub-paragraph if—


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1982/53

Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 49
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(a) the consideration for the old shares consists wholly of the issue
of shares (“new shares”) in the new company;

(b) new shares are issued in consideration of old shares only at
times when there are no issued shares in the new company
other than subscriber shares and new shares previously issued in
consideration of old shares;

(¢) the consideration for new shares of each description consists
wholly of old shares of the corresponding description; and

(d) new shares of each description are issued to the holders of old
shares of the corresponding description in respect of, and in
proportion to, their holdings.

(3) For the purposes of sub-paragraph (1)(c) above an approval notification
is one which, on an application by either the old company or the new
company, is given to the applicant company and states that the Board are
satisfied that the exchange of shares under the arrangements—

(a) will be effected for bona fide commercial reasons; and

(b) will not form part of any such scheme or arrangements as are
mentioned in section 137(1) of the 1992 Act.

(4) If the requirements of paragraph 3 above were satisfied in relation to the
old company and any old shares immediately before the beginning of the
period for giving effect to the arrangements, then (to the extent that it
would not otherwise be the case) those requirements shall be deemed to
be satisfied in relation to the new company and the matching new shares
at all times which—

(a) fall in that period; and

(b) do not fall after a time when (apart from the arrangements) those
requirements would have ceased by virtue of—

(i) sub-paragraph (4) or (5) of that paragraph, or
(i1) any cessation of a trade by any company,

to be satisfied in relation to the old company and the matching
old shares.

(5) For the purposes of paragraph 3 above the period of two years mentioned
in sub-paragraph (4) of that paragraph shall be deemed, in the case of any
new shares, to expire at the same time as it would have expired (or by
virtue of this sub-paragraph would have been deemed to expire) in the
case of the matching old shares.

(6) Subject to sub-paragraph (7) below, where—
(a) there is an exchange under the arrangements of any new shares
for any old shares, and

(b) those old shares are shares in relation to which the requirements
of paragraphs 6 and 8 above were (or were deemed to be) satistied
to any extent immediately before the exchange,

those requirements shall be deemed, at all times after that time, to be
satisfied to the same extent in relation to the matching new shares.

(7) Where there is a time following any exchange under the arrangements of
any new shares for any old shares when (apart from the arrangements) the
requirements of paragraph 6 above would have ceased under—



50 Finance Act 1999 (c. 16)
Part III — Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finance Act 1999. Any changes that have already been made by the team
appear in the content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details)

(a) sub-paragraph (2) of that paragraph, or

(b) this sub-paragraph,
to be satisfied in relation to those old shares, those requirements shall
cease at that time to be satisfied in relation to the matching new shares.

(8) For the purposes of paragraph 7 above any new shares acquired under the
arrangements shall be deemed to represent an investment which—
(a) raised the same amount of money as was raised (or, by virtue of
this sub-paragraph, is deemed to have been raised) by the issue
of the matching old shares, and

(b) raised that amount by an issue of shares in the new company made
at the time when the issue of the matching old shares took place
(or, as the case may be, is deemed to have taken place).

(9) In determining whether the requirements of paragraph 9 above are
satisfied in relation to the old company or the new company at a time in
the period for giving effect to the arrangements, both—

(a) the arrangements themselves, and

(b) any exchange of new shares for old shares that has already taken
place under the arrangements,

shall be disregarded.

(10) For the purposes of paragraph 10B above the value of the new shares,
both immediately after the time of their acquisition and immediately after
the time of any subsequent relevant event occurring by virtue of the
arrangements, shall be taken to be the same as the value, when last valued
in accordance with that paragraph, of the old shares for which they are
exchanged.

(11) Nothing in this paragraph shall deem any of the requirements of this
Schedule to be satisfied in relation to any new shares unless the matching
old shares were first issued to the trust company and have been held by
that company from the time when they were issued until they are acquired
by the new company.

(12) References in this paragraph to the period for giving effect to the
arrangements are references to the period which—
(a) Dbegins with the time when those arrangements first came into
existence; and

(b) ends with the time when the new company completes its
acquisition under the arrangements of all the old shares.

(13) If, at any time after the arrangements first came into existence and before
the new company has acquired all the old shares, the arrangements—
(a) cease to be arrangements for the acquisition of all the old shares
by the new company, or
(b) cease to be arrangements for an acquisition falling within sub-
paragraph (2) above,
this paragraph shall not deem any requirement of this Schedule to be
satisfied, and sub-paragraph (10) above shall not apply, in the case of any
new shares at any time after the arrangements have so ceased.



Finance Act 1999 (c. 16) 51
Part III - Income Tax, Corporation Tax and Capital Gains Tax
Document Generated: 2024-05-10

Status: Point in time view as at 24/07/2002.
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk
editorial team to Finan