
Serious Organised Crime and Police Act 2005 (c. 15)
SCHEDULE 16 – Remaining minor and consequential amendments (search warrants)
Document Generated: 2024-01-25

1

Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally enacted).

S C H E D U L E S

SCHEDULE 16

REMAINING MINOR AND CONSEQUENTIAL AMENDMENTS (SEARCH WARRANTS)

Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 (c. 48)
6 (1) The Copyright, Designs and Patents Act 1988 is amended as follows.

(2) In section 109 (search warrants), in subsection (3)(b), for “28 days” substitute “three
months”.

(3) In section 200 (search warrants), in subsection (3)(b), for “28 days” substitute “three
months”.

(4) In section 297B (search warrants), in subsection (3)(b), for “28 days” substitute
“three months”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1988/48

