Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects
for the Finance Act 2010, Section 14. (See end of Document for details)

Finance Act 2010

2010 CHAPTER 13

PART 1

CHARGES, RATES ETC
Other environmental taxes

14 Rates of air passenger duty

(1) In section 30 of FA 1994 (air passenger duty: rates)—

(a) in subsection (2) (journeys ending in UK or Part 1 territory), for “£11”
substitute “ £12 ” and for “£22” substitute “ £24 ”,

(b) in subsection (3) (journeys ending in Part 2 territory), for “£45” substitute
£60 ” and for “£90” substitute “ £120 ”,

(c) in subsection (4) (journeys ending in Part 3 territory), for “£50” substitute
£75 ” and for “£100” substitute “ £150 ”, and

(d) in subsection (4A) (other journeys), for “£55” substitute “ £85 ” and for
“£110” substitute “ £170 ™.

(2) The amendments made by subsection (1) have effect in relation to the carriage of
passengers beginning on or after 1 November 2010.



Finance Act 2010 (c. 13)
Document Generated: 2024-04-07

Changes to legislation:
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the Finance Act 2010, Section 14.




