
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial
team to Finance (No. 2) Act 2023. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the

content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Finance (No. 2) Act 2023
2023 CHAPTER 30

PART 6

OTHER TAXES

Environmental taxes

327 Rates of landfill tax

(1) Section 42 of FA 1996 (amount of landfill tax) is amended as follows.

(2) In subsection (1)(a) (standard rate), for “£98.60” substitute “£102.10”.

(3) In subsection (2) (reduced rate for certain disposals), in the words after paragraph (b)
—

(a) for “£98.60” substitute “£102.10”, and
(b) for “£3.15” substitute “£3.25”.

(4) The amendments made by this section have effect in relation to disposals made (or
treated as made) on or after 1 April 2023.

328 Rates of climate change levy

(1) Paragraph 42 of Schedule 6 to FA 2000 (climate change levy: amount payable by way
of levy) is amended as follows.

(2) In sub-paragraph (1), for the table substitute—

“TABLE

Taxable commodity supplied Rate at which levy payable if
supply is not a reduced-rate supply

Electricity £0.00775 per kilowatt hour



2 Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 (c. 30)
Part 6 – Other taxes

Document Generated: 2024-05-14
Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial
team to Finance (No. 2) Act 2023. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the

content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

Taxable commodity supplied Rate at which levy payable if
supply is not a reduced-rate supply

Gas supplied by a gas utility or any gas
supplied in a gaseous state that is of a kind
supplied by a gas utility

£0.00775 per kilowatt hour

Any petroleum gas, or other gaseous
hydrocarbon, supplied in a liquid state

£0.02175 per kilogram

Any other taxable commodity £0.06064 per kilogram”

(3) In sub-paragraph (1)(c) (reduced-rate supplies in respect of any taxable commodity
other than electricity or petroleum gas, or other gaseous hydrocarbon, supplied in a
liquid state), for “12” substitute “11”.

(4) In consequence of the amendment made by subsection (3), in the definition of “r” in the
Notes to paragraph 2 of Schedule 1 to the Climate Change Levy (General) Regulations
2001 (S.I. 2001/838), for “0.88” substitute “0.89”.

(5) The amendments made by this section have effect in relation to supplies treated as
taking place on or after 1 April 2024.

329 Rate of plastic packaging tax

(1) In section 45(1) of FA 2021 (rate of plastic packaging tax), for “£200” substitute
“£210.82”.

(2) The amendment made by this section has effect in relation to packaging components
produced in, or imported into, the United Kingdom on or after 1 April 2023.

330 Aggregates levy: exemptions and exploitation

(1) Part 2 of FA 2001 (aggregates levy) is amended as follows.

(2) In section 17 (meanings of “aggregate” and “taxable aggregate”)—
(a) in subsection (3)—

(i) omit paragraphs (b), (d) and (da);
(ii) omit the “or” at the end of paragraph (e);

(iii) after paragraph (f) insert  “; or
(g) it consists wholly of aggregate won by being

removed from the ground on the site of any or any
proposed structure, or the site of any or any proposed
infrastructure relating to transportation or utilities, in
the course of excavations lawfully carried out—

(i) in connection with, and necessary for,
the construction, modification, maintenance
or improvement of the structure or
infrastructure, and

(ii) not for the purpose of extracting that
aggregate.”;

(b) in subsection (4) omit paragraph (e);
(c) in subsection (7) omit the definition of “highway”.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/838


Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 (c. 30)
Part 6 – Other taxes
Document Generated: 2024-05-14

3

Changes to legislation: There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial
team to Finance (No. 2) Act 2023. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the

content and are referenced with annotations. (See end of Document for details) View outstanding changes

(3) In section 19 (commercial exploitation)—
(a) in subsection (3), in paragraph (e), for “site from which it was won” substitute

“original site by virtue of it being used for a purpose connected with winning
aggregate or other minerals from the site”;

(b) after subsection (3A) insert—

“(3B) For the purposes of subsection (3)(e), in relation to a quantity of
aggregate, “the original site” means the site from which it was won.”;

(c) for subsection (4) substitute—

“(4) Subsection (4A) applies where, at the time when any aggregate is won
from any site, a person (“P”) is in occupation for relevant purposes
of—

(a) that site, or
(b) that site and other land.

(4A) Where this subsection applies, so long as the site mentioned
in subsection (4), or that site and the other land, continue to be
occupied by P for relevant purposes, subsection (3)(e) has effect as
if—

(a) (where relevant) the reference to the land at the original site
included the other land, and

(b) the words “by virtue of it being used for a purpose connected
with winning aggregate or other minerals from the site” were
omitted.

(4B) For the purposes of subsections (4) and (4A) relevant purposes are—
(a) the purposes of the carrying on of any agricultural business,

or
(b) the purposes of the carrying on of any forestry business or

otherwise for the purposes of forestry.”

(4) In consequence of the amendments made by subsection (2), in the Aggregates Levy
(Registration and Miscellaneous Provisions) Regulations 2001 (S.I. 2001/ 4027), in
regulation 3 (unconditional exemption from registration), in paragraph (a)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (i), for “(b), (c), (d) or (da)” substitute “(c) or (g)”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (ii), for “(c), (d) or (e)” substitute “(c) or (d)”.

(5) The amendments made by this section have effect in relation to aggregate won on or
after 1 October 2023.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/4027


4 Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 (c. 30)
Document Generated: 2024-05-14

Changes to legislation: 
There are outstanding changes not yet made by the legislation.gov.uk editorial team to Finance
(No. 2) Act 2023. Any changes that have already been made by the team appear in the content
and are referenced with annotations.
View outstanding changes

Changes and effects yet to be applied to the whole Act associated Parts and Chapters:
Whole provisions yet to be inserted into this Act (including any effects on those
provisions):
– s. 131(2)(3) substituted for s. 131(2) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 5(3)
– s. 147A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 8(1)
– s. 148A-148C inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 8(3)
– s. 150(6A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 50(5)(b)
– s. 151(1)(c) and word inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 9(2)(d)
– s. 151(1)(aa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 9(2)(c)
– s. 151(6A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 9(4)
– s. 151(8) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 9(6)
– s. 159(1)(a)(b) substituted for words by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 12(2)
– s. 159(2)(a)(b) substituted for words by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 12(3)
– s. 159(3)(a)(b) substituted for words by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 12(4)
– s. 159(4) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 12(5)
– s. 165(2)(a)(i)(ii) s. 165(2)(a)(b) become s. 165(2)(a)(i)(ii) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para.

50(6)(b)
– s. 168(12) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 14(8)
– s. 170(2A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 14(9)(b)
– s. 176A-176C and cross-heading inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 8(6)
– s. 176D-176F and cross-heading inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 16(1)
– s. 178(1A)(1B) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 17(4)
– s. 178(5)(6) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 17(6)
– s. 179(1A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 17(7)(a)
– s. 179(3A)(3B) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 17(7)(b)
– s. 180(8)(b)(ii)(iia) substituted for s. 180(8)(b)(ii) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 19(4)
– s. 183A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 20(5)
– s. 195(7A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 25(1)
– s. 196(1)(e) and words inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 22(1)(b)
– s. 196(1A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 21(1)(b)
– s. 197(4)(d)(e) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 23(b)
– s. 197(5)(c) and word inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 22(2)(e)
– s. 197(6A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 21(2)
– s. 197(7A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 24
– s. 197A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 25(2)
– s. 198A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 26
– s. 211(1)-(1C) substituted for s. 211(1) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 27(a)
– s. 213(6A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 28
– s. 232(3A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 4(6)
– s. 232A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 2(2)
– s. 236(2A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 31(3)
– s. 251A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 29(1)
– s. 253(2)(b)(va) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 56(10)(c)(iii)
– s. 255(2A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 34(1)(a)
– s. 255(4)-(6) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 34(1)(c)
– s. 256A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 35(1)
– s. 262(1A)-(1D) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 36
– s. 267(3A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 42(1)(a)
– s. 267(3B)-(3D) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 43(1)(b)
– s. 267A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 42(2)
– s. 268A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 2(4)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/5/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/8/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/8/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/50/5/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/9/2/d
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/9/2/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/9/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/9/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/12/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/12/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/12/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/12/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/50/6/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/50/6/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/14/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/14/9/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/8/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/16/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/17/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/17/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/17/7/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/17/7/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/19/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/20/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/25/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/22/1/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/21/1/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/23/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/22/2/e
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/21/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/24
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/25/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/26
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/27/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/28
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/4/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/31/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/29/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/56/10/c/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/34/1/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/34/1/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/35/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/36
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/42/1/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/43/1/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/42/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/4


Finance (No. 2) Act 2023 (c. 30)
Document Generated: 2024-05-14

5

– s. 272(8)(da) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 44(1)
– s. 272(9)-(11) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 43(3)(b)
– s. 272A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 42(3)
– s. 273(3)(ba) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 44(2)
– s. 273(4)(pa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 57(3)(c)
– s. 273A273B inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 45(1)
– s. 273C inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 46
– s. 276(c)(iiia) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 45(2)(b)
– s. 276(aa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 45(2)(a)
– s. 311A inserted by 2024 c. 3 s. 21(3)
– Sch. 14 para. 37A37B and cross-heading inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 2(6)(b)
– Sch. 14 para. 39(1)(aa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 2(6)(c)(ii)
– Sch. 14 para. 39(2)(aa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 2(6)(c)(iii)
– Sch. 14 para. 33A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 37(3)
– Sch. 14 para. 6(1A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(1)(a)
– Sch. 14 para. 34(2A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(1)(b)(ii)
– Sch. 14 para. 3(3)-(5) substituted for Sch. 14 para. 3(3) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para.

2(6)(a)(iii)
– Sch. 15 para. 2(1)(za) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 16(2)
– Sch. 15 para. 2(1)(k) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 40(2)
– Sch. 15 para. 2(1)(l) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 41(4)
– Sch. 15 para. 1(1)(aa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(2)(a)
– Sch. 15 para. 2(1)(ea) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(2)(b)(i)
– Sch. 15 para. 2(1)(fa) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(2)(b)(ii)
– Sch. 16 para. 10(1) Sch. 16 para. 10 renumbered as Sch. 16 para. 10(1) by 2024 c. 3

Sch. 12 para. 58(3)(a)
– Sch. 16 para. 2(11)(b) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 34(2)(d)(ii)
– Sch. 16 para. 2(3A) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 38(3)
– Sch. 16 para. 2(12)(13) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 38(8)
– Sch. 16 para. 4(3)(d) and word inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 39(3)(a)(ii)
– Sch. 16 Pt. 3 inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 40(1)
– Sch. 16 para. 10(2)(3) inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(3)(d)
– Sch. 16 para. 2(1)(b)(ba) substituted for Sch. 16 para. 2(1)(b) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12

para. 34(2)(a)
– Sch. 16 para. 3(1)(1A) substituted for Sch. 16 para. 3(1) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para.

39(2)
– Sch. 16 para. 3(7)-(9) substituted for Sch. 16 para. 3(7)(8) by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para.

29(2)
– Sch. 16 para. 10(1)(a) word substituted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(3)(c)
– Sch. 16 para. 10(1) words inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(3)(b)(ii)
– Sch. 16 para. 10(1) words substituted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 58(3)(b)(i)
– Sch. 16A inserted by 2024 c. 3 Sch. 12 para. 41(1)

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/44/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/43/3/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/42/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/44/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/57/3/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/45/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/46
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/45/2/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/45/2/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/section/21/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/6/b
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/6/c/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/6/c/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/37/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/1/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/1/b/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/6/a/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/2/6/a/iii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/16/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/40/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/41/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/2/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/2/b/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/2/b/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/3/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/34/2/d/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/38/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/38/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/39/3/a/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/40/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/3/d
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/34/2/a
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/39/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/39/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/29/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/29/2
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/3/c
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/3/b/ii
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/58/3/b/i
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2024/3/schedule/12/paragraph/41/1

