
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1987 No. 45

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 1987

Increase in the rate of child benefit

7. In regulation 2 of the Child Benefit and Social Security (Fixing and Adjustment of Rates)
Regulations 1976(1) (weekly rates of child benefit) —

(a) in paragraph (1) for “£7. 10” there shall be substituted “£7.25”;
(b) in paragraph (2) for “£4.60” there shall be substituted “£4.70”.

(1) S.I. 1976/1267; the relevant amending instruments are S.I. 1977/1328, 1980/110, 1985/1243 and 1986/1172

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1976/1267
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1977/1328
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1980/110
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1985/1243
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1986/1172

