
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security
(Miscellaneous Provisions)Amendment Regulations 1990, Section 2. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1990 No. 2208

The Social Security (Miscellaneous
Provisions)Amendment Regulations 1990

Amendment of the Social Security (Attendance Allowance) (No. 2) Regulations 1975

2.—(1)  The Social Security (Attendance Allowance) (No. 2) Regulations 1975(1) shall be
amended in accordance with the following provisions of this regulation.

(2)  In paragraph (1) of regulation 5 (exception from regulations 3 and 4) for the words “4 weeks”
there shall be substituted the words “28 days”.

(3)  In paragraph (2) of regulation 7 (children in hospital and certain other accommodation) for
the words “4 weeks” there shall be substituted the words “28 days”.

(1) S.I.1975/598, to which the relevant amendments are S.I. 1977/342 and 417, 1979/1684, 1983/1015, 1137 and 1741.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1975/598
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1977/342
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1977/417
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1979/1684
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1983/1015
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1983/1137
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1983/1741


Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Social Security (Miscellaneous
Provisions)Amendment Regulations 1990, Section 2.


