
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

1998 No. 206

AGRICULTURE

The Hill Livestock (Compensatory
Allowances) (Amendment) Regulations 1998

Made       -      -      -      - 3rd February 1998

Laid before Parliament 4th February 1998

Coming into force       -      - 16th February 1998

The Minister of Agriculture, Fisheries and Food and the Secretary of State, being Ministers
designated(1) for the purposes of subsection (2) of section 2 of the European Communities Act
1972(2) in relation to the common agricultural policy of the European Community, acting jointly
in exercise of the powers conferred upon them by that subsection and of all other powers enabling
them in that behalf, hereby make the following Regulations:

Title and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Hill Livestock (Compensatory Allowances)
(Amendment) Regulations 1998 and shall come into force on 16th February 1998.

Amendments to the Hill Livestock (Compensatory Allowances) Regulations 1996

2.—(1)  The Hill Livestock (Compensatory Allowances) Regulations 1996(3) shall be amended
in accordance with the following paragraphs of this regulation.

(2)  In paragraph (1) of regulation 2 (interpretation)—
(a) the definitions of “the 1995 Order” and “the 1984 Regulations” shall be revoked;
(b) the following definition shall be inserted immediately after the definition of “the 1994

Regulations”—
““the 1997 Regulations” means the Cattle Identification (Enforcement) Regulations
1997(4);”; and

(1) S.I. 1972/1811.
(2) 1972 c. 68.
(3) S.I. 1996/1500, amended by S.I. 1997/33.
(4) S.I. 1997/1901.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1972/1811
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1972/68
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/1500
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/33
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/1901


Document Generated: 2023-06-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(c) in the definition of “the 1993 Suckler Cow Regulations” there shall be inserted at the end
“, as amended at the time the Hill Livestock (Compensatory Allowances) (Amendment)
Regulations 1998 are made”.

(3)  In paragraph (3) of regulation 2 there shall be substituted for “the Hill Livestock
(Compensatory Allowances) (Amendment) Regulations 1997” the following—

“the Hill Livestock (Compensatory Allowances) (Amendment) Regulations 1998”.
(4)  In paragraph (1A) of regulation 3 (compensatory allowances for breeding cows and ewes)—

(a) there shall be substituted for “the 1997 Scheme year” the phrase “the 1998 Scheme year”;
(b) in sub-paragraphs (a) and (b)(i), for “£97.50” there shall be substituted “£47.50”;
(c) in sub-paragraph (b)(i), for “£121.49” there shall be substituted “£88.70”; and
(d) in sub-paragraphs (b)(ii) and (c), for “£69.75” there shall be substituted “£23.75”.

(5)  In paragraph (1B) of regulation 3—
(a) there shall be substituted for “the 1997 Scheme year” the phrase “the 1998 Scheme year”;

and
(b) in sub-paragraph (b)(ii)(aa), for “£121.49” there shall be substituted “£88.70”.

(6)  In paragraph (2) of regulation 3, for “, the 1992 Regulations or the 1984 Regulations” there
shall be substituted “or the 1992 Regulations”.

(7)  In paragraph (3) of regulation 3, the phrase “Subject to paragraph (3A)” shall be revoked.
(8)  Paragraph (3A) of regulation 3 shall be revoked.
(9)  In paragraph (5)(a) of regulation 9 (powers of authorised persons)—

(a) the phrase “the 1995 Order or” shall be revoked; and
(b) there shall be inserted after the phrase “the 1996 Order” the phrase “or the 1997

Regulations”.
(10)  In paragraph (4) of regulation 12 (withholding or recovery of compensatory allowance),

for “article 5 of the 1995 Order” there shall be substituted “regulation 3(3) and (4) of the 1997
Regulations”.

2nd February 1998

Elliot Morley
Parliamentary Secretary, Ministry of Agriculture,

Fisheries and Food

3rd February 1998

Sewel
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State, Scottish

Office

2



Document Generated: 2023-06-28
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

1. These Regulations amend the Hill Livestock (Compensatory Allowances) Regulations 1996
(S.I.1996/1500, as already amended by S.I. 1997/33).

2. Those Regulations of 1996 extend to Great Britain.

3. S.I. 1996/1500 complies with Council Regulation (EC) No. 950/97 on improving the efficiency
of agricultural structures (OJ No. L142, 2.6.97, p.1).

4. These Regulations set revised rates of payment in respect of the 1998 Scheme year for the
annual compensatory allowance for certain breeding cows and ewes payable under regulation 3 of
S.I. 1996/1500.

5. These Regulations also make minor drafting changes to regulations 2(1) and (3), 3(2), 9(5)
(a) and 12(4) of S.I. 1996/1500.

6. No regulatory appraisal has been prepared in respect of these Regulations.

3

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/1500
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/33
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/1500
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/european/regulation/1997/0950
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/1500
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1996/1500

