
[DETR 1579]

(a) 1995 c. 25; see section 93(8) for the definitions of “prescribed” and “regulations”.
(b) O.J. No. L365, 31.12.94, p. 10.
(c) S.I. 1997/648.

S T A T U T O R Y  I N S T R U M E N T S

1999 No. 1361

ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION

The Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste)
(Amendment) Regulations 1999

Made - - - - 13th May 1999

Laid before Parliament 14th May 1999

Coming into force 4th June 1999

The Secretary of State for the Environment, Transport and the Regions as respects England and
Wales, and the Secretary of State for Scotland as respects Scotland, in exercise of the powers
conferred upon them by sections 93 and 94(1)(c) of the Environment Act 1995(a), for the
implementation of article 6(1) of Directive 94/62/EC(b) and of all other powers enabling them in
that behalf, after consultation in accordance with section 93(2) of that Act, and having regard to
the matters specified in section 93(6) as required by section 93(5) of that Act, hereby make the
following Regulations:

Citation and commencement
1. These Regulations may be cited as the Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging

Waste) (Amendment) Regulations 1999 and shall come into force on 4th June 1999.

Amendment of the recovery and recycling targets for 1999 and 2000
2. Schedule 2 (recovery and recycling obligations) to the Producer Responsibility

Obligations (Packaging Waste) Regulations 1997(c) is amended as follows–
(a) at the end of paragraph 4(a), add “and 43% respectively”;
(b) in paragraph 4(b), for “43%” substitute “45%”;
(c) at the end of paragraph 5(a), add “and 10% respectively”, and
(d) in paragraph 5(b), for “11%” substitute “13%”.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for
the Environment, Transport and the Regions

Michael Meacher
Secretary of State for the Environment,

Transport and the Regions11th May 1999

Sewel
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State,

Scottish Office13th May 1999



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations amend the Producer Responsibility Obligations (Packaging Waste)
Regulations 1997, which impose on producers obligations to recover and recycle packaging
waste, and related obligations, in order to attain the targets in Article 6(1) of Directive 94/62/EC.

Regulation 2(a) and (b) increase for 1999 and 2000 the recovery targets, used to calculate
recovery obligations, from 38% and 43% to 43% and 45% respectively. Regulation 2(c) and (d)
increase for 1999 and 2000 the recycling targets, used to calculate recycling obligations, from 7%
and 11% to 10% and 13% respectively.

£1.00
� Crown copyright 1999

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited
under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of
Acts of Parliament

WO 4791 5/99 ON (MFK)


