
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2005 No. 843

The Town and Country Planning (Fees for
Applications and Deemed Applications)

(Amendment) (England) Regulations 2005

Citation, commencement and application

1.—(1)  These Regulations may be cited as the Town and Country Planning (Fees for Applications
and Deemed Applications) (Amendment) (England) Regulations 2005 and shall come into force on
1st April 2005.

(2)  These Regulations apply in relation to England only.

General increase in fees

2.—(1)  The Town and Country Planning (Fees for Applications and Deemed Applications)
Regulations 1989(1) are amended as follows.

(2)  In regulation 10A (fees for applications for certificates of lawful use or development)(2)—
(a) in paragraph (5)(b), for “£110” substitute “£135”; and
(b) for paragraph (6) substitute–

“(6)  Where a use specified in an application under section 191(1)(a) is use as one or
more separate dwellinghouses, the fee payable in respect of that use shall be—

(a) where the use so specified is use as 50 or fewer dwellinghouses, £265 for each
dwellinghouse;

(b) where the use so specified is use as more than 50 dwellinghouses, £13,250, and
an additional £80 for each dwellinghouse in excess of 50, subject to a maximum
in total of £50,000.”.

(3)  In regulation 11A (fees for certain applications under the General Permitted Development
Order) (3)—

(a) in paragraph (1)(a), for “£40” substitute “£50”; and
(b) in paragraph (1)(b), for “£220” substitute “£265”.

(4)  In Part I of Schedule 1 (general provisions)—
(a) in paragraphs 4(1) and 6(2), for “£220” substitute “£265”; and
(b) in paragraphs 7, 7A(4) and 7B(5), for “£110” substitute “£135”.
(c) for paragraph 15(2) substitute—

(1) S.I.1989/193; amended by S.I., 1990/2473, S.I. 1991/2735, S.I. 1992/1817, S.I. 1992/3052, S.I. 1993/3170, S.I. 1997/37, S.I.
2001/2719 and S.I. 2002/768.

(2) Regulation 10A was inserted by regulation 4 of S.I. 1992/1817.
(3) Regulation 11A was inserted by paragraph 3 of Schedule 3 to S.I. 1991/2735, and substituted by regulation 5 of S.I. 1992/1817

and then by regulation 4 of S.I. of 1992/3052, and paragraph (1) was substituted by regulation 2 of S.I. 2001/2719.
(4) Inserted by S.I. 1992/1817.
(5) Inserted by S.I. 1992/3052.

[ODPM 2993]

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1989/193
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1990/2473
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2735
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1817
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/3052
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1993/3170
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1997/37
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/2719
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/768
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1817
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1991/2735
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1817
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/3052
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/2719
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/1817
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1992/3052


Document Generated: 2024-04-14
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“(2)  Where an application is for outline planning permission and relates to development
which is within more than one of the categories specified in that table, the fee payable in
respect of the application shall be—

(a) where the site area does not exceed 2.5 hectares, £265 for each 0.1 hectare of
the site area;

(b) where the site area exceeds 2.5 hectares £6,625, and an additional £80 for each
0.1 hectare in excess of 2.5 hectares, subject to a maximum in total of £25,000.”.

(5)  For Part II of Schedule 1 (scale of fees), substitute the new Part II set out in Schedule 1 to
these Regulations.

(6)  For Schedule 2 (scale of fees for advertisement applications), substitute the new Schedule 2
set out in Schedule 2 to these Regulations.

Revocation

3. Regulation 2 of the Town and Country Planning (Fees for Applications and Deemed
Applications)(Amendment)(England) Regulations 2002(6) is hereby revoked.

Signed by authority of the First Secretary of State

17th March 2005

Keith Hill
Minister of State Office of the Deputy Prime

Minister

(6) S.I. 2002/768.
2

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2002/768

