
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made).

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2007 No. 688

The Social Security Benefits Up-rating Order 2007

PART 4
JOBSEEKER’S ALLOWANCE

Increase in age-related amounts of contribution-based Jobseeker’s Allowance

23. In regulation 79(1) of the Jobseeker’s Allowance Regulations(1) (weekly amounts of
contribution-based jobseeker’s allowance)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (a) for “£34.60” substitute “£35.65”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (b) for “£45.50” substitute “£46.85”; and
(c) in sub-paragraph (c) for “£57.45” substitute “£59.15”.

(1) Relevant amending instrument is S.I. 2006/645.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/645

