
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 1362

The FCO Services Trading Fund (Variation) Order 2009

Variation of the Principal Order

2. Article 4 of the FCO Services Trading Fund Order 2008(1)is varied as follows—
(a) In paragraph (2), for “£39,000” substitute “£51,000”.
(b) In paragraph (3), for “£3,204,000” substitute “£4,981,000”.

(1) S.I.2008/590.

http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/590

