Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2012 No. 1871

INCOME TAX
CAPITAL GAINS TAX

The Individual Savings Account
(Amendment) (No. 2) Regulations 2012

Made - - - - 16th July 2012
Laid before the House of

Commons - - - - 17th July 2012
Coming into force - - 8th August 2012

The Treasury make these Regulations in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 694 to 699
and 701 of the Income Tax (Trading and Other Income) Act 2005(1) and section 151 of the Taxation
of Chargeable Gains Act 1992(2):

Citation and commencement

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Individual Savings Account (Amendment) (No. 2)
Regulations 2012 and come into force on 8th August 2012

2. The amendments to the Individual Savings Account Regulations 1998(3) made by
regulations 5(a) and 13 of these Regulations have effect from 1st November 2011.

3. The amendments to the Individual Savings Account Regulations 1998 made by regulations 6,
16(b), (c¢) and (d), 18(a) and (b) and 19 of these Regulations and the amendments made by
regulation 5(b) to (d) so far as they relate to those amendments, have effect from 9th November 2011.

Amendments to the Individual Savings Account Regulations 1998

4. The Individual Savings Account Regulations 1998 are amended as follows.

(1) 2005 c. 5; sections 694(1A), 695A, 699(9) and 701(6) were inserted by section 40 of the Finance Act 2011 (c. 11), and
section 701(4) and (5) was inserted by section 40 of the Finance Act 2008 (c. 9); sections 695(3) and (4), 696(3), 698(2),
(3) and (4) and 699(1) and (2) were amended by paragraphs 131 and 132 of Schedule 4 to the Commissioners for Revenue
and Customs Act 2005 (c. 11).

(2) 1992 c. 12;section 151(2) was substituted by section 64(2) of the Finance Act 1995 (c. 4) which also inserted subsection (2A);
the substituted subsection (2) and inserted subsection (2A) were substituted by a further subsection (2) by paragraph 436 of
Schedule 1 to the Income Tax (Trading and Other Income) Act 2005 (c. 5); the substituted subsection (2) was amended by
section 40 of the Finance Act 2011 (c. 11); section 151(4) was inserted by section 85 of the Finance Act 1993 (c. 34).

(3) S.I. 1998/1870; relevant amending instruments S.I. 1998/3174, 2001/3629, S.1. 2003/2747, S.1. 2004/2996, S.1. 2005/2561,
S.1.2005/3350, S.I. 2006/3194, S.1. 2007/2119, S.1. 2008/704, S.I. 2008/1934, S.I. 2010/835, S.I. 2010/2957, S.I. 2011/1780.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2008/9
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/12
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2011/11
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1993/34
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/1870
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/3174
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2001/3629
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2003/2747
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2004/2996
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/2561
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2005/3350
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2006/3194
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2007/2119
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/704
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2008/1934
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/835
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2010/2957
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/1780

Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

5. In regulation 2(1)(a) (interpretation)—
(a) after the definition of “child”, insert—

““child trust fund” has the meaning given by section 1 of the Child Trust Funds Act
2004(4);”;

(b) in paragraph (iv) of the definition of “company”, for “51 per cent.” substitute “51%";
(c) after the definition of “credit union”, insert—
““CTA 2010” means the Corporation Tax Act 2010(5);”;
(d) for the definitions of “51 per cent. subsidiary” and “75 per cent. subsidiary”, substitute—

““51% subsidiary” and “75% subsidiary” have the same meanings as they do in
section 1154 of CTA 2010;”;

(e) after the definition of “junior ISA account”, insert—

““Looked After Child” has the meaning given in regulation 2F (special provision in
respect of Looked After Children);”.

6. After regulation 2(1) (interpretation), insert—
“(1A) In these Regulations—

(a) a “bulk transfer of accounts” occurs where two or more accounts are transferred
by an account manager (“the transferor”) to another account manager (“the
transferee”)—

(i) pursuant to an agreement made between the transferor and transferee, and

(i1) the transfers are not made pursuant to requests made by persons who are the
account investor or registered contact in relation to the accounts transferred;

(b) a “group transfer of accounts” occurs where a bulk transfer of accounts is made
between account managers that are members of the same group of companies
when the transfer occurs;

(c) two companies are members of the same group of companies if—
(1) one is a 75% subsidiary of the other, or

(ii) both are 75% subsidiaries of a third company.”.

7. Inregulation 2A(4) (meaning of account investor), after “regulations 5C,”, insert “5D to 5DC,
SDE,”.

8. Inregulation 2D (regulations that do not apply to junior ISA accounts), after “5B,” insert “5DI
to SDM,”.

9. Afterregulation 2E (contracts entered into by or on behalf of a child who is 16 or over), insert—

“Special provision in respect of Looked After Children

2F.—(1) A child is a Looked After Child where, after 2nd January 2011, there is a
continuous period of at least 12 months during which paragraph (2) applies in relation to
the child.

(2) This paragraph applies in relation to a child where the child is—

(4) 2004 c.6.
(5) 2010c.4.


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2004/6
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2010/4

Document Generated: 2023-07-07

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) looked after by a local authority within the meaning of section 22(1) of the
Children Act 1989 (general duty of local authority in relation to children looked
after by them)(6);

(b) provided with accommodation by an authority by virtue of article 21 of
the Children (Northern Ireland) Order 1995 (provision of accommodation for
children: general)(7);

(c) the subject of an order made under article 50(1)(a) of the Children (Northern
Ireland) Order 1995 (care orders and supervision orders);

(d) provided with accommodation by a local authority by virtue of section 25 of the
Children (Scotland) Act 1995 (provision of accommodation for children, etc.)(8);

(e) the subject of a supervision requirement made under section 70(1) of the Children
(Scotland) Act 1995 (disposal of referral by children’s hearing: supervision
requirements, including residence in secure accommodation);

(f) the subject of a permanence order made under section 80 of the Adoption and
Children (Scotland) Act 2007(9) (permanence orders); or

(g) treated as if the child were subject to an order described in sub-paragraph (f)
by virtue of article 13(1) of the Adoption and Children (Scotland) Act 2007
(Commencement No. 4, Transitional and Savings) Order 2009(10).

(3) In relation to a Looked After Child, regulations 2C(4)(b) (meaning of “registered
contact” etc.) and 12A(4)(b)(i) (conditions for application to open an account that is a junior
ISA account) must be construed as if the Share Foundation has parental responsibility in
respect of that child.

(4) In relation to an application to assume responsibility for the management of a junior
ISA account by the Share Foundation, regulation 2C(7)(c) must be construed as requiring
a declaration that—

(a) the applicant is the Share Foundation;
(b) the application is in relation to a Looked After Child; and
(c) the Share Foundation is to be the registered contact for the account.

(5) Where an application to assume responsibility for the management of a junior
ISA account is made in relation to which the registered contact is the Share Foundation,
regulation 2C(9)(a) must be construed as referring only to sub-paragraphs (e) and (g) of
paragraph (10).

(6) Where the registered contact in relation to a junior ISA account is the Share
Foundation, any reference in these Regulations to the residence of the registered contact
must be construed as meaning a reference to the registered offices of the Share Foundation.

(7) In this regulation “the Share Foundation” means the company limited by guarantee
(number 4500923) and charity registered with the Charity Commission of England and
Wales (number 1108068) as “The Share Foundation™.”.

10. Omit regulation 5B.

11. After regulation 5C (treatment of certain sums held in dormant accounts), insert—

(6

(7)
®)
(€]

1989 c. 41; section 22(1)(b) was amended by paragraph 19 of Schedule 5 to the Local Government Act 2000 (c. 22);
section 2(1) and (2) of the Children (Leaving Care) Act 2000 (c. 35); and by section 116(2) of the Adoption and Children
Act 2002 (c. 38).

S.I. 1995/755 (N.I. 2).

1995 c. 36.

2007 asp 4.

(10) S.S.I. 2009/267 (C. 22).


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1989/41
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/22
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/35
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2002/38
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/nisi/1995/755
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1995/36
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/asp/2007/4
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ssi/2009/267

Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

“Subscriptions disregarded for the purposes of the subscription limits in
regulations 4ZA and 4ZB

5D.—(1) A subscription to an account made in accordance with this regulation must be
disregarded for the purposes of the subscription limits in regulations 4ZA (subscriptions to
an account other than a junior ISA account) and 4ZB (subscriptions to a junior ISA account).

(2) A subscription to an account held by an account investor is made in accordance with
this regulation if—

(a) the subscription is—
(i) a defaulted cash account subscription;
(i1) a defaulted investment subscription; or
(iii) permitted in accordance with regulation SDE; and

(b) the account manager of the account to which the subscription is made is provided
with the information specified in regulation 5DF as relevant to the subscription.

Defaulted cash account subscription

SDA. A subscription is a defaulted cash account subscription if—

(a) it is made to an account (which may be a stocks and shares account or a cash
account) held by an account investor who held a cash account (“defaulted cash
account”) in respect of which a default event occurred no more than 180 days
before the subscription is made; and

(b) it does not exceed the amount held in the defaulted cash account immediately
before the default event occurred (including interest accrued but not paid at that
time).

Defaulted investment subscription

SDB. A subscription is a defaulted investment subscription if—

(a) it is made to a stocks and shares account held by the account investor who held
the account in respect of which a defaulted investment payment has been made
no more than 180 days before the subscription is made; and

(b) it does not exceed the amount of the defaulted investment payment.

Default event in respect of cash account

S5DC. A default event in respect of a cash account held by an account investor occurs
where the account manager of that account is determined to be unable or likely to be unable
to satisfy claims against the account manager in accordance with the rules of the scheme
for compensation established pursuant to section 213 of the Financial Services and Markets
Act 2000(11).

Defaulted investment payment

5DD. A defaulted investment payment occurs where a payment is made (otherwise than
by accretion to a stocks and shares account) by way of compensation in respect of the
poor performance, loss, depreciation or risk of depreciation of an investment described in
regulation 7 (“defaulted investment”) held in a stocks and shares account (whether or not
the defaulted investment continues to be held in the account at the time of the payment).

(11) 2000 c. 8; section 213 was amended by section 170(2) of the Banking Act 2009 (c. 1) and S.I. 2011/1613.
4


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2000/8
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2009/1
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/1613

Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Additional permitted subscription to a junior ISA account

SDE. A subscription is permitted by this regulation if it is made to a junior ISA account
that is a cash account but would have been a defaulted investment subscription if it had been
made to a stocks and shares account.

Information required by regulation 5D

SDF.—(1) The information specified by this regulation is—
(a) in relation to a defaulted cash account subscription—

(i) the amount held in the defaulted cash account to which the subscription
relates immediately before the default event occurred (including interest
accrued but not paid at that time);

(i1) the current year’s subscription made to that account; and

(iii) the date on which the first subscription (if any) was made to that account,
in the year in which the defaulted cash subscription is made;

(b) in relation to a defaulted investment subscription or a subscription permitted by
regulation SDE—

(1) evidence of the amount of the defaulted investment payment to which the
subscription relates and the date it was paid;

(i1) details of the defaulted investment in respect of which the defaulted
investment payment was made;

(iii) the full name and address (including postcode) of the account manager of
the stocks and shares account in which the defaulted investment was held;

(iv) the full name and address (including postcode) of the maker of the defaulted
investment payment.

(2) In this regulation—
“current year’s subscription” in relation to a defaulted cash account means—

(a) subscriptions made to the account in the year in which the defaulted cash account
subscription is made, but before the default event; and

(b) subscriptions made to any other account held by the account investor in the year
in which the defaulted cash account subscription is made and transferred to the
account before the subscription is made.

Single regulation 5D subscription

5DG. Only one defaulted cash account subscription, defaulted investment subscription
or subscription permitted by regulation SDE may be made in respect of a defaulted cash
account or a defaulted investment payment as the case may be even if the subscription made
is an amount less than that which could have been made by way of such subscription in
accordance with regulation 5D.

Default event or default investment payment occurring in the period beginning on
6th April 2011 and ending on 7th August 2012

S5DH. Anything occurring in the period commencing on 6th April 2011 and ending on
7th August 2012 that, if it had occurred after that period, would have been—

(i) a default event in respect of a cash account within regulation SDC, or

(ii) a defaulted investment payment within regulation 5DD,
5



Document Generated: 2023-07-07

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

shall be treated as occurring on 8th August 2012 for the purposes of regulations 5D to 5DG.

Special provision in respect of Lehman Brothers investments and Keydata
investments

5DI.—(1) Regulations 5DJ to SDM make special provision in respect of an investment
that is a Lehman Brothers investment or a Keydata investment.

(2) An investment is a Lehman Brothers investment if—

(a) theinvestment was a qualifying investment held by an account investor in a stocks
and shares account on 15th September 2008;

(b) Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc. acted as the sole counterparty underwriting the
investment on that day; and

(c) the investment was not sold or otherwise disposed of on that day so as to cause it
to cease to be a qualifying investment of the account on that day or any other day.

(3) Aninvestment is a Keydata investment if—

(a) theinvestment was a qualifying investment held by an account investor in a stocks
and shares account on 8th June 2009;

(b) Keydata Investment Services Limited (Keydata) on that day—
(i) was the account manager of the account, or
(i1) administered the account for another account manager; and

(c) the investment was not sold or otherwise disposed of on that day so as to cause it
to cease to be a qualifying investment of the account on that day or any other day.

Special application of regulations SDB, SDD, SDF and SDH in respect of a Lehman
Brothers investment

5DJ. In respect of a Lehman Brothers investment—
(a) regulation 5D shall apply as if after paragraph (2) there is added—

“(3) No defaulted investment subscription may be made in respect of a
defaulted investment payment made or treated as made on 8th August 2012
other than a single defaulted investment payment treated as made by virtue of
regulation SDL(2).”;

(b) regulation 5DB shall apply as if paragraph (b) provided that a defaulted
investment subscription must not exceed the amount of the defaulted investment
payment determined in accordance with regulation SDL;

(c) regulation 5DD is subject to regulation 5SDL(2);

(d) regulation SDF(1)(b) shall apply as if the information specified by it is—

(i) the information specified in paragraphs (i)-(iv) of that regulation;
(i1) the value of the defaulted investment at the opening of trading on the
London Stock Exchange on 15th September 2008;

(iii) the date and amount of any earlier defaulted investment subscriptions in
respect of the Lehman Brothers investment in question made before the
making of the defaulted investment subscription;

(iv) the name and address (including postcode) of the account manager to whom
any subscription referred to in sub-paragraph (iii) of this paragraph was
made;



Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(e) regulation SDH—

(1) shall apply as if the period mentioned in that regulation were the period
commencing on 16th September 2008 and ending on 7th August 2012;

(i1) is subject to regulation SDL(2).

Deemed defaulted investment payment in respect of a Lehman Brothers investment

SDK. A defaulted investment payment shall be treated as made on 8th August 2012 in
respect of a Lehman Brothers investment to the account investor who held it.

Specified amount for the purposes of a defaulted investment subscription in respect
of a Lehman Brothers investment

SDL.—(1) This regulation determines the amount which a defaulted investment
subscription must not exceed for the purposes of regulation SDB(b) in relation to a defaulted
investment payment made or treated as made in respect of a Lehman Brothers investment.

(2) Where one or more defaulted investment payments in respect of a Lehman Brothers
investment are made on 8th August 2012 or are treated as made on that day by virtue
of regulations SDH or 5DK, they shall be treated as if they comprised a single defaulted
investment payment made on that day of an amount which is the greater of—

(a) the value of the investment at the opening of trading on the London Stock
Exchange on 15th September 2008; or

(b) the total of the payments made or treated as made by virtue of regulation SDH
on 8th August 2012.

(3) Where a defaulted investment payment in respect of a Lehman Brothers investment
is made after 8th August 2012, its amount for the purposes of regulation SDB(b) is the
greater of—

(@

the amount determined by the formula A— B where—

(1) “A” is the total of the single defaulted investment payment treated as made
on 8th August 2012 in respect of the investment by virtue of paragraph (2)
and all defaulted investment payments made in respect of it in the period
commencing immediately after that day and ending immediately after the
defaulted investment payment in question;

(i1) “B” is the total of all defaulted investment subscriptions made in respect of
the Lehman Brothers investment before the subscription in question; or

(b)

the amount determined by the formula C =D where—

(i) “C” is the value of the investment at the opening of trading on the London
Stock Exchange on 15th September 2008;

(i1) “D” is the total of all defaulted investment subscriptions made in respect of
the Lehman Brothers investment before the subscription in question.

Special application of regulations 5DJ to SDL in respect of a Keydata investment

S5DM. In respect of a Keydata investment—
(a) regulations 5DJ to 5DL shall apply as if—

(i) areference to a Lehman Brothers investment were a reference to a Keydata
investment;



Document Generated: 2023-07-07

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(i1) the reference in regulation 5DJ(e)(i) to 16th September 2008 were a
reference to 9th June 2009;

(b) regulation 5DJ(d)(ii) shall apply as if the information it requires is the amount for
which the Keydata investment in question was acquired;

(c) regulation SDL(2)(a) shall apply as if it referred to the amount of subscriptions
made to the account (or any other account or personal equity plan) and other
proceeds (including income) representing those subscriptions used to purchase
the investment;

(d) regulation 5DL(3)(a)(i) shall apply as if element “A” is the amount described
in regulation 5SDL(2)(a) as construed in accordance with paragraph (c) of this
regulation;

(e) regulation SDL(3)(b)(i) shall apply as if element “C” is the total of the single
defaulted investment payment treated as made on 8th August 2012 in respect
of the investment by virtue of regulation SDL(2) and all defaulted investment
payments made in respect of it in the period commencing immediately after that
day and ending immediately after the defaulted investment payment in question.”.

12. In regulation 7 (qualifying investments for a stocks and shares component)—
(a) in paragraph (5)(c), for “75 per cent.” substitute “75%”;
(b) in paragraph (8), for “50 per cent.” substitute “50%”.
13. Inregulation 8 (qualifying investments for a cash component), for paragraph (3) substitute—

“(3) A deposit account or share account which is a qualifying investment for a cash
component falling within sub-paragraphs (a) or (b) of paragraph (2) respectively (“Account
A”) must not be connected with any other account falling within the descriptions in those
sub-paragraphs (“Account B”), held by the account investor or any other person.

(4) For the purposes of paragraph (3), Account A is connected with Account B if all of
the following circumstances apply—

(a) either of the accounts was opened with reference to the other, or with a view to
enabling the other to be opened on particular terms, or with a view to facilitating
the opening of the other on particular terms,

(b) the terms on which Account A was opened would have been significantly less
favourable to the holder if Account B had not been opened, and

(c) Account B is not a tax exempt account.

(5) The following are tax exempt accounts for the purposes of paragraph (4)—
(a) anaccount opened (or treated as opened) in accordance with regulation 12 or 12A;
(b) a child trust fund.”.

14. In regulation 12(1), omit “, subject to paragraph (5),”.

15. For regulation 19 and the heading preceding it (account manager ceasing to act), substitute—

“Account manager’s intention to make a bulk transfer of accounts or to cease to act
as an account manager

19.—(1) An account manager must give notice to the Board if the account manager—
(a) intends to cease to act as an account manager; or

(b) intends to make a bulk transfer of accounts.



Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(2) An account manager must give notice to a person who is the account investor in
relation to an account held with the account manager if the account manager—

(a) intends to cease to act as an account manager; or

(b) intends that the account will be one of the accounts transferred in a bulk transfer
of accounts.

(3) The notices described in paragraphs (1) and (2) must—
(a) specify whether the account manager—
(i) intends to cease to act as an account manager; or
(i1) intends to make a bulk transfer of accounts;
(b) where the notice specifies an intention to cease to act as an account manager,—

(i) specify the day on or after which the account manager intends to cease to
act as an account manager; and

(i1) be given no less than 30 days before that day;
(c) where the notice specifies an intention to make a bulk transfer of accounts,—

(1) specify the day on or after which the account manager intends to make the
first transfer in the bulk transfer of accounts;

(i1) be given no less than 30 days before that day; and

(ii1) advise the name and address of the person to whom the account manager
intends to transfer accounts.

(4) The notice described in paragraph (2) must also—
(a) identify the account to which it relates;

(b) advise the account investor that the account may be transferred in accordance with
regulation 21 or 21B otherwise than in a bulk transfer of accounts if sufficient
instructions are provided to enable the account manager to do so;

(c) advise the day by which the account manager must receive sufficient instructions
for the account to be transferred otherwise than in a bulk transfer of accounts.

(5) Where an account manager intends to make a bulk transfer of accounts in
consequence of an intention to cease to act as an account manager, such intention may be
specified in the same notice to the Board or an account investor (as appropriate) provided
the requirements of paragraphs (3) and (4) are met.”.

16. In regulation 21 (transfers relating to accounts other than junior ISA accounts)—
(a) in paragraph (4B)(b), for “regulation 4(3)” substitute “regulation 4ZA”;
(b) after paragraph (4C), insert—

“(4CA) Regulation 12(1) does not prevent the current year’s subscriptions and the
previous years’ subscriptions being transferred to an account that was held immediately
before the transfer but to which no subscription has been made in the year in which the
transfer occurs or the year immediately before that year.”;

(c) after “shall” in paragraph (4D), insert “, subject to paragraph (4DA),”;
(d) after paragraph (4D), insert—
“(4DA) Paragraph (4D) does not apply where—
(a) an account is transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts;

(b) a cash account (whether or not in a bulk transfer of accounts) is transferred to
a cash account held with the transferee immediately before the time when the
transfer is made;



Document Generated: 2023-07-07

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(c) a stocks and shares account (whether or not in a bulk transfer of accounts) is
transferred to a stocks and shares account held with the transferee immediately
before the time when the transfer is made; or

(d) a cash account is transferred (otherwise than in a bulk transfer of accounts) to a
stocks and shares account held with the transferee immediately before the time
when the transfer is made.

(4DB) Where an account is transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts that is not also
a transfer described in paragraph (4DA)(b) or (c), a subscription to the account after the
transfer may only be made if—

(a) the subscription is made after the account investor has, during the period of time
determined in accordance with paragraph (4DC), made an application to the
transferee in relation to the account in accordance with regulation 12 (with any
necessary modifications where appropriate to reflect that the account has been
transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts);

(b) the subscription is made in the year immediately following a year in which a
subscription has been made to the account other than a subscription permitted
by virtue of paragraph (4DE); or

(c) the subscription is permitted by virtue of paragraph (4DE).
(4DC) The period of time referred to in paragraph (4DB)(a) is the period—

(a) starting at the beginning of the year immediately preceding the year in which
the subscription is made, and

(b) ending immediately before the subscription is made.

(4DD) For the purposes of paragraphs (4DB) and (4DE), the current year’s
subscriptions and the previous years’ subscriptions transferred are not subscriptions to the
account.

(4DE) A subscription to an account is permitted by this paragraph if—
(a) the account has been transferred to the transferee in a group transfer of accounts;

(b) the most recent application in accordance with regulation 12 relating to the
transferred account made before its transfer is available to the transferee; and

(c) the subscription is made—

(i) in the year in which the account is transferred (provided a subscription has
been made to the account in that year before the account was transferred);
or

(i1) in a year immediately following a year in which a subscription has been
made to the transferred account (including a subscription made before the
transfer).

(4DF) For the purposes of paragraph (4DE)(b), an application in accordance with
regulation 12 as described in that paragraph is available to a transferee if—

(a) paragraph (4DG) or (4DH) applies; and

(b) the transferor has advised the transferee whether a subscription has been made
to the transferred account in the year immediately preceding the year in which
the transfer takes place.

(4DG) This paragraph applies where the application described in paragraph (4DE)(b)
(or a copy of it) is held by the transferee.

(4DH) This paragraph applies where—

10



Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(a) the application described in paragraph (4DE)(b) (or a copy of it) is held by the
transferor; and

(b) the transferee can require the transferor to make it available to the transferee
for any purpose necessary to ensure the transferee’s compliance with these
regulations.

(4DI) An account transferred in accordance with this regulation in a bulk transfer of
accounts is an account opened in accordance with regulation 12 for the purposes of these
Regulations whether or not an application in accordance with regulation 12 as described
in paragraph (4DB)(a) is made. ”’;

(e) for paragraph (5), substitute—

“(5) Where an account is transferred, the transferor must, subject to paragraph (5B),
give to the transferee a notice containing the information specified in paragraph (6) before
the relevant time specified in paragraph (5A).

(5A) The relevant time specified in this paragraph is—

(a) in the case of an account transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts, the time of
the transfer;

(b) in any other case, the expiry of 30 days after the day of the transfer.

(5B) Paragraph (5) does not apply where a transferor provides information to a
transferee in accordance with regulation 21A(2)(b)(ii).”.

17. Inregulation 21A (further requirements relating to transfers between cash accounts)—
(a) for paragraph (3)(b)(iii), substitute—

“(ii1) in relation to the transfer of an account that is not a junior ISA account, the date
on which the first subscription (if any) was made to the account in the year in
which the transfer takes place,

(iiia) in relation to the transfer of an account that is a junior ISA account, the date on
which the subscription described in paragraph (3A) was made (if appropriate),
and”;

(b) after paragraph (3), insert—

“(3A) The subscription referred to in paragraph (3)(b)(iiia) is the first subscription to
the account provided the subscription is made in the same year as the transfer.”.

18. In regulation 21B (transfers relating to junior ISA accounts)—
(a) in paragraph (8), after “shall” insert , subject to paragraph (8A),”;
(b) after paragraph (8), insert—

“(8A) Paragraph (8) does not apply where an account is transferred in a bulk transfer
of accounts.

(8B) Where an account is transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts, a subscription to
the account after the transfer may only be made if—

(a) an application to the transferee in relation to the account in accordance with
regulation 12A (with any necessary modifications where appropriate to reflect
that the account has been transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts) has been
made; or

(b) the subscription is permitted by virtue of paragraph (8D).

(8C) For the purposes of paragraphs (8B) and (8E), the current year’s subscriptions
and the previous years’ subscriptions transferred are not subscriptions to the account.

11



Document Generated: 2023-07-07

Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(8D) A subscription to an account is permitted by this paragraph where—

(a) the account has been transferred to the transferee in a group transfer of accounts;
and

(b) the most recent application in accordance with regulation 12A relating to the
transferred account made before its transfer is available to the transferee.

(8E) For the purposes of paragraph (8D)(b), an application in accordance with
regulation 12A as described in that paragraph is available to a transferee if—

(a) paragraph (8F) or (8G) applies; and

(b) the transferor has advised the transferee whether a subscription has been made
to the transferred account in the year immediately preceding the year in which
the transfer takes place.

(8F) This paragraph applies where the application described in paragraph (8D)(b) (or
a copy of it) is held by the transferee.

(8G) This paragraph applies where—

(a) the application described in paragraph (8D)(b) (or a copy of it) is held by the
transferor; and

(b) the transferee can require the transferor to make it available to the transferee
for any purpose necessary to ensure the transferee’s compliance with these
regulations.

(8H) An account transferred in accordance with this regulation in a bulk transfer of
accounts is a junior ISA account opened pursuant to an application in accordance with
regulation 12A for the purposes of these Regulations whether or not an application in
accordance with regulation 12A as described in paragraph (8B)(a) is made.”;

(c) for paragraph (10), substitute—

“(10) Where an account is transferred, the transferor must, subject to paragraph (10B),
give to the transferee a notice containing the information specified in paragraph (11) before
the relevant time specified in paragraph (10A).

(10A) The relevant time specified in this paragraph is—

(a) in the case of an account transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts, the time of
the transfer;

(b) in any other case, the expiry of 30 days after the day of the transfer.

(10B) Paragraph (10) does not apply where a transferor provides information to a
transferee in accordance with regulation 21A(2)(b)(ii).”;

(d) for paragraph (11)(b)(iv), substitute—

“(iv) the date on which the subscription described in paragraph (12) was made (if
appropriate), and”;

(e) after paragraph (11), insert—

“(12) The subscription referred to in paragraph (11)(b)(iv) is the first subscription to
the account provided the subscription is made in the same year as the transfer.”.

19. In regulation 29 (records to be kept by account manager)—
(a) renumber the existing provision as paragraph (1) of regulation 29;
(b) after that paragraph, insert—

“(2) Where an account is transferred by an account manager (“the transferor”) to
another account manager (“the transferee”) in a group transfer of accounts, any records

12



Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

(or copies of records) kept by the transferor in respect of the account at the time when it
is transferred shall be treated for the purposes of this regulation as kept by the transferee
for so long as sub-paragraphs (a), (b) and (c) of paragraph (3) apply.

(3) For the purposes of paragraph (2)—

(a) this sub-paragraph applies if the records described in paragraph (2) are kept by
the transferor;

(b) this sub-paragraph applies if the transferor and transferee are members of the
same group of companies; and

(c) this sub-paragraph applies if the transferee can require the transferor to make
the records available to the transferee for any purpose necessary to ensure the
transferee’s compliance with these regulations.”.

20. Inregulation 31 (returns of information by account manager)—
(a) in paragraph (3)(c)(ii), for “paragraph (3A)” insert “paragraphs (3A) and (3AB)(a)”;
(b) in paragraph (3)(c)(iii), for “paragraph (3B) insert “paragraphs (3AB)(b) and (3B)”; and
(c) after paragraph (3A), insert—

“(3AB) Where a defaulted cash account subscription in accordance with regulation 5D
(subscriptions disregarded for the purposes of the subscription limits in regulations 4ZA
and 4ZB) is made to an account in the year or part of the year for which a return required
by this regulation is made—

(a) the amount of subscriptions reported to an account manager in accordance with
regulation SDF(1)(a)(ii) (current year’s subscriptions made to the defaulted cash
account) must be included as part of the total amount of cash subscribed to the
account required by paragraph (3)(c)(ii);

(b) paragraph (3)(c)(iii) must be construed as requiring (in addition to the
information specified in that paragraph) the date reported to the account manager
in accordance with regulation SDF(1)(a)(iii).”.

Jeremy Wright

Angela Watkinson

Two of the Lords Commissioners of Her

16th July 2012 Majesty’s Treasury

13



Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations)

These Regulations, which come into force on 8th August 2012, amend the Individual Savings
Account Regulations 1998 (S.I. 1998/1870) (“the ISARegulations™).

Regulations 1 to 3 provide for the citation, commencement and times from when these Regulations
have effect. The amendments made by regulations 5(a) and 13 have effect from 1st November
2011. The amendments made by regulations 6, 16(b), (¢) and (d), 18(a) and (b) and 19 (and the
amendments made by regulation 5(b) to (d) so far as they relate to those amendments) have effect
from 9th November 2011.The other amendments to the ISARegulations have effect from when these
Regulations come into force.

The power to make regulations having effect in relation to times before they are made (provided
they do not impose or increase any liability to tax) is conferred by section 701(4) the Income Tax
(Trading and Other Income) Act 2005 (c.5) and section 151(2) of the Taxation of Chargeable Gains
Act 1992 (c. 12).

Regulations 4 to 6 insert new definitions and amend others in regulation 2 of the ISARegulations.

Regulations 7 and 8 amend regulation 2A(4) of the ISARegulations (meaning of account investor)
and regulation 2D of those regulations (regulations that do not apply to accounts that are junior ISA
accounts) in consequence of the amendments made by regulation 11 of these Regulations.

Regulation 9 inserts regulation 2F so that regulations 2C(4)(b) (meaning of registered contact etc.)
and 12A(4)(b)(i) (conditions for application to open an account that is a junior ISA account) must
be construed as if the Share Foundation organisation has parental responsibility in relation to a child
described in regulation 2F (a “Looked After Child”).

Regulation 10 omits regulation 5B of the ISARegulations which has no effect in relation to
subscriptions made after 5th April 2011.

Regulation 11 inserts new regulations 5D to SDM into the ISARegulations. The new regulations 5D
to 5DM provide as follows.

Regulation 5D provides that a defaulted cash account subscription, defaulted investment subscription
and a subscription permitted by regulation SDE are disregarded for the purposes of the annual
amounts that may be subscribed to ISA accounts (including junior ISA accounts) in accordance with
regulations 4ZA and 4ZB of the ISARegulations if the information specified in regulation SDF is
provided to the account manager.

Regulations SDA and 5DC provide that a defaulted cash account subscription is a subscription
made to a cash account or a stocks and shares account before the expiry of 180 days from when an
account manager of a cash account is, in accordance with the rules of the scheme for compensation
established pursuant to section 213 of the Financial Services and Markets Act 2000, determined to be
unable or likely to be unable to satisfy claims against the account manager provided the subscription
does not exceed the amount in the account (including accrued interest) at the time of the default.

Regulations 5DB and 5DD provide that a defaulted investment subscription is a subscription made
to a stocks and shares account before the expiry of 180 days from a payment (defaulted investment
payment) by way of compensation etc. in respect of the poor performance etc of an investment held
in a stocks and shares account (except where the payment is made as an accretion to the account)
provided the subscription does not exceed the amount of the payment.

14


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/1998/1870
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/2005/5
http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/ukpga/1992/12

Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Regulation SDE permits a subscription to be made to a junior ISA account that is a cash account if
it would have been a defaulted investment subscription if it had been made to a stocks and shares
account.

Regulation SDF describes the information which must be provided to the account manager when a
subscription under regulation 5D is made.

Regulation 5SDG provides that only one regulation 5D subscription may be made in respect of a
defaulted cash account or defaulted investment payment even if the amount subscribed is less than
the maximum that could have been subscribed.

Regulation 5SDH provides that anything occurring in the period commencing on the 6th April 2011
and ending on 7th August 2012 will be treated as occurring on 8th August 2012 if it would have been
a default event within the meaning in regulation SDC or a defaulted investment payment within the
meaning in regulation 5DD if it had occurred on that day.

Regulations 5DI to SDM make special provision in respect of investments defined in regulation SDI
as a “Lehman Brothers investment” and a “Keydata investment”.

In relation to a Lehman Brothers investment held by an account investor on 15th September 2008,
regulations 5DK and SDL deem a single defaulted investment payment as made on 8th August 2012
of an amount which is the greater of the total of defaulted investment payments made or treated as
made on that day and the value of the investment at the opening of trading on the London Stock
Exchange on the 15th September 2008. In relation to a defaulted investment payment made or treated
as made on 8th August 2012, a defaulted investment subscription may only be made in respect of the
single defaulted investment payment treated as made on that day. In relation to a defaulted investment
payment made in respect of the investment after 8th August 2012, regulation 5DL(3) provides
that the amount of such a payment is to be treated (after taking account of defaulted investment
subscriptions already made) as the greater of the value of the investment on 15th September 2008
and the total of the single defaulted investment payment treated as made on 8th August 2012 and all
later defaulted investment payments (including the payment in question).

Regulation SDM provides that regulations 5DJ to SDL apply to a Keydata investment held by an
account investor on 8th June 2009. In respect of the single defaulted investment payment treated as
made on 8th August 2012, it provides that the amount of the single defaulted investment payment
is the greater of the total of defaulted investment payments made or treated as made on that day
and the value of the subscriptions etc. used to purchase the investment. In relation to a defaulted
investment payment made after 8th August 2012, regulation 5SDM provides that the value of such a
payment (after taking account of defaulted investment subscriptions already made) is the greater of
the subscriptions etc. used to purchase the investment and the total of the single defaulted investment
payment treated as made on 8th August 2012 and all later defaulted investment payments (including
the payment in question).

Regulation 12 amends regulation 7 of the ISARegulations in consequence of the amendment
in respect of the definitions of 50% and 75% subsidiary companies in regulation 2 of the
ISARegulations made by regulation 5 of these Regulations.

Regulation 13 amends regulation 8 of the ISARegulations (qualifying investments for a cash
component) so that the requirement that certain deposit or share account cash ISAs or junior ISAs
must not be connected with another such account (as described by the regulation) does not apply if
the accounts concerned are ISAs, junior ISAs or Child Trust Fund accounts.

Regulation 14 omits the reference to paragraph (5) of regulation 12 of the ISARegulations in
consequence of the omission of that paragraph by regulation 10 of the Individual Savings Account
(Amendment) Regulations 2007 (S.I. 2007/2119).

Regulation 15 substitutes regulation 19 of the ISARegulations making provision in respect of the
timing and content of the notices given where an account manager intends to cease to be an account
manager for the purposes of the ISARegulations or to make a bulk transfer of accounts.

15


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2007/2119

Document Generated: 2023-07-07
Status: This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

Regulation 16 amends regulation 21 of the ISARegulations so that a further regulation 12 application
is unnecessary where an ISA is transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts or is transferred to an another
ISA already held before the transfer (it is not possible to transfer a stocks and shares ISA to a cash
ISA) but in some cases a further regulation 12 application will be required subsequently to permit
further subscriptions to the ISA. Consequential amendments are made in respect of the time when
information required by regulation 21(6) must be provided to the account manager to whom the
transfer is made. Regulation 21(4B)(b) is also updated so that it refers to regulation 4ZA which was
inserted by the Individual Savings Account (Amendment No. 2) Regulations 2011 (S.1. 2011/1780).

Regulation 17 amends the information that must be included in the notice required by
regulation 21A(2)(b)(ii).

Regulation 18 amends regulation 21B of the ISARegulations so that a further regulation 12A
application is unnecessary where a junior ISA account is transferred in a bulk transfer of accounts
but will be required subsequently in some cases to permit further subscriptions to it. Consequential
amendments are made in respect of the timing and content of information regulation 21B(11) requires
to be provided to the account manager to whom the transfer is made.

Regulation 19 amends regulation 29 of the ISARegulations so that an account manager’s obligation
to retain records under that regulation may also be fulfilled if, following a bulk transfer of accounts
between two companies in the same group of companies, the records are retained by the company
making the transfer for so long as both companies remain in the same group of companies.

Regulation 20 amends regulation 31 of the ISARegulations in consequence of the amendments
made to the ISARegulations by regulation 11 of these Regulations in respect of the returns required
from account managers in respect of subscriptions to an account that are defaulted cash account
subscriptions.

A Tax Information and Impact Note covering this instrument will be published on the HMRC website
at http://www.hmrc.gov.uk/the library/tiins.htm.

16


http://www.legislation.gov.uk/id/uksi/2011/1780
http://www.hmrc.gov.uk/the library/tiins.htm

