
Changes to legislation: There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Companies and Limited
Liability Partnerships (Filing Requirements) Regulations 2015, Section 5. (See end of Document for details)

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2015 No. 1695

The Companies and Limited Liability Partnerships
(Filing Requirements) Regulations 2015

5.—(1)  Regulations 50 and 51 are amended as follows.
(2)  In section 1000 of the Companies Act 2006, as applied with modifications by regulation 50—

(a) in subsection (2)—
(i) for “one month of sending” substitute “ 14 days of sending ”,

(ii) for “that month” substitute “ that period ”, and
(iii) in paragraph (b), for “one month” substitute “ 14 days ”, and

(b) in subsection (3)—
(i) in paragraph (b), for “one month” substitute “ 14 days ”, and

(ii) for “three months” substitute “ 2 months ”.
(3)  In section 1001(1) of the Companies Act 2006, as applied with modifications by regulation 50,

for “three months” substitute “ 2 months ”.
(4)  In section 1003(3) of the Companies Act 2006, as applied with modifications by regulation 51,

for three months substitute “ 2 months ”.



Changes to legislation: 
There are currently no known outstanding effects for the The Companies and Limited Liability
Partnerships (Filing Requirements) Regulations 2015, Section 5.


