STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2017 No. 442
SOCIAL SECURITY

The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of
Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2017

Made - - - - 16th March 2017
Coming into force - - Ist April 2017

The Secretary of State for Work and Pensions makes the following Regulations, in exercise of the
powers conferred by sections 1(1), (2) and (4) and 7(1) and (2) of the Pneumoconiosis etc.
(Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979(a).

In accordance with section 7(3)(b) of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act
1979, a draft of this instrument was laid before Parliament and approved by resolution of each
House of Parliament.

Citation, commencement and application
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation)
(Payment of Claims) (Amendment) Regulations 2017 and come into force on 1st April 2017.

(2) These Regulations apply only in relation to any case in which a person first fulfils the
conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’” Compensation)
Act 1979 on or after 1st April 2017.

Amendment of the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988

2.—(1) The Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims) Regulations
1988(c) are amended as follows.

(2) In the proviso to regulation 5(1) (payment where death results from diffuse mesothelioma)
for “£3,051” substitute “£3,082”.

(3) In regulation 6(1)(a) (payment where pneumoconiosis is accompanied by tuberculosis) for
“£6,312” (in both places) substitute “£6,375”.

(4) In regulation 8 (minimum amount payable to dependant) for “£3,051” substitute “£3,082”.
(5) In the Schedule—
(a) 1in the part headed “TABLE 17, for the table after the preamble substitute—

(a) 1979 c. 41. Section 1 was amended by section 24 of the Social Security Act 1985 (c. 53).
(b) Section 7(3) was amended by section 58 of the Welfare Reform Act 2007 (c. 5).
(c) S.I. 1988/668; S.1. 1989/552, S.I. 2013/690 and S.I. 2015/503 are the relevant amending instruments.



L89°9¢ 6861¢ 121°ee 080°1¢ vL8°8CT 961°9¢ 090°1¢ L8691 86£CI 7969 19
901°1¥ LOY'6€ 08S°LE 029°6¢ 9pSiee 916°0¢ TILYC 691°0C 0811 YLL'L 09
916°SY 0z8cr LEOTY 891°0% v1T°8¢ LTESE 99¢°8C €6E°€T ¥96°C1 9LS°8 65
r€6'6v SeT'8Y 6619t CILYY 888y rrL'6€ T10°ce €¥S°9T 0SLLY €8¢°6 86
6V< VS $S9°Cs LS6°0S vST6v LSS'LY 891 v¥ 999°G¢ STL'6T 0€5°61 161°01 LS
9t0'9¢ N 4%Y ¢9°Cs LS6°0S vST6y 6619t LY0'8€ I7Ce ¢S9'IC K4 AN 9¢
ISL°LS 9t0°9S 6Y< VS $S9°Cs LS6°0S YET'8Y T oy 791°6¢ 18L°€T 969°C1 gs
LYY 68 ISL'LS 909§ 6EvS ¢S9°Ts vLT0S LOSTY YLY'LE ¥06°ST ¥88°¢Cl 125
rr1°19 LYY'6S ISL°LS 910°9S 6VE TS TIETS 081°St 16501 820°8¢ SITST €S
0829 vy 19 LYY 68 ISLLS 90°9S 6V 1S 9GS LY 11€°¢y LYT°0€ 891 [43
¥TT°S9 YS9 12819 109 6TY'8S L8E9S vLT0S T60°SY LEETTE ¥99°L1 5Y
66S°L9 868°S9 20TY9 9059 ¥08°09 68 ¥66°TS 1697 LTSTE 18681 0¢
186°69 18289 185°99 78819 T81°€9 69109 01L°SS 799°8y SIL'eE L6T°0T 61
8SETL TS9°0L 65689 192°L9 865°S9 9059 6TY'8S LY¥°0S Y06 t¢ ¥19°1¢C 14
TEL'YL re0'eL 6€€° 1L 7€9°69 €V6°L9 SYSH9 vy 19 9TTTS T60°9¢ 7€6°CC Ly
T8S°SL 6L8°¢L 881°CL L8Y°OL 16L°89 €EL'S9 90529 6LV VS L90°6€ 8SY 1T 9¥
ErIL TELYL Y€0'EL 6€€ 1L 7€9°69 €7699 798°¢€9 LTL'9S LEOTY 886°ST Sy
8LT'LL T8S°SL 6L8°CL 881°CL L8Y°OL 011°89 ¥TT°S9 9L6°8S 600°SY €IS'LT 144
TEI'8L TEV9L TEL'YL re0'eL 6€€ 1L 00€°69 185°99 0€T°19 086°LY S¥0°6C 3%
6L6'8L 8LT'LL T8S°SL 6L8°EL 881°CL L8Y°OL €V6°L9 08¥°€9 LS6°0S 995°0¢ (44
LL9°08 6L6°8L 8LT'LL T8S°SL 6L8°¢L 881°CL 91L°69 €EL'S9 205°¢S T65°1¢ It
8LETS LL908 6L68L 8LT'LL T8S°SL 6L8°EL €0S°IL 186°L9 910°9S T19°Ce ov
SLOYS 9LET8 LL9°08 6L6°8L SSO°LL ¥8S°GL 68C°¢L 1€T°0L 965°8S 879°¢¢ 6¢
TLL'SS SLO'YS 9L€°C8 LL9°08 6L6°8L 8LT'LL SLOSL 187°CL vy 19 8Y9° 1€ 8¢
Iopun
CLY'LS TLL'SS SLOYS 9L£°T8 LL9'08 6L68L LSS9L TEL'YL $69°¢9 999°¢¢ pue /¢
F F F F F F F F F F
%001~ %06~ %08~ %0L- %09- %08~ %0¥- %0E&- %0C- 4apun 10 uos.ad
bl6 I8 BIL %19 WIS DI¥ IE BIT Il %01 pajqosip
poriad jupaajad ayj 40f JUdUISSISSD ISDIUIILIJ Jo a3y,




L 065°€1 60T°CI 8ST'11 vL8'6 1618 LES'L LES'S Y0T'S STy 780°C | IoAOpue L/
8S0v1 8291 €6S° 11 L8001 80L'8 €99°L 996°S ¢8T'S 8TEY €91°¢ 9L
61SYI LSOET T€6'11 962°01 L16°8 68L°L 2609 €LE'S ocr'y 16T°¢ SL
8L6YT 8rel SLTTI z1sol LT1°6 TT6'L TTTY 9St'¢S 10SY ree'e VL
95t S1 806°¢I €191 TTLO1 €VE'6 S¥0°'8 61¢9 €yss 88SY 91t°¢ €L
926°S1 8TEYI 0S6°C1 T€6°01 LSS'6 vLI'8 LLY*9 979°¢ 1L9Y Y0S°¢ CL
LLY*91 Y98y 1 8IY°€El 89¥°I1 610°01 €Is'8 €189 098°S 8¢8Y 119°¢ 1L
6C0°L1 16€°61 ¥88°¢Cl 86611 S8Y°01 ¢e8'8 9GI°L 7609 ¥10°S SILE 0L
9LS'LT 9T6°S1 0SEY1 6TSTI 956°01 L61°6 961°L 0€€'9 181°C TT8€e 69
I€1°81 1S¥°91 081 LSO€ET ITr'11 ges’6 LES'L 0959 Spe's ST6'¢ 89
¥89°81 L8691 ¥8TC1 065°€1 €68°I1 vL86 VLIS 16L°9 0cs's 9¢€0'Y L9
10t°1C €0L’61 6S6°LI 8LI91 0SEY1 91€C1 610°01 v61°8 829 19t 99
0CTI'vC YT 8€9°0C 89L°81 SI891 8SLY1 IL8T1 965°6 8SS°L 788y S9
€€8°9C YEI°ST €re'ee 09€°1¢T 6LT°61 S61°L1 YIL€El L6601 9LS°8 LIES 79
[4SY¢ €C8°LT 886°ST 616°€C LEL'TT w96l G9S°CI 86¢C1 965°6 TEL'S €9
TLTTE 995°0¢ 799°8C €¥S°9C €0CTYC 180°CC 80¥°LI 108°€1 919°01 9619 9




(b) in the part headed “TABLE 2”, for the table after the preamble substitute—
“Part A

Age of | Percentage assessment for the relevant period

disabled 10% 11%-20% | 21%-30% | 31%-49% | 50% or over
person— On |\, under £ £ £ £

their last ¢

birthday

before their

death

37 and under | 22,591 38,517 43,186 44,463 45,522
38 22,082 37,072 41,911 43,186 44,543
39 21,574 35,628 40,637 41,910 43,566
40 21,059 34,182 39,363 40,637 42,590
41 20,551 32,740 38,089 39,363 41,614
42 20,046 31,301 36,815 38,089 40,637
43 19,126 29,430 35,667 36,942 39,703
44 18,216 27,556 34,518 35,797 38,760
45 17,304 25,689 33,374 34,649 37,832
46 16,389 23,819 32,129 33,502 36,898
47 15,477 21,951 31,086 32,360 35,966
48 14,780 21,442 30,238 31,467 34,819
49 14,074 20,932 29,384 30,575 33,670
50 13,375 20,421 28,538 29,678 32,526
51 12,677 19,914 27,689 28,792 31,383
52 11,976 19,406 26,839 27,899 30,238
53 11,654 18,216 25,227 26,667 29,298
54 11,337 17,026 23,609 25,436 28,367
55 11,020 15,837 21,996 24,206 27,433
56 10,702 14,648 20,382 22,976 26,492
57 10,191 13,463 18,768 21,742 25,561
58 9,383 12,609 16,925 19,580 22,976
59 8,576 11,758 15,078 17,410 20,382
60 7,774 10,916 13,226 15,245 17,794
61 6,962 10,063 11,383 13,080 15,202
62 6,156 9,218 9,531 10,916 12,609
63 5,732 9,152 9,409 10,507 11,869
64 5,317 8,576 9,276 10,106 11,134
65 4,884 7,558 9,152 9,701 10,381
66 4,461 6,541 8,194 9,299 9,640
67 and over | 3,082 4,245 5,204 5,837 7,537




Part B

Age of disabled person on their last birthday | Payment £
before their death

37 and under 45,522
38 44,543
39 43,566
40 42,590
41 41,614
42 40,637
43 39,703
44 38,760
45 37,832
46 36,898
47 35,966
48 34,819
49 33,670
50 32,526
51 31,383
52 30,238
53 29,298
54 28,367
55 27,433
56 26,492
57 25,561
58 22,976
59 20,382
60 17,794
61 15,202
62 12,609
63 11,869
64 11,134
65 10,381
66 9,640
67 and over 7,537”.

Signed by authority of the Secretary of State for Work and Pensions
Penny Mordaunt
Minister of State
16th March 2017 Department for Work and Pensions

EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Regulations)

Under the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) Act 1979 (c. 41) (“the Act”) lump sum
payments may be made to certain persons disabled by a disease to which the Act applies, or to
dependants of persons who were so disabled before they died. The diseases to which the Act
applies are pneumoconiosis, byssinosis, diffuse mesothelioma, primary carcinoma of the lung
(where accompanied by asbestosis or diffuse pleural thickening) and diffuse pleural thickening.

These Regulations amend the Pneumoconiosis etc. (Workers’ Compensation) (Payment of Claims)
Regulations 1988 (S.I. 1988/668) (“the 1988 Regulations™). The amendments made by regulation



2 have the effect of increasing the amounts payable under the 1988 Regulations. The increase in
each case is 1 per cent rounded up or down to the nearest £1 as appropriate.

By virtue of regulation 1(2), the amendments made by these Regulations apply only in relation to
any case in which a person first fulfils the conditions of entitlement to a payment under the Act on
or after 1st April 2017.

A full impact assessment has not been published for this instrument as it has no impact on the
private sector or civil society organisations.

© Crown copyright 2017

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.






ISBN 978-0-11-115699-5

£6.00
UK201703177 03/2017 19585

htp://www.legislation.gov. uk/id/uksi/2017/442 91780111"156995




