
Status:  This is the original version (as it was originally made). This
item of legislation is currently only available in its original format.

STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2023 No. 1235

The Representation of the People (Variation
of Election Expenses, Expenditure Limits
and Donation etc. Thresholds) Order 2023

Variation of limits on campaign expenditure

3. In Schedule 9 to PPERA (limits on campaign expenditure)—
(a) in paragraph 3 (parliamentary general elections)—

(i) in sub-paragraph (2)(a), for “£30,000” substitute “£54,010”;
(ii) in sub-paragraph (3)—

(aa) in paragraph (a), for “£810,000” substitute “£1,458,440”;
(bb) in paragraph (b), for “£120,000” substitute “£216,060”;
(cc) in paragraph (c), for “£60,000” substitute “£108,030”;

(iii) in sub-paragraph (4), for “£30,000” substitute “£54,010”;
(b) in paragraph 7 (general elections to Northern Ireland Assembly), in sub-paragraph (2), for

“£17,000” substitute “£30,600”.


